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|[ WEATHER 
If I were a Mohammedan, I 

could not write this weather col­
umn. People of that faith never 
make remarks about atmospheric 
conditions or about weather, lest 
they appear to criticize Allah's ar­
rangements. So you see there is 
something good about Mohamme­
danism. 

* * * * 
« The Navajo Indians have spec­

ial rain-making ceremonies. The 
government has been trying to 
discourage that sort of thing. Re­
cently the Navajo country in the 
southwest was badly parched. The 
Indians held a rain dance and cere­
mony. It was followed by heavy 
rains. It may have been just a hap­
pen-so but those Navajoes are cer­
tain the Great Spirit answered 
their prayer. 

* * * * 
Central Illinois has been stewing 

this week. In previous hot days, 
it baked. Then came the heavy 
rains and that has done away with 
baking and we are all in a stew 
now. The corn continues to look 
good. The rains have been benefi­
cial in other ways. But we need 
many more. 

Way up in northern Wisconsin 
we were told that the Century of 
Progress was suffering because of 
Illinois droughts. "Illinois people 
being close by, were expected to 
swell attendance this year. The 
drought disheartened them and 
kept them home." Maybe so. 

* * * * 
If the wind would only get into 

the southwest we'd have some rain 
a fellow told us recently. I t has 
been in the southwest now for a 
few days, and on this Thursday af­
ternoon clouds are gathering in 
the sky. 

* * * * 
There has been a real nice crop 

of mosquitoes lately. We some­
times wonder whether mosquitoes 
learn to sing or whether it just 
come natural. If some fellow could 
invent a mosquito that did not sing 
he would take a lot of misery out 
of life but the bumps would re­
main. 

* * » *> 
Every year you hear that farm­

ers are going to quite raising 
wheat. Then along comes the wheat 
harvest and a nice crop bringing 
ready money in the midsummer, 
and they relent and say "dern the 
chBftehtWgs; wheat don't bring 'em" 
and tney sow as much wheat as 
•ever. That's sensible farming. 

This is not weather, but we 
wanted to tell you—Mae West 
weighs only 116 pounds. 

* * * » 
In Austria the other day they 

killed Engelbert Dollfuss, the 
country's ablest man. European 
war is coming closer. We believe 
there is one way to avert war—an 
international state. Such a state 
would make possible that crazy 
men like Hitler, Mussolini, Stalin, 
and other brainy nitwits could be 
confined and made helpless instead 
of giving them power to rule. We 
believe all of these warloards are 
.crack-brained. They are crazy, but 
the world is afraid to take them in 
charge. Each little country has its 
own madhouse—an international 
state could have an international 
madhouse. 

* * * * 
It is just too bad that the trial 

of Carnine vs. Sullivan was stop­
ped because of some technicality. 
Counseler Wolf had witnesses pres­
ent to prove that the bacterial con­
tent of the delicious waters of Asa 
Creek was such as to make it ad­
visable to build a Spa or health re­
sort on its banks. The way to rem­
edy Sullivan's outrageous sewer 
problem is not through damage 
suits, but through an appeal to the 
State Board of Health. 

We may not know what good wa­
ter is here in Sullivan. We may be 
like the dairyman who quit skim­
ming his milk before delivering it 
to his customers. They quit him. 
Said they wanted white milk, and 
did not like milk with a yellow 
scum (sream) on top of it. 

* * * * 
Did you know that here in Sul­

livan we live in a weather that has 
a range of about 130 degrees. In 
winter it sometimes goes to 20 be­
low and in summer to ten above. 
In winter we accumulate fat and 
lazy bones . In summer we boil it 
out. Then along comes winter 
again, and so on ad infinitum un­
til the sexton throws dust in our 
faces. 

* * * * 
When your body sweats millions I 

of pores are on the job. When a' 
few million parts of your body 
work, can you keep from getting 
tired? I 

* » * m 

When it is good and hot—that's 
the time to play golf. You'll find 
real golfers on the course no mat­
ter what the sun says. They get so 
interested or so peeved that they 
pay no attention to the weather. 
You don't hear of heat prostra­
tions on a golf course. The addicts 
have other things on their minds. 
King George of England used to 
play golf. He quite. The Prince 
of Wales asked him why: "Well, 
son it got me too damn mad" said 
the truthful king — the dern quit­
t e r ! 

THE SULLIVAN PROGRESS 
ED C. BRANDENBURGER, PUBLISHER SULLIVAN, ILLINOIS, FRIDAY, JULY 27, 1934 78TH YEAR NO. 3 * 

Vacation Bible 
School Closes; 88 

Were Enrolled 
Program Given at Church of God 

Friday Night. Teachers Explain 
Scope of Work Which wa» Done 

The Vacation Bible School which 
has been in progress for the past 
two weeks at the Church of God, 
closed Friday, July 20. A total of 
88 pupils attended the sessions. A 
program of songs, memory work, 
pantomime and dramatization oi 
Bible stories was given Friday 
night and was well attended by 
the parents. 

Shoi-t talks were given by the 
teachers, explaining their various 
program of activity. 

The following pupils were en­
rolled : 

Cradle Roll—Donald Dean Cas-
tang, Betty Rose Pedigo, Patty 
Lue Clapp, Ceora Fortner. 

Beginners: Ellen Marie Logsden 
Jackie Adams, Georgia Lee Risley, 
Isabelle Augustine, Dean Wood­
ruff, Betty Guthrie, Barbara Stev­
ens, Norman Thompson, Leroy 
Yates, Junior Murrell, Betty Col-
lard, Helen Dennis, Paul Castang, 
Mike Jackson, Ruth Jackson, Leah 
Woodruff. 

Primary 1—May Zimmer, Bobby 
Algood, David Castang, Viva Fort­
ner, Betty Thompson, Richard 
Booker, Wayne Butler, Helen 
Jones, June Collard, Bonnie Pedi­
go, Floetta Reynolds, Patsy Ruth 
Kennedy, Mary Dennis, Patsy 
Logsden, Frances West, Billy 
Grieve, Helen Wells, Ilene Risley. 

Primary II—Junior Spencer 
Peggy Jones, Betty Dennis, Lucy 
Ann Adams, Paul Augustine, Hen­
rietta Dennis, Charlotte Woodruff. 
Alfretta Courtright, Norma Jean 
Fitzpatrick. 

Junior and Intermediate Girls— 
Lillian Condo, Betty Queary, Mar­
garet Woodruff, Wanda Courtright 
Prietta Steele, Sylva Wells, Eloise 
Marquis, Myrtle Arterburn, Vel-
ma Varner, Mary June Baucom, 
Alta May Wacaser, Wilma Hender­
son, Ina Vandeveer, Nannie Con­
don, Martha Baker, Marjorie 
Spencer, Juanita Hutson, Marie 
Whitzel, Olive Risley, Imogene and 
Margaret Weaver. 

Junior and Intermediate Boys— 
Dean Ringo, Bobby Callahan, Mar­
vin Kenney, Elwood Aldridge. 
Harris Aldridge, Edward Arter­
burn, Paul Risley, Henry Risley: 
Andon Davis, Phillip Jackson, Don 
Pedigo, Billy Algood, Hugh Dale 
Henderson, Albert Jackson, Gene 
Adams, Leon Cook, Dean Jones. 
Walter Mayberry, Jimmie and Dick 
Yates. 

Two Mutuals will 
Go Out of Business 

Two mutual insurance compan­
ies will go out of business and be 
liquidated through the hands of a 
receiver. Decrees to this effect 
were handed down by Judge Mil­
ler in the circuit court here this 
week. 

The companies are the New 
Douglas County Mutual, which had 
been managed by Jim Cummins; 
also the Moultrie County Mutual 
(the $500 company) management 

of which drifted into Decatur hands 
last fall. The last manager here 
was a man named Thiemann. 

The Sullivan Mutual Relief As­
sociation, of which S. T. Bolin is 
manager is not in any way affect­
ed by these actions. This company 
is in good condition and steadily 
enrolling new members. Its finan­
cial shape has never been better. It 
maintains an office above Coy's 
shoe store. 

The other two companies are re­
strained from doing any further 
business and receivers will be 
named to wind up their affairs. 

Legion Officials To 
Be Here August 1st 

On Wednesday, August 1st, at 
the hour of 2 p. m. state officers 
of the American Legion will be 
here at the local headquarters to 
consult with any veterans who may 
want advice on filing claims or re­
quests for help. 

Com. Seeks To 
Re-Open M.&F. 

Investigation 
Ask Supervisor* to Take Steps To­

ward Fixing Blame for Bank's 
Failure. Feel That Something 
Should Be Done. 

A depositors' committee of the 
closed Merchants & Farmers State 
bank appeared before the board of 
supervisors at Wednesday's meet­
ing and presented a petition. They 
did not discuss the petition but left 
it with the board. 

Asked what the petition was for, 
Walter Stricklan, one of the mem­
bers of the committee stated: "We 
asked that an an attorney be em­
ployed to further investigate mat­
ters pertaining to the closing of the 
bank. One member of the board as­
sured us that the petition had been 
referred to a committee for con­
sideration. This committee may 
employ an outside attorney to in­
vestigate. If the investigation dis­
closes the need for reopening this 
matter before the grand jury, the 
county may appropriate funds to 
pay for hiring a special posecutor 
to assist the states attorney. 

"We have never been entirely 
satisfied with the way in which 
this matter has been handled. That 
is why we ask for further investi­
gation." 

The other members of the com­
mittee with Mr. Stricklan, who 
were present at the board meeting 
were Ross Tucker, Curt Weger and 
Hugh Franklin. This committee has 
been on the job since shortly after 
the close of the bank and the men 
have given much of their time in 
behalf of the bank's depositors. 

Red Cross Starts 
Health Classes Here 
Red Cross classes in Health and 

Hygiene were started here Mon­
day. Miss Sarah Daily of Spring­
field, district nurse under the 
State Department of Health is in 
charge. 

The course of instruction will 
continue over a period of six 
weeks and those completing it will 
be given certificates. 

Twenty two appeared Monday 
afternoon for the first class and 
19 reported for the night class. 
These classes will be held regular­
ly on Mondays as that date seemed 
to be satisfactory to the majority 
of those who are taking the course. 

Playground Relief Projects Is Started; 
Forest Workers On Their Way To Camp 

(By Dortha W. Jensen) 
Approval of the Sullivan play 

ground project has been received 
by the Moultrie County Emergency 
Relief office, and playground su­
pervisors were assigned to start 
work July 25th. Miss Ruberta Luke 
is playground supervisor at Wy-
man park in Sullivan, and Miss 
Lenore Hoffman is playground su­
pervisor in Lovington. They will 
be at the playgrounds from nine to 
twelve o'clock every morning of 
the week except Sunday, and every 
afternoon except Saturday and 
Sunday from one o'clock to four-
thirty. They are planning particu­
larly to supervise the play of the 
younger children, and will also di­
rect the play of older children as 
needed. Parents are invited to talk 
to the playground supervisors to 
secure further information. 

CCC and Drought Relief 
Twenty-eight young men who 

filed applications for admission to 
Civilian Conservation Corps were 
notified to report on Wednesday 

Board Favors 
More Time For 
Tax Payments 

Supervisors Also Revise Booze 
Regulations and Issue Two Beer 
Licenses. Will Buy 160,000 Gal. 
Road Oil. 

morning, July 25th at the Armory 
in Sullivan for examination. Sev 
enteen of these were to go to camp 
at once. Alternates from Sullivan 
and Lovington Townships, as well 
as other boys who have applied re­
cently from those townships, will 
have an opportunity for admission 
under a drought relief quota which 
was assigned to communities of one 
thousand or over in counties in the 
drought area. Moultrie county's ad­
ditional quota under the drought 
area class, was fifteen boys, all of 
whom are to come from Sullivan 
and Lovington townships. 

Nothing New on Canning 
No word has yet been received 

regarding the canning project 
which was applied for some time 
ago, to enable relief clients and 
others to can their produce in tin 
cans with pressure cookers. It is 
hoped that this project can be put 
in operation soon, because corn; 
beans, beets and other gai'den 

(Please Turn to Page 8) 

Rhodes Reunion In 
Wyman Park Aug. 19 

"Uncle Billy" Rhodes the grand 
patriarch of the Rhodes clan of 
this part of the country, called at 
the Progress office Wednesday 
morning to inform us that the an­
nual Rhodes reunion and fainily 
picnic will be held Sunday, August 
12th in Wyman park. This is one 
of the year's big reunions and four 
generations of Rhodes are usually 
present to renew acquaintance 
see the new babies and teU the old­
er folks how youthful and well they 
look. 

Seventeen Selected 
For Forest Army 

CCC camps for boys are popu­
lar. At each call a larger number 
of application are received. Moul­
trie's quota in the recent call was 
17. There were 44 applications. 
Examinations were held at the Ar­
mory Wednesday and the seven­
teen selected were sent On to camp 

There who went are Irwin Mor-
an, Homer Wheeler, William Har-
chous and Elmer Shumbarger of 
Allenville; Everett Keyes and Har­
old Martin of Jonathan Creek: 
Donald Cheever and Donald Men-
zel of Lovington; Karl Mentzer 
and Irwin Yoder of Arthur; Cecil 
Drake and Wilbur Hilliard of Beth­
any; Emery Butler and Delbert 
Wade of Whitley township; San-
ford Fultz, John Lynn and Ross 
Meades of Sullivan township. 

Mrs. Jensen, relief director re­
ports that some of the other appli­
cants from Lovington and Sullivan 
may be used on the drought relief 
quota. Examination for this pur­
pose will be held later. 

THEY'RE OFF! 

The supervisors met Wednesday, 
passed two resolutions and trans­
acted routine business. 

One resolution, addressed to the 
Illinois Tax Commission asks that 
the delinquent date of tax pay­
ments be extended from August 
1st to October 1st. This is asked 
because of scarcity of money, due 
to drought and other causes. 

The second resolution is supple­
mentary to one adopted some time 
ago and sets license fees and re­
quirements for selling beer and 
hard liquor in the county, outside 
the corporate limit of cities and 
towns. 

The county beer license is $25 
per year; hard liquor license $500. 
Beer may be sold on Sundays but 
liquor may not. Food must be for 
sale on premises where beer and 
intoxicants are sold. Sanitary toil-
'ets must be provided. Bond to be 
given by beer seller is $500; for 
liquor seller $1000. 

The board then granted Wayne 
Conard a beer .license to sell at the 
roadhouse, at the intersection west 
of this city. M. M. Garrett was 
granted a beer license for his place 
at Dunn Station. 

The board voted to buy 160,000 
gallons of road oil to be applied to 
state aid roads in the county and 
to be paid out of the county high­
way tax. 

Mrs. Dortha Jensen, county re­
lief director appeared before the 
board to repoi't the activities of her 
office. The board voted to allow 
John Johnson, county garden su­
pervisor, $25.00 for rental of his 
hot beds during the time when he 
was raising plants for the relief 
gardens. He had furnished 68,000 
plants. 

It was also voted to pay burial 
expenses up to the amount of $60 
for blind pensioners if not suffi­
cient estate was left to meet the 
bill. 

New And Higher 
Shoe Factory Wages 

The Brown Shoe Company 
has increased wages of its em­
ployes in the local factory. The 
increases have long been under 
consideration. 

Work is nearly all done on a 
piece work basis. On some items 
of work the wage increase 
amounts to as much as 50 per 
cent or more. 

Because of this increase, 
there have been some lay-offs 
and some changes. It is hoped 
the lay-offs will be but tempor­
ary until all re-adjustments are 
made. In some departments the 
factory had more operators than 
are needed at this time. 

Barclay-Noffke 
Marriage Friday 

Richai'd Barclay and Miss Lucille 
Noffke were united in marriage on 
Friday evening, July 20th in Stras* 
burg. The ceremony was perform­
ed by Rev. G. A. Schimmell at the 
Lutheran parsonage. The attend­
ants were Mr. and Mrs. Wallace 
Graven, Jr., of this city. 

The groom is a son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Barclay of this city. 
Since graduating from high school 
last spring, he has been employed 
in his father's business, the Moul­
trie county hatchery and general 
store in this city. 

The bride is a daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Martin Noffke, who reside 
on Route 32, north of Windsor. 
She is a graduate of the Windsor 
high school. 

Mr. and Mrs. Barclay have tak­
en a suite in the Jennings proper-
tv on South Main street. 

Wheat Men Elect 
Shuman Chairman 

A meeting of Moultrie county 
contract wheat growers were held 
at the Farm Bureau office Tuesday 
afternoon. The counties of Moul­
trie, Douglas and Coles are in one 
district on this project. 

Charles Shuman was re-elected 
as Moultrie county's chairman on 
the board and Ross Daily and 
Guy Bolin were elected as vice 
chairmen. 

Carnine Damage 
Case Against 
City Dismissed 

After Court Started Hearing Evi 
dence It was Learned That Com 
plainant Did Not Own Damaged 
Land. 

Two Aged Members 
Masonic Home Die 

W. B. Kneedler left Wednesday 
morning with three of his race 
horses in a truck. The first destin­
ation was Chirago and from thence 
into Wisconsin. He will do his own 
race driving. 

Ollie Kidwell and Roland Maxe-
don accompanied him'^ and the 
horses to help keep them in goo* 
racing shape. 

H. H. Peaslie, former postmaster 
at Naperville, Illinois died at the 
Masonic Home Tuesday morning 
at the age of 87 years 11 months 
and a day. He had been at the 
Home five years. The remains were 
taken to Naperville for burial. 

Frank H. Hyndman, 65 years, 5 
months and 5 days of age died on 
Wednesday morning. He had been 
at the home four years. The re­
mains were taken to Godfrey, Illi­
nois for burial. 

Bethany Will Get 
Its Waterworks 

(Special) By Jim Scott—Beth­
any will get its new waterworks. 
Word reached our town this morn­
ing that the government has final­
ly approved the application for a 
PWA loan. When *tir ted this pro­
ject w i gnre about 80 men work 
for several -mamOa^ 

Farmers Plan for 
Picnic Here Aug. 29 
Moultrie county bureau farmers 

and their families and friends will 
have a big picnic and 4-H show in 
Wyman park on Wednesday, Aug­
ust 29th, according to announce­
ment made by J. L. Stormont, farm 
adviser. 

According to tentative plans 
the 4-H show and program will 
take place in the morning and the 
afternoon will be given over to an 
old-time picnic with games and 
a general good time for all. There 
will, of course, be a big basket din­
ner at the noon hour. 

The general picnic committee 
consists of John Albright, J. W. 
Rauch, Charles Shuman and J. L. 
Stormont. 

The 4-H show committee on rules 
and prizes consists of W. K. Bolin, 
Harris Bone and L. D. Graham 
Mr. Graham is the Lovington vo­
cational ag instructor. 

On the finance committee for the 
day are Oral Dolan, Charles Shu­
man and Merril Miller. 

It is planned to have a speaker 
of national renown on the after­
noon program. Secretary Wallace 
may not be able to come but it will 
be some one equally important. 

The case of Dolan Carnine 
against the city of Sullivan came 
to a sudden halt in the circuit court 
Tuesday. Non-suit was taken by 
the plaintiff and case was dismiss­
ed at his costs. 

The reason for this action was 
that it was found that Mr. Carnine 
was not the owner of the property 
which he claimed the city dam­
aged. 

Mr. Carnine lives in the ex­
treme southeastern part of Sulli­
van. In 1922 he bought a residence 
property and tract of ground there. 
Asa Creek runs through that tract. 

Sewer outlets from the city 
drain into Asa Creek at various 
points north of where the Carnine 
land is located. Mr. Carnine had 
sued city for $10,000 because of 
polluting the waters of the stream. 
The case has been pending for 
some time. 

Monday afternoon the case came 
up for trial before Judge Miller. 
Attorneys Ingram and White rep­
resented Mr. Carnine. City attor­
ney R. D. Meeker was assisted by 
Frank Wolf in defense. ! 

A jury was impanelled andj 
Tuesday morning was taken up in| 
taking evidence on Mr. Carnine's 
side of the case. Lon Grigsby, John 
Baker, Charles Getz, A. P. McCune 
Frank Fleming and Sam Shirey tes­
tified. 

The city had several bacterial 
experts from the local high.schools 
and from Decatur present to testi­
fy, in its behalf. In the preliminary 
skirmishes Mr. Wolf intimated that 
one line of defense would be that 
the city did not really own the 
sewer complained of but that it 
was owned by the people who used 
it. 

After the noon hour, the case 
was dismissed. It had been learned 
during the recess that Mr. Car-
nine had deeded the property to 
his wife, before bringing the suit 
and really had no grounds for the 
complaint. It has not been learned 
whether or not the suit will be re-
instituted in behalf of the real 
owner. 

The jury which had been impan­
elled to hear the case consisted of 
J. E. Watkins, Vern Campbell, 
Fred Foster, Melvin Zinkler, G. P. 
Bacon, Roy Rhodes, Marion Tra-
bue, Ray Waggoner, George Reed, 
Orville Oathout, Kenneth Johnson 
and Eugene Freese. 

Council Says 
City Wants No 
Gas Plant Loan 

Ask Government To Give $79,00* 
to Some Other Project; P I M S 
Made tor Remodelling Munici­
pal Light Plant. 

"Dear Uncle Sam: We do not 
want that $79,000, which you have 
set aside for us. Please give it to 
some other city." 

This in substance is the spirit of-
a resolution passed Monday night 
by the city council relative to the 
PWA loan which the government 
was ready to give Sullivan to build 
a butane gas plant and distributing 
system. 

The resolution sets forth that 
the city never did want this plant; 
that the work of promotion was 
done by a St. Louis engineering 
firm which has apparently lost in­
terest in the matter; that an elec­
tion would have to be held to let 
people vote on wheher or not they 
wanted the loan; that the senti­
ment here seemed so strong against 
the proposition, that holding an 
election would be but a foolish 
waste of money. 

Copies of the resolution wiU be 
forwarded to the proper authori­
ties by City Clerk J. E. Martin. 
Whether the engineers, who have 
spent a lot of time and money on 
this project, will protest the city's 
action remains to be seen. 

The council authorized an archi­
tect to make plans and drawing for 
remodelling the city's electric plant 
preparatory to installing addition­
al equipment. Bids are being ad­
vertised for. 

Nothing new has been learned 
about the city's drainage projects, 
plans for which are now with the 
state highway department in 
Springfield. These plans contem­
plate using the city's share of gas 
tax money to drain low places on 
the state routes that pass through 
here. 

ED KING IS DEAD 
Ed King who formerly conduct­

ed a restaurant on the East Side 
of the square, passed away at his 
home at Heyworth, near Blooming-
ton, Tuesday. 

WILLARD RAY AT FAIR 
Willard Ray of Bethany has se­

cured a job. as carpenter at the 
state fair grounds at Springfield. 

Democrats To Stage 
Opening Rallies 

The early preliminaries for the 
fall political campaign are now un­
der way. Shelby County Democrats 
will have a big blow-out Tuesday, 
July 31st. State candidates and 
officials are salted to be present 
and do the oi*ating. 

Friday, August 3rd the big 
Beardstown fish fry and rally will 
be held. This is complimentary to 
Senator William Dieterich, a resi­
d e d of that city. Senator James 
Hamilton Lewis will be the day's 
big speaking attraction. Moultrie i 
county Democrats plan to attend, j 

Champaign county Democrats i 
will meet August 4th at Shady Rest 
near White Heath and the Hon. 
Scott Lucas will propound Demo­
cratic principles to all and sundry 
who attend. 

Fred Buxton Died 
Saturday Morning 

Fred Buxton, Jonathan Creek 
farmer, died at his home Saturday. 
He had been in ill health several 
years. 

Funeral services were held Sun­
day afternoon at the Jonathan 
Creek church with Rev. Hopper » 
charge. The burial was in Green-
hill cemetery. 

His six sons carried the remains 
to their last resting place. 

Mr. Buxton was born June 11, 
1864 at Bedford, Pennsylvania, a 
son of George W. and Eva A. Bux­
ton. The following year the fam­
ily moved to Illinois, settling near 
Sullivan. Of the six children in the 
family three brothers survive him: 
Charles Buxton of Pierson; Elmer 
Buxton of Lovington and J. W. 
Buxton of Des Moines. 

In 1891 Fred Buxton was united 
in marriage with Sofrona Ritchey. 
To this union six boys and one girl 
were born. All survive. The wife 
and mother died July 18. 1925. 

The children are J. E. Buxton 
of Raleigh, Calif.; J. D. Buxton, 
B. R. Buxton, G. W. Buxton and 
Edna, wife of Paul Jeffers of Sulli­
van; M. L. Buxton of Monticello 
and O. T. Buxton of Lovington. 

In Mr. Buxton's death, the Jona­
than Creek community suffers the 
loss of one who has for many years 
been prominent in its affairs. 

WATER ASSESSMENTS 

Paper Carriers Get 
Trip To Niagara 

As a reward for special service, 
the Decatur newspapers are send­
ing many boys on a trip to Niagara 
Falls. They leave Decatur Friday 
evening at 7 o'clock and will be 
back Monday. 

While away they will see Niag­
ara Falls and will also be taken 
over into Canada where they will 
be quartered at a hotel. 

Those who will go from here are 
Jack Matheson, Harold Murray, 
Lewis Rudy, Floyd Banes, Freder­
ick Bieber, Billy Aulmbaugh: 
Billy Janes, Joe David and Joe 
Miller. 

There will be a penalty on all 
special water assessments unpaid 
on August 1st. Payment can be 
made at city light office. I t . 

GOING TO FLORIDA 
Dr. and Mrs. George A. Roney 

plan to leave. Saturday on a vaca­
tion trip to Florida, 

VIRGIL RHODES DEAD 

Word was received at Bethany 
Thursday morning of the death of 
Virgil Rhodes, son of "Uncle Billy" 
Rhodes. He died in Milwaukee en 
Thursday morning at 8 o'clock. The 
remains are being shipped to Beth­
any. 
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Brethren, be not children in understanding; howbeit in 
malice be ye children, but in understanding be men.—Luke 

A man should never be ashamed to own that he has been 
in the wrong, which is but saying, in other words, that he is 
wiser today than he was yesterday.—Jonathan Swift. 

There are those who do not do all their duty; there are 
those who profess to do their duty; and there is a third class 
far better than the other two, that do their duty and a little 
more.—Andrew Carnegie. 

Friends 
Friends are essential if life is worth while. 
They help us over many a long rough mile. 
They lighten our load and boost us along, 
With a word of cheer or a bit of a song. 
Their kindness and love in times of despair 
Will soothe our hearts and banish our care. 
Then we can smile sincerely indeed, 
And be thankful we've had a friend in need. 

—Langford. 

The Future of Illinois Democracy. 
We see by the daily press that there is apt to be a new 

line-up in Illinois Democratic politics. Senator James Ham­
ilton Lewis may retire and Governor Horner is to be his suc­
cessor in the U. S. senate, unless Michael Igoe of Chicago 
can stop it. 

John C. Martin of Salem may be the next Democratic 
candidate for governor. Mr. Martin is now state treasurer 
and one of the most popular officials at Springfield. Edward 
J. Hughes of Chicago, now secretary of state, may be a can 
didate to succeed himself in office, or he may go after the 
governorship. 

The administration is not as popular as it would like to 
be. The downstate, never very much in favor of a Chicago 
governor, would hail with joy the opportunity of supporting 
Mr. Martin. The present governor may have done some ex 
cellent work in his office, but he lacks something — person­
ality, diplomacy or tact — to win the hearty support and af­
fection of the downstate Democrats. 

The state will go Democratic this fall. November 1936 
may tell another story. Under the wise and able leadership 
of state chairman Bruce Campbell, plans must now be made 
for 1936. Many things may happen between now and then— 
one of these things is a reorganization and a reawakening of 
the Republican party in the effort to attract back to its 
folds the million voters who left it in 1932. 

The voters downstate will not take kindly to a ticket 
over-loaded and top-heavy with Chicago office seekers. It is 
important that the Democrats give proper consideration to 
this fact. Ignoring it will result in political suicide. 

Prepare Against Water Famines. 
The government is planning to put into effect a forest­

ing program whereby trees will be planted on a north and 
south strip out west. This strip is to be 1000 miles in length 
and 100 miles in width. The purpose is to check dust storms 
and otherwise affect climatic conditions. 

The drought seems, however, to show the need of anoth­
er big government project — the building of immense reser­
voirs to conserve water supplies for use in time of drought. 

In Illinois today thousands of farmers are hauling wa­
ter to supplement the scanty well supply on their farms, Us­
ually there is a well somewhere close by, perhaps a school 
house well, that can be used in an emergency. There is al­
ways the dread of a water famine, however. 

Bellowing cattle are today dying in western states be­
cause of lack of water. In Illinois many cattle and other 
livestock are on water rations. Farmers wonder from day to 

*day just how long the precious fluid will continue to trickle 
-slowly into their wells. 

A farmer's wife in,southern Illinois told us this story 
last year: 

"In August our wells almost gave out. We used very 
•carefully what water we got out of them. We hauled some 
from the school house well. Then there came a day when the 
other farmers gofall the water in that school house well. 
Our wells seemed to have stopped their flow. We went to bed 
that night, to the sound of bellowing cattle, pleading in 
their dumb way for water. What to do the next day was a 
big problem. At 11 o'clock that night we heard the blessed 
«ound of thunder and shortly thereafter came the most wel­
come rain I have ever heard. It rained and rained. With a 
prayer of thanksgiving we sank into slumber. We awoke the 
next morning to a new world. Ponds were full, streams were 

i flowing and our water problem was temporarily solved." 
Building large water reservoirs to store the rains of win­

ter and spring would not only assure surface water supplies 
for the dry days of summer, but plenty of such reservoirs or 
lakes would tend to feed the underground well springs. 

We have drained nearly all sloughs; we have denuded 
our forests; we have established systems of drainage that 
take excess water away in a hurry — that is why wells go 

dry. We must look forward to other ways of conserving wa­
ter or one of these days we will have a heart-breaking wa­
ter famine. 

Millions Unemployed; Employed Strike. 
Strange as it may seem, it is not the unemployed who 

cause trouble in this country, but the employed. 
It would seem logical that the 8,000,000 unemployed 

would get impatient and discouraged and cut loose once in 
a while in riots and bloodshed. Such is, however, not the 
case 

The recent disturbances on the west coast, in Minneap­
olis and elsewhere are caused by men who have employment 
or did have, until they voluntarily quit. 

Back of the trouble is the attempt of the American Fed­
eration of Labor to dictate the country's economic and in­
dustrial policies. The Federation is perhaps the best organ­
ized labor group in this country, but according to a writer 
in the Atlantic Monthly, it represents a relatively small por­
tion of the country's wage earners. 

Those who are always unfriendly to labor, would have 
you believe that Communists and Reds are responsible for 
the troubles, aiming at an overthrow of the capitalist sys­
tem in this country and substituting the Russian soviet sys 
tern therefor. 

There is plenty of bunk and misrepresentation in all of 
this mess. A radical and aggressive minority in any organi­
zation can gain the upper hand and that is what has been 
the case in these labor troubles. Conditions are ripe for hell-
raisers and they are on the job. 

Men walk out on jobs reluctantly because their radical 
leaders tell them to. Unemployed would gladly take the jobs 
but dare not. Racketeers and foreign agitators dominate the 
situation. 

But the fault is not always one-sided. Employers too are 
to blame. They have brought the trouble on themselves by 
refusal to listen to pleas of more conservative labor leaders. 

There are always two sides to a story. Labor conditions 
are dizzy. With unemployment so prevalent, the employed 
cause the trouble — the unemployed hope for better times 
and in the meantime let the government feed them. 

by Rev. Charles E. Dunn 

Micaiah Sueaks the Truth. 
Lesson for July 29th. 1 Kings 22. 
Golden Text: 1 Kings 2 2 : 14. 

A Crazy World And A Dillinger. 
Nothing tends to show up the low standard of our so 

called civilization, as does its morbid interest in crime and 
criminals. The big daily newspapers cater to this standard. 

This week a contest came to a close in Chicago. The 
contestants were the United States Government vs. John 
Dillinger, a half-wit. Of course, the government won. The 
contest had, however, aroused the sporting instinct of the 
people and Dillingers long evasion of the powerful forces 
ranged against him, aroused a hero-worship admiration in 
the hearts of America. He was the under-dog in an uneven 
contest. His cold-blooded murderous career was forgotten 
by many who expressed sympathy at his end. 

Now the dailies are smeared full of the life of the half­
wit crook, his amatory adventures and pictures of the girls 
with whom he associated. Readers are lapping this stuff up 
avidly and greedily. It is the one topic of discussion among 
the children. 

In Chicago they are bidding for the clothes worn by the 
crook when killed. They are selling pieces of paper dipped 
in the blood where he fell; they are selling blood-stained 
handkerchiefs said to have been in his possession. They are 
wanting to buy the bricks which were stained by the blood 
of his death. 

These commercial ventures are not as crazy as you 
might suspect. The men who are bidding know that a gull­
ible public will pay good money to see these gangster relics. 
If the body of Dillinger could be embalmed and exhibited at 
the Century of Progress, it would be the most popular at­
traction there. Or if it could be cut up and the pieces in­
closed in bottles filled with preservatives, such souvenirs 
would sell at a big price. If the government would under­
take such a venture it might realize millions. 

There is something wrong with America's mental atti­
tude toward crime. It glorifies the criminal. The metropoli­
tan press in its treatment of the Dillinger and similar cases 
is a daily correspondence course in crime. Phooey! 

This is a day of international 
conferences. It is the custom, in 
some quarters, to disparage such 
gatherings because they seem to 
accomplish so little. It must be re 
membered, however, that the very 
fact that nations assemble for pur­
poses of consultation is, in itself 
a great gain. And the more they 
get together the more the technic 
of their negotiations is improved 

Now the lesson admits us into 
the presence of two ancient mon 
archs engaged in consultation 
Here we have an eai-ly example of 
international cooperation. It is all 
the more illuminating because the 
two men were opposites in char­
acter. One of them, Jehoshaphat, 
king of Judah, was a good ruler 
who carried out the religious re 
forms of his high-minded father 
Asa. The other was Ahab, one of 
the worst of the kings of Israel de­
spite his energy and courage. 

Was this alliance an evil? The 
apostles of isolation would answer 
"Yes! Samaria, with it corrupt 
court, was no place for a states­
man with the decent implses of 
Jehoshaphat." And they would con­
tinue, in the same strain, to argue 
against the entrance of the United 
States into the World Court or the 
League of Nations. 

It seems clear, however, that the 
agreement between the two king­
doms was fundamentally a good 
It certainly ended the long hostil 
ity between them. To be sure, the 
joint military adventure against 
Syria came to a sad ending at the 
battle of Ramoth-gilead. The can­
did Micaiah spoke the blunt truth 
in foretelling this disaster to the 
allied armies. In contrast to A-
hab's lying prophets Micaiah is re 
freshing in his honest proclamation 
of doom. But the loss of a battle 
does not invalidate the principle of 
united effort. Uncle Sam rightful­
ly placed his tremendous resources 
at the disposal of the Allies in 
1917 even though he thereby con­
tracted the worst head-ache he has 
ever had. We must learn to be in 
ternationally-minded despite every 
risk. 

J Hints for the Home j 

by Nancy Hart 

Heavy aluminum frying pans or 
griddles will clean up most easily 
by placing them over a hot flame. 
Grease or burns and the worst 
stains will come off and the pans 
will clean up brightly. 

» * • 

An easy way to polish windows 
is to rub them with a chamois 
dipped in a full strength or strong 
solution of rubbing alcohol. 

» * * 
A decidedly attractive way of 

preparing baked potatoes is to re­
move them from the shell after 
cooking, mash them with butter, 
salt and pepper and a well-beaten 
yolk of an egg. Then replace them 
in the half-shells and brown them 
in the oven. They taste better, and 
they're much more easily handled 
at the table. 

m • » 

When roasting lamb or beef, 
shake a pinch of cinnamon on the 
bottom of the oven before putting 
the meat in and allow it to remain 
while the meat is cooking. You 
avoid the heavy odor of the oven 
usually associated with cooking 
either of these two meats. 

» » • 
Save time and trouble in wash­

ing a stack of dishes by passing 
each dish under the hot water fau­
cet before regular washing. The 
worst of the grease goes down the 
drain and the washing is much 

easier, requiring fewer changes of 
water. 

m m m 

Sticky, soiled leather on furni­
ture may be best cleaned by rub­
bing with a piece of cheesecloth 
moistened with banana oil and jfol 
lowing it up with a clean soft cloth 

18 Years Ago 
July 27, 1916 

Mrs. S. R. Harshman's oats yield 
was 81 bushels to the acre. 

Mr. and Mrs. Z. B. Whitfield 
were entertaining the super-excell­
ent crowd at a 10-day house party. 

A large bull snake was killed in 
the C & E I depot Tuesday. 

Wednesday the temperature was 
102. 

Misses Grace Bracken and Zora 
Kenney were traveling through 
Colorado. 

Edgar Bundy had delivered 2,-
000 bushels of corn. 

TEN YEARS AGO 
Joe Soper died Tuesday morn­

ing. 
. John Christy of Allenville died 

Saturday. 
Orville Sanner and Flossie Da­

vis of Bethany were married here 
Sunday. 

Mrs. Belle Kenny had opened a 
bakery on the east side of square. 

Harry Lawrence died Sunday in 
Terre Haute. 

Miss Aleen Lansden was sur­
prised Wednesday, the occasion 
being her 20th birthday. 

Spanish-American 
War 

Prior to the Spanish-American 
war, the Cuban people suffered 
greatly from the savage manner 
by which Spain attempted to put 
down the Cuban Rebellion. There 
was serious objection by the Amer 
icah people to this treatment and 
several incidents influenced by 
this sympathy, most important of 
which was the blowing up the U. 
S. S. Maine, resulted in declaration 
of war. 

After signal American victories 
on land and sea, Spain, with in­
adequate equipment and material, 
was hard pressed to carry on. The 
Spanish squadron under Admiral 
Cervera, took refuge in the har 
bor of Santiago. The American 
squadron under Admiral Schley 
sailed from Hampton Roads and 
after bottling thn Spanish squad­
ron in Sanitago Harbor was joined 
by the American squadron under 
Admiral Sampson who took com­
mand of the American fleet. 

In the meantime the American 
forces on land had practically sur­
rounded Santiago and were await­
ing the surrender of the city. On 
July 3, 1898, Admiral Sampson left 
the fleet on the U. S. S. New York 
to confer with the commander of 
the American land forces with the 
idea of planning a combined at­
tack on Santiago. Admiral Cervera 
realized his predicament and at­
tempted to run his squdron out of 
Santiago Harbor. Admiral Schley, 
temporarily commanding the Am­
erican Fleet, defeated this move 
with the loss of only one man and 
slight damage to his ships. Admir­
al Cervera lost the entire Spanish 
squadron. 

HOT WEATHER ADVICE 

A lot of human grief is brought 
about by trying to live up to some­
thing. You hear people holler 
about the heat, so you holler too. 
Having told people how uncomfort­
able the heat makes you, you try 
to live up to what you have said. 
You hear people say the heat keeps 
you awake too and join in the 
song of grief. Folks talk about the 
ills of old age and then must live 
up to their talk. 

One good piece of advice is this: 
(if we may presume to advise) 
Never talk about your ills. To 
make them interesting you must 
exaggerate; then, not to Seem like 
too much of a liar, you must live 
up to your exaggerations. The best 
cure for a whole lot of human ills 
is a closed mouth. 

Mother: "Remember, son that 
two heads are always better than 
one. 

Son—"No, they're not! There 
would be four ears to wash. 

We Don't Enow 
H. S. Butler 

Often when I read about 
Some criminal that dies, 

Some man whose life is taken 
Now in a graveyard lies: 

I wonder should we think too much 
About how mean he'd been, 

Or should we wonder why it was 
That he would so much sin. 

Short-comings that we all possess 
Are different as can be, 

So he who kills his fellow-man 
No crime in it may see: 

And tho we punish him by law 
His life, we even take, 

We do not know his line of thought 
Why trouble he would make. 

It's true our laws must be obeyed 
If Government's to last 

And mminals will be with us 
As they've been in the past: 

For up to now we've not found out 
The workings of the mind, 

Why one man would a killer be 
Another, always kind. 

Editorial Shorts 

We saw a pretty city the other 
day. Up on shores of Lake Michi­
gan is Manitowoc, about 6 times 
as big as Sullivan. 

At the entrance to this city are 
no junk piles, no pig pens, no old 
barns. Everything is spick and 
span—clean and inviting. Water 
from the bay is apparently plenti­
ful for all purposes for the the 
lawns seem to be sprinkled and cut 
to a nicety. There are no raggedy 
vacant lots; no accumulation of 
ashes and tin cans; no dusty and 
dirty streets. The green lawns are 
decorated with flower beds; houses 
are well kept. Manitowoc seems to 
be a town of people who are proud 
to be clean and without heralding 
cleanliness as a civic virtue, they 
cannot do otherwise than favor­
ably impress the stranger within 
its gates. 

Manitowoc evidently has a city 
council that enforces cleanliness 
without fear of offending the care­
less and the unclean. 

What a break it was for the sen­
sational gangster-hero, daily press, 
that on the night when John Dil­
linger was shot to death, three 
famous bandits escaped from the 
death house of the Texas state 
penitentiary! With DilMnger out of 
the way the correspondence course 
in crime, via the big city dailies. 
would have been sadly hampered 
for lack of material if Raymond 
Hamilton, Blackie Thompson anc" 
Joe Palmer had failed in their ef­
fort to gain their freedom. Right 
soon now, we'll expect to see a de­
tailed heroic sob-serial in our fa­
vorite Chicago daily, telling of the 
life and deeds of Dillinger, the son 
of a Quaker. 

One of the peculiar freaks of na­
ture is that when a storm comes 
after a spell of very hot weather, 
it sends down a shower of devas­
tating ice. Ain't nature grand?— 
terrific rays of sunshine one min­
ute and then terrific showers of 
hail. 

If bathing suits are all O. K. for 
public bathing; if shorts for girls 
are all right for cycling, what in 
the world is wrong with such at­
tire for office or kitchen wear? Do 
you remember back about 40 year3 
ago when grandmother thought she 
was not decently clothed in public, 
in hottest summer weather, unless 
she wore a long basque and a black 
skirt that swept the side walk as 
she trod her way in dignity? How 
many underskirts and other things 
she wore, deponent saith not. And 
you seldom heard of her being 
overcome by the heat. I'ts all in a 
state of mind. 

r J Brandu Sauce i 

City streets are now growing up 
in weeds. In some cases owners of 
adjoining property are to blame: 
usually when people are appealed 
to keep their sidewalks clean of 
weeds, they point to the city's weed 
grown streets. The city is the 
worst offender against cleanliness. 
The reason, of course, is that we 
have no money in our street and 
alley fund. Two men, with a mow­
er, attached to our caterpillar 
tractor, could greatly improve the 
looks of Sullivan in two days time. 
That would not cost much. 

POOR COUNTRY EDITOR 

The paper received this letter: 
"Please send a few copies of the 

paper containing the obituary of 
my aunt. Also, publish the enclos­
ed clipping of the marriage of my 
niece who lives in Lewiston. And 
I wash you would mention in your 
local column, if it doesn't cost any­
thing, that I have two bull calves 
for sale. As my subscription is out 
please stop the paper, as times are 
too hard to waste money on news­
papers."—Newville Star. 

PROVERBS OF NATIONS 

The sun is the king of torches. 
—Africa 

Success has many friends—Greek 
A small spark can start a great 

conflagration—Chinese. 
Don't throw away your old shoes 

until you have new ones.—-Dutch 
Speak little, speak truth, spend 

little, pay cash—German. 

"Golf" is a funny word. It orig­
inated in Scotland. A Scot who did 
not like to work- had a wife with a 
sharp tongue. 

He and some friends liked to loaf 
in a green field and knock a little 
ball around. Whenever the wife 
wanted some worn done, the Scot 
would beg off and she'd finally say, 
"All right, GO LOAF." By gener-
el contraction the term in time be­
came G'LOAF" and then the "OA" 
were dropped and out of all this 
came the word "GOLF." We do 
not vouch for the story, but believe 
it will stand muster. 

t X X 
The family lived in an upstairs 

apartment in a big city. In order 
to get a fresh drink they had to 
let the water run quite a while, or 
flush the toilet several times, to 
bring the colder water into the 
pipes. 

One day a dignified guest was 
present. He asked for a drink. "Go 
get the gentleman a glass of wa­
ter" the lady of the house told her 
little daughter. She did. 

"Are you sure the water is nice 
and cold?" the mother asked the 
child and the guest replied "Sure, 
she brought me a nice cold drink." 

"It ought to be nice and cold" 
the little miss replied, and added, 
"I flushed the toilet twice before I 
filled the glass." 

A peculiar sickly look came on 
the guest's face until the hostess 
had fully explained the matter. 

i n 
These fields that are blanketed 

with corn, plastered all over with 
mortgages and smothered with 
heat waves and sunshine may make 
good yet if they are covered occa­
sionally with refreshing showers. 

X X X 
Some one has truly said that: 

"It is NEWS if it causes a woman 
to say 'Well, for goodness sake' or 
a man involuntarily exclaims "Well 
I be damn." Get to a phone quick 
and tell it to our reporter. 

XX t 
The Nebraska Press remarks: 

"There is just one man who is act­
ually in a position to improve your 
business. You look him right in the 
eye every time you shave?' 

X X X 
Little June May came running to 

her grandmother holding a dry 
pressed leaf which was evidently 
a relic of days long ago. " I found 
it in" the big Bible, grandma," ex­
plained the child. "Do you s-pose 
it belonged to Eve?" 

—Pathfinder 
XX t 

"Didn't you see that sign that 
reads 'Slow down Here'?" Cons­
table Davis asked a motorist who 
had speeded through Lovington. 

"Oh" exclaimed the man, with a 
light of understanding dawning on 
him "did that mean driving? I 
though it told the condition of the 
town." 

X X X 
An old man from near Cooks 

Mills drove into Mattoon with his 
son the other day in an old batter­
ed Model T. He hadn't been to 
town for years and years. 

Getting out on Broadway, he 
thumped the sidewalk several times 
with his cane and then sauntered 
out into the street. He scraped his 
feet several times on the pavement 
and then turned to remark to his 
son': "Well, I don't blame 'em for 
building a town here. The ground 
is too all-fired hard to plow any­
way. "—Adapted. 

XXX 
They tell of the Sullivan bache­

lor who was in an auto wreck: 
"Whom shall we notify?" asked 
the man who pulled him out. 
"Have you a wife? Are you mar­
ried?" 

"Married?" asked the dazed 
man, "No sir, this is the first ac­
cident I've ever been in." 

XXX 
Do you remember back in 1919 

when farmhands were getting 
$4.75 a day for shucking wheat? 
One big complaint then was that 
the silk shirts they wore were so 
slick that it was a job to keep the 
pants up. 

X X X 
A man's character is something 

he can't dodge or get away from. 
XXX 

Bing Crosby is daddy of twins. 
Now let the big palooka do his 
crooning at home and quit tortur­
ing the air. 

XXX 
There are a lot of bad eggs in 

this town. We understand that a 
number of them are congregating 
in the alley back of the south side 
of the square. 

XX t 
With old roosters so cheap, folks 

can better afford to ask the preach­
er to dinner. Had you thought of 
that? 

XXX 
In defense of fiishermen let us 

say that all fisherman may lie, but 
not nearly all liars fish. 

XXX 
Excuse it please! The heat, you 

know! 
X X X 

Hell don't look so bad — after 
an Illinois summer. 

XXX 
Say girls, how do you keep 

makeup from getting sweat-streak­
ed? 
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IDe Saw Wisconsin's Lakes 
And Forests *• But Did Not Fish 

4 

When an edi tor takes a vacat ion 
t r ip , he is usually supposed to give 
a n account to his subscribers for 
t h e t ime t a k e n off his regula r job. 

T h a t is the only- excuse we offer 
fo r wha t follows. 

Mrs. B. and I went to Wisconsin 
and Michigan. 

W e did no t fish. 
The re were three reasons foi 

t h i s : we did not wan t to pay a 
year ' s license fee in Wisconsin for 
a few hours fishing; we had no 
t ack le ; we did not w a n t t o be ac­
cused of telling fish lies on our re­
t u rn . So tha t disposes of fishing. 

We did not go to look for John 
Dillinger. The reason is obvious. 
J o h n had not invited us. 

W e went to see wha t was to be 
s e e n — to rest up? and to get 
away from the office for a week. 
All of this we did. You'll admit 
f r e e l y — many have a l ready done 
so — t h a t The Progress last week 
was perhaps the best issue sent out 
in years . 

You business men who never 
t a k e vacations a re not n e a r as im­
p o r t a n t to your business as you 
th ink you a re . Get ou t and give 
the employes a chance. They'l l 
show you how the business really 
ought t o be run . 

Bu t t o proceed with t h e t r ip . W e 
left F r iday morning, drove nor th 
a n d in the af ternoon had a nice 
scenic drive a long the Rock river 
f rom Dixon to Rockford; then 
n o r t h in to Wisconsin where we 
passed th rough the tobacco coun­
t r y n e a r Stoughton, skir ted th rough 
the outskir ts of Madison, t he capi-
tol , and thence n o r t h t h rough 
Po r t age to a small b u r g named En­
deavor on the Fox river. We called 
i t a day with about 400 miles and 
bedded dwn the re to awai t the 
dawning. 

The Land O' Lakes 
Next day we headed s t ra ight 

n o r t h through Wausau , Stevens 
Po in t and some smaller cities and 
by and by found ourselves in the 
L a n d o' Lakes wi th lakes and rec­
reat ion places a t every tu rn ing . 
They call these tour is t places re­
sor ts , camps, lodges, etc. Nearly 
all promise good fishing, good eats , 
golfing and scenery. Along the 
r o u t e we saw one place advert ised 
more t han any o ther and being a 
firm believer in adver t is ing we 
drove to t h a t place on the shores 
of Big Lake St. Germain. I t was a 
swanky place, f requented by Chi­
cago folks — nice lake, fine pier , 
beaut iful beach and a swell lodge 
bui lding of th ree stories. We re­
mained the re from Sa tu rday until 
Monday af ternoon. 

Eagle River 
Found a nice golf course nearby. 

This place was about 25 miles 
from Eagle River, a busy and 
thr iv ing little city of over 1400 
people. Streets were crowded with 
tour is ts . Stores were busy and we 
saw about the busiest newspaper 
a n d pr in t shop in many a day. The 
newspaper is the only one in a 
large county. I t has a splendid 
equipment and Edi tor Fredr ich 
ge t s out an excellent weekly and 
does job pr in t ing wor thy of the 
bes t shop in Chicago. W e a t tended 
a Lu theran church the re Sunday 
morning . Nobody said " H o w d y " or 
"Goodbye ." 

Monday af ternoon we headed 
eas tward over very good roads. The 
soil in t h a t pa r t of Wisconsin is all 
sand and gravel. They cut this to 
a g rade , run it th rough a scarifier 
t o loosen it up to a depth of about 
t en inches. Then they soak it with 
a creosote mix ture and steam-roll­
e r i t down so t h a t it makes one of 
t h e best types o'f road we have ever 
rambled over. All a long the sides 
of these roads a re the wild cut-
o W r forests of the nor th land. 

On Crystal Lake 
After t ravel l ing about 75 miles 

Monday we found a dandy place to 
s tay. We got a furnished cottage 
on the eas tern shore of Crystal 
Lake n e a r a li t t le lumber town of 
Alaona. This camp was run by Mr. 
and Mrs. S. CournOyer, an aged 
French-American couple who were 
ve ry pleasant people to deal with 
The re was some dandy boat ing on 
t h e lake in the light of a new 

. m o o n t h a t hung dainti ly on the 
f r inge of the evergreens surround­
ing the lake on all sides. Mosqui-
tos? S u r e ! Bu t no more than we 
experience here a round home. 

Across the road from this place 
was a ve ry p re t t y golf course with 
beaut iful grass greens—50c for 18 
holes and 50c caddy fee. All that 
was lackirfr to make the day per­
fect was some of the old gang to 
help play. 

Alaona is typical of other lum­
ber cities in tha t pa r t of the coun­
t ry . A company owns it all. I t 
owns the mill, i t owns the houses 
the employes live i n ; it provides 
schools and other public buildings 
and in this town the company op­
era ted a store with about a dozen 
depar tments and about 20 em­
ployes. We saw other towns nimi-
la r to it on our t r ip . 

Into Michigan 
On Wednesday morn ing we left 

ou r camp headed east toward Es-
canaba on Green Bay. We passed 
th rough the iron mining count ry 
and had luncheon in the nice, clean 
city of Norway, Michigan. I ron 
mines are no t working and the 
count ry is depressed. Escanaba is a 
likeable sort of city with a fine 
ba th ing beach, good stores etc. Af­
t e r leaving here we followed a gra­
vel road down along Green Bay— 
t h e roughest road of the ent i re t r ip . 
W e passed th rough Menominee 
and Marinet te and found ourselves 
back in Wisconsin. We spent the 
night a t a cot tage in Peshtigo. 
close to an insane asy lum—but 
t h a t did no t mean any th ing special. 
This Peshtigo was no t much of a 
town b u t it had one g rea t b ig pa­
p e r mill. I t looked as if hundreds 
of acres of forests had been de­

nuded to provide the immense 
piles of pulp wood piled along the 
shores of the Peshtigo river. The 
mill employs about 400 and ha* 
been the town's salvation dur ing 
depression days. 

Thursday saw the end of the 
nor th land scenery as we headed 
south th rough Green Bay, Racine. 
Kenosha and Milwaukee and fin-
ised up t h a t night in Evans ton af­
t e r the beautiful r ide th rough the 
nor thern lake f ront suburbs. Fr i ­
day evening we came home. That 
drive was hot—nice and juicy ho t ! 

Tha t in a way sketches our t r ip . 
The Touris t Crop 

Now if you will pardon me, I'll 
go into detail about some of the 
things noted. The only real crop 
in nor thern Wisconsin is tour is ts . 
All lakes a re circled by tourist 
camps. Eve ry business effort is di­
rected toward tour is t accommoda­
t ion and exploitation. You can 
t ravel for miles and miles and nev­
er see a cult ivated acre. The land 
is all cut-over t imber land. Scrub­
by evergreens and birches cover 
the land with a cloak of forgiving 
beau ty because of the rape which 
the lumbermen have committed 
thereon . The white of the birch" 
contras ts artistically with the dark 
of t he evergreens . 

The g r e a t dread of the no r th is 
forest fires. Everywhere you see 
signs warn ing against carelessness 
with matches and camp fires. Oc­
casionally you pass forests where 
the fire demon a t some t ime or oth­
e r plied his d read work. Snaggy 
toothed pines and ba r r ens where 
underbrush should flourish tell the 
story. One warn ing reads " B e 
Careful. When forests burn , every 
body loses." 

Wisconsin Potatoes 
The big field crop, where the re 

a re any crops, is potatoes. I t is not 
unusual to see fields of t en and 
twen ty acres and we heard of one 
man who had a field of 300 acres 
nea r a town called Antigo. The po­
ta to fields were in bloom. The blos­
soms a re a beautiful whi te and 
crop prospects seem to be good, al: 
though t h a t pa r t of the count ry has 
not had as much rain as desired 
this summer. 

P a p e r mills and lumber yards 
use the c rop of the forests. Work 
is slack. Millions of feet of t>awed 
lumber a re piled up n e a r t he mills. 
We unders tand tha t they can only 
sell the i r year ly quota of lumber 
unde r the new code. 

We saw work of CCC camps and 
of t rans ients camps. These t rans i ­
ents a re used to clean up forests 
and pile up the fallen t imber and 
brush. At Hiles, Wis. is a camp of 
about 250 of these men. Tha t made 
business good, said the filling sta­
tion man, even though the lumber 
mills were shut down. 

About Rocks 
You cannot do full just ice to a 

descriptive sketch of Wisconsin 
and the Michigan penisula without 
wri t ing about rocks. 

. There a re rocks of all shapes 
and sizes from the t iniest gra in of 
sand up to real respectable sized 
boulders. Somewhere back in his­
tory the glacial morraines rolled 
and to r tu red these rocks in their 
ice-bound march southward anti) 
today you find rocks of all sizes, 
shapes and descriptions. We are 
not enough of a geologist t o classi­
fy them, but some do look like 
gran i te . 

When a Wisconsin fa rmer clears 
land, ge t t ing rid of the t r ees and 
brush is the easiest pa r t of the job. 
Then he gets busy ga ther ing up 
the rocks. If they a re too numer­
ous and the job seems too hopeless, 
he jus t makes pas tu re out of the 
land. In o ther places he ga thers 
them up and builds fences, saving 
the most uniform in size for foun­
dations and o ther buildings. Some­
times he has toe many for fences 
so he builds big rock piles out in 
the fields. We saw some covering 
as much as half acre and piled ten 
feet high. 

We saw some fields tha t looked 
like good cemetery plots. The 
monuments were already there . All 
needed was to bur row a hole under 
the half-buried boulders, bu ry the 
corpse undernea th and then chise* 
his name, age and good deeds on 
the marke r na tu re had al ready 
provided. 

Talk about rock gardens—most 
of nor thern Wisconsin is a rock 
garden, in its na tu ra l s ta te *md 
even in the s t reams the wa te r s 
gurgle a round the boulders t h a t a r e 
scat tered promiscuously in their 
bed. 

A s t range th ing about these 
rocky fields is t ha t you never find 
all the rocks, for as Kentuckians 
say "They j ist grow from yeah to 
yeah ." The freezes and thaws of 
the win te r br ing them to the sur­
face, bu t many folks think they 
consti tute a year ly growth. 

Fa rm improvements 
The impressing thi?i^r in southern 

Wisconsin and along the s tate '* 
eas tern agr icu l tura l district a r e the 
big barns . Usually the lower s tory 
is built of rock. The main floor is 
for g ranar ies and the hay mow 
with its ai'ched roof provides great 
spaces for s torage. Usually a silc 
or vtwo a r e connected u p with the 
barn and o ther outbuildings a re 
also spacious and kept in a good 
s ta te of repair . 

Besides potatoes the fa rmers 
rrrow oats and barley and lots of 
hay. Haying was going on while 
we were there . You see some buck­
wheat and we even saw a few 
fields of commercial poppies, some 
sweet clover, alfalfa and cabbages. 
There is some corn, bu t i t usually 
is drilled qui te thick and used for 
ensilage purposes. The Wisconsin 
fa rmers feed wha t they raise. 

Land O' Guernseys 
Tha t br ings us to Wisconsin'? 

main c ron—dai ry ing and cheese-
making. Wisconsin f a rmers a re 

p roud of the i r da i ry herds , Guern­
seys and Holsteins, wi th Guernseys 
apparen t ly predominat ing . " W h y 
don ' t you ra ise J e r s e y s ? " we asked 
a f a rmer from n e a r Yuba . "Too 
smal l ," said he "You don ' t get 
any th ing for a Je r sey calf when 
you sell it. Guernseys a r e j u s t as 
good in every w a y b u t have more 
size." He also spoke well of Hol­
steins. W e bragged about Moultive 
Je rseys b u t saw we were not mak­
ing any favorable impression. 

N</ar Milwaukee and Chicago 
you see big t ruck patches. Coming 
south from Chicago we saw fine 
c o m — s h o r t bu t vigorous. 

And .when we got home — we 
f o u n t / t h a t it had ra ined. Weeds in 
the garden were two feet high 
where the re had been no weeds the 
week before . 

But we were glad it had ra ined. 
Had we known t h a t ra in would r e ­
sult as p a r t of ou r vacat ion t r ip , 
we would have gone a month ago, 
or sooner. 

I t was nice to go away — it was 
nice to ge t back home. 

I t was really only a shor t 1500 
mile t r ip — r a t h e r insignificant 
and we feel like apologizing for 
wr i t ing an account of it, bu t we 
need some copy to fill this week 's 
paper — and though newspapers 
general ly might indignant ly deny 
the accusation, ye t i t is t he t r u t h 
t h a t t h a t is the only excuse for a 
lot of stuff tha t appears | n pr in t . 

Gays 
Mrs. Albert Hopper 

Miss Ella Fu l le r is visiting her 
cousin Dorothy Fu l le r a t Parad ise . 

Mrs. Marga re t Gammill has re­
tu rned home from a visit wi th her 
daugh te r Mrs. Alf Anderson in 
Mat toon. 

Miss Helen Ashcraf t has t aken a 
position as te lephone operator . She 
succeeds J o a n n a Storm who re­
signed recent ly . 

Word was received her of the 
serious illness of Mrs. Rober t 
Evans of Lerna . She is the wife 
of Rev. Evans , fo rmer M. E . pastor 
here . 

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Lowe and 
baby of Ind iana spent Sunday 
evening with Mr. and Mrs. Edgar 
Mitchell. 

Alea J a n e Purk i se r of Iowa is 
visiting Ruth Alexander and other 
relat ives here . 

Bus Wade who had an a t tack of 
appendicit is is slowly improving. 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Young, Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Gullion and Mrs. J . 
Askins of Mat toon, Mrs. J ames 
Ether idge of Windsor and Mrs. 
Edga r Mitchell spent Fr iday with 
Mrs. Newt Hopper . 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Alexander and 
family have r e tu rned to At lant ic . 
Iowa a f te r a few months visit with 
relat ives here . 

Mrs. Mabel Campbell and baby 
of Salem a re visiting her sister. 
Mrs. W. F . Gammill. 

Mrs. Ruth Cur ry of Decatur vis­
ited fr iends here last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. E lmer Bence of 
Windsor visited Fr iday af ternoon 
with her mother , Mrs. Lemons. 

METHODIST CHURCH 
• L. L. Lawrence, Pas to r 

W e a re very happy to have as 
our guest minis ter next Sunday, 
Rev. H a r r y A. Cochran, pas tor ot 
the F i rs t Methodist Episcopal 
church of Taylorville. Rev. Coch­
r an needs no introduct ion to Sulli­
van people as he was a Sullivan boy 
and is the son of J u d g e and Mrs. 
Oscar Cochran. Rev. Cochran be­
gan his minis t ry from this church 
no t m a n y years ago and has been 
very successful in his work. May 
we give him a cordial welcome. 

Services Sunday and the Week 
Sunday school 9:30 a. m. 
Our Sunday school continues to 

grow in spite of the warm weather . 
Our a t t endance last Sunday was 
th i r ty above a year ago. 

Morning worship 10:30 a. m.— 
Rev. Ha r ry Cochran, speaker 
Thur sday—Epwor th League at 

7:00 p. m. Paul Stone, president . 

Palmyra 
Mrs. A. A. Hollonbeck 

Homer Kirchhoff was a business 
caller here Thursday . 

Colleen Hollonbeck visited last 
week with Mrs. Grace Lehman. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Mar t in and 
Wilma and Ear l Rhodes went to 
Marshall Thursday . 

Mr. and Mrs. John Black and 
daugh te r Bet ty spent F r iday af­
t e rnoon with Mr. and Mrs. A. A. 
Hollonbeck. 

Mrs. Re ta Wilson and Mrs. W. 
S. Delana were Mattoon callers on 
Fr iday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Carnine of 
Mattoon visited Mr. and Mrs. Wal­
lace Stokes Sa tu rday . 

Rose Marie and J e a n Newlan of 
Deca tur spent Sa tu rday night with 
Rosemary and Paul ine Edwards . 

Miss Merle Basham is on sick 
list. 

Mrs. Mamie Jeffers and son 
spent t he week end with Mr. and 
Mrs. E . Howard. 

Mrs. Leo Carnine and daughter 
spent Monday with Mrs. Ray Dol-
an. 

Mr. and Mrs . Ansil Howard and 
family visited relat ives in this vi­
cinity Sunday. 

Mrs. Ka te Werns ing re tu rned 
home to stay wi th he r daughter , 
Mrs. Cloe Misenheimer a few days. 

Miss Mildred Underwood re tu rn ­
ed home Sunday a f te r a weeks vis­
it with J a n e McFadden near Stras-
burg . 

Mr. and Mrs . Pau l Edwards vis­
ited with Mrs. Iva Newton of De­
ca tu r a t the home of he r fa ther 
Willie Waggoner a t Bruce Sunday 
morning. 

Mrs. For res t Misenheimer was 
on sick list Tuesday and unable to 
work. 

Les Neighbors was a Sullivan 
caller Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clay England and 
family spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Hube r t Hampton . 

Mr. and Mrs. N. Hidden spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. A. A. 
Hollonbeck. 

Mr. and Mrs. J o h n F r a n t z and 
Mrs. Marie Wood spent Sunday af­
te rnoon with Mr. and Mrs. A. A. 
Hollonbeck. 

Mrs. Cloe Misenheimer is visit­
ing he r mother , Mrs. Ka te Wern­
sing who is sick. 

Mr. and Mrs. For res t Misen­
heimer and daugh te r spent Sun­
day evening with Mr. a n d Mrs . 
J a m e s Pierce. 

Mrs. Lawrence Carroll spent the 
week end with he r pa ren t s , Mr. 
and Mrs. W. S. Delana. Mrs. Reta 
Wilson and family were the re also. 

MOVING T O B E L L E V I L L E 

Dr. and Mrs. S. J . Lewis p lan to 
move to Belleville the ear ly p a r t 
of A u g u s t He is employed by the 
Pevely Dairy Co. 

CHURCH 
NOTES 

CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Church services will be held at 
St. Columba's Catholic church on 
Sunday morn ing at 8 a. m. 

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
Glenn M. Garber , Minister 

The services of this church a re 
planned to help all those who at­
tend them. You a re invited to wor­
ship at this church. 

Sunday, Ju ly 2 9 : 
9 :45—Sunday school. 
11 :00—The morn ing service. 

Based on the theme "F ind ing God 
in Worship ." 

6:15 Young People 's forum in 
the manse . 

g raded Bible School, and organized 
Young People 's society, a class for 
Systematic Bible Study and an 
aggressive intell igent evangelism. 
We ask all people believing in such 
a p rogram of Christ ian Endeavor 
to uni te with us in some of these 
activities. 

9:30 a. m. Bible school. 
6:00 p. m. P reach ing Service. 
7:00 p. m. B. Y. P . U. service. 

Tuesday 
7:00 p. m.—Musical work. 
8:00 p. m. P r a y e r meet ing . 

Fr iday 
7:30 p . m.—Bible Study. 

CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
C. E . Barne t t , Pas to r 

Floyd Hesler Heads 
Church Association 

BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. H. W. Ranes, Minister 

The Minister wishes to call at­
tent ion to the change of his ad­
dress. I t is 618 Gran t St reet . He 
will be happy to r ender any ser­
vice for anyone. t 

Honor ing Jesus Christ as Saviour 
and Lord calls for an adherency to 
the Word of God and its ent i re 
teaching. The Bapt is t Church is 
t ry ing to r ender a service tha t has 
no apology in it. There is aggres­
sive work being done in a proper ly 

All the r egu la r services of the 
church will be held Sunday. Sun­
day school a t 9:30 a. m. We shall 
apprecia te this hour toge ther in 
the continued s tudy of the Word. 

Morning and evening, 10:30 
and 7:30 respectively, the subjects 
"Highe r H u n g e r s " and " In the 
Midst" will he used in sermon 
thoughts by the pastor . 

" G r e a t Missionary Hymns and 
Thei r Chal lenge" is to be used as 
subject for s tudy in Endeavor at 
6:30 p. m. This is t he closing night 
of the "Four -Squa re Contes t" . The 
"Doughty Dons" won last Sunday 
evening, b u t the "Successful Seitz-
e r s " a r e leading in to ta l points to 
da te . The contest is so close, how­
ever, the re may yet be a change 
in favor of e i ther of the four sides. 
Every Endeavore r who can poss­
ibly do so must be 'On the Square ' 
Sunday evening. The final scores 
will be r*ead a t close of the meet­
ing. 

" O n e of the most useless things 
on ear th is a good intent ion tha t 
has never been made to get up and 
hust le for a l iving." Remember 
tha t intention to a t tend church. Go 
to church. 

The Moultr ie Association of 
Christian churches held i ts annua l 
all-day meet ing in the audi tor ium 
in the Lovington park Sunday. 

Rev. H. H. Pe te r s of Blooming-
ton was the main speaker. 

L. D. Seass, pres ident of t he 
association presided. A t the 
morning session he named a nom­
inat ing committee consisting of Al­
ber t Walker , Mrs. Milburn and 
George Wagahof t . 

A t the af ternoon session this 
committee repor ted and the follow 
ing officials for next year 's meet­
ing were elected: 

Pres ident—Floyd Hesler of Lov­
ington. 

Vice pres ident—Coy Brown of 
Bethany. 

Sec 'y-Treas .—Dr. Charles Mc­
Donald of Ar thu r . 

Chor is ter—Mrs. G. R. Fleming.. 
Sullivan. 

Pianists—Mrs. L. W. Gammill. 
The program a t the af ternoon 

session was in charge of the young 
people of the churches and Miss 
Alta Elder of this city presided. 
The program consisted of musical 
numbers and talks. 

Sunday ' s meet ing was the best 
a t tended in recent years , due to the 
un t i r ing efforts made by Pres ident 
Seass for more than a month pr ior 
to it in enlist ing the help of the 
churches. 

SULLIVAN CLUB G U E S T S 
Whitley - E a s t Nelson H. S. c lub 

en ter ta ined members of the Sul l i ­
van H. S. club to a pot luck d inne r 
a t the home of Mrs. Guy Christy on 
Ju ly 18. More than 130 persons, 
were present , the re being 67 mem­
bers from the Sullivan club. 

In the af ternoon a program was 
given consisting of songs, readings 
Violin, piano music, play and a 
talk by Miss Gladys W a r d of 
Champaign on "Shor t Cuts for t h e 
Homemaker . " 

— W e s Pat terson, who is very ill 
is showing no improvement. 

THE GOSPEL MISSION 
Over Post Office. 

9:30 a. m. Sunday school. 
7:30 p . m.—Evangel is t ic ser­

vices. 
7:30 p. m. Bible study or special 

services, Thursday . You a re al­
ways welcome here . 

Ps . 27:1 The Lord is my light 
and my salvat ion; whom shall I 
f e a r ? The Lord is the s t rength of 
my l i fe ; of whom shall I be a f ra id? 

If we have the Lord dwelling 
within our hear t , then we have Him 
who is bigger and s t ronger than 
any, or all possible enemies. 

" T h e Lord is my l ight ." We of­

ten say, 1 jus t don ' t know what to 
do, I am all in the dark about a 
cer ta in mat te r . Have you talked 
to the Lord about i t? We need not 
walk in the dark and uncer ta in ty . 
If the Lord is really our light, 
then we have every r ight to expect 
Him to give us light on those ma t ­
t e r s which t rouble us. If He is 
real ly our light, then He is really 
the s t rength of our life, and if He 
is all this to us, then I ask you, 
Wha t have you to f ea r? Have we 
any record where he ever failed 
one who pu t thei r t ru s t in Him? 
If there was one such record, then 
I would not t ru s t the Lord. There 
is much in our present t ime, in the 
na tura l , to cause fear, bu t we have 
the declarat ion tha t perfect love 
casteth out fear . We say, bu t I am 
so imperfect tha t I cannot have 
tha t perfect love, t rue , on our pa r t 
we cannot , bu t on His pa r t he can. 
Let the perfect love of Christ 
work through your life, it is then 
he becomes our light, salvation, 
s t rength and courage, and it is then 
we have nothing to fear. 

A NEW and unique plan of 
* * Life insurance (hat pecul­
iarly fits the present time was 
announced recently by The 
Travelers Insurance Company. 
It is interesting in several ways 
to both men and women. It is 
called the Hundred a Month 
plan. Every man who recog­
nizes his responsibility to his 
wife and children, and every 
woman who recognizes her 
responsibility to her children, 
will be interested in seeing 
how this plan helps them to 
meet their obligations. It fur­
nishes a means of discharging 
a duty which they might other­
wise be forced to neglect. 

Because Life insurance does 
these things for others, you 
should get in touch with us 
and let us advise you as to 
how you can meet these prob­
lems conveniently and safely. 
It's easy to find out about this 
Hundred a Month plan. A 
telephone inquiry to our office 
will bring full information— 
without charge. 

Nicholson & Wood 
Insurance, Real Es ta te , 

Abs t rac ts 
Phone 66 — Firs t Na­
tional Bank Building. 

SULLIVAN, ILL. 

PER QUART 

FOR THE FINEST 
4 

MOTOR OIL 
on the market 

I S 0 = V I S D STOPS COSTLY SLUDGE FORMATION 

If you pay more than 26c a quart today for motor oil you 

are simply throwing good money away. For that's the price 

of Iso=Vis "D"—Standard's premium motor oil. 

I t i s t h e m o s t a d v a n c e d d e v e l o p m e n t i n m o t o r l u b r i c a t i o n . . . 

f o r t h e p a t e n t e d P r o p a n e D e w a x i n g a n d C h l o r e x E x t r a c t i o n 

P r o c e s s h a v e g i v e n i t t h i s u n i q u e q u a l i t y : i t will not sludge 

under the hardest, hottest driving. Sludge causes stuck 

rings, one of the great causes of high oil consumption. 

In addition, Iso=Vis "D" does not thin out dangerously in 

contact with hot engine surfaces. 

Take a look at Iso=Vis "D" next time you stop in a Standard 

Oil Station. It is dispensed in glass bottles so that you can 

see the full measure of clear, clean, fine oil you are getting. 

You'll like its looks. You'll like its performance 

and you'll like its economy! . 

ISO = V I S " D " MOTOR OIL 25c a qt. 
PLUS FEDERAL TAX 1c o qt. 

TOTAL 2$C a qt. 
At all Standard Oil Stations and Dealers 

Sludge causes stuck piston 
rings and makes an engine 
pump oil. I t causes high oil 
consumption and is a great 
money-waster. ISO*VIS f ,D" 
will not sludge under hardest 
driving in hottest weather. 

STANDARD OIL SERVICE 
TWiw in—" Standard"M Lite Poumr PmradtT—KMOX—U.45—9:00 P. M. Tun.—Than.—Sat. 

LJicut&c to 

fSOVISD 
MctcA OiC. 
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SPEAKING OF SPORTS 
BY JIM SCOTT 

William Edward Dwyer, yclept 
^Gallopihg Bill" for his mode of 
carrying a football from place^ to 
place, is now at work on his "lu­
crative" position in Long Island.. 

N . Y. 
Bill's job is in a packing house, 

a position which he secured thru 
Miss Addie Wood, who is dietician 
in one of New York's largest hos­
pitals. 

Recently Bill invited his friend, 
Pete McDavid, to come join him 
in his work. Yes, it now appears 
unlikely that Sullivan's prancing 
half will return to Illinois this fall. 

— S O S — 
But William's high school team­

mate, industrious Elmer Dunscomb 
.is stringing along with the State 
University and will soon embark 
upon his sophomore year. 

Dune has been in Urbana all 
summer working at Kammerers' 

jpalatial confectionery. 

—s o s— 
The Bruce Sluggers were with­

out the services of Bill Kinsel last 
Sunday, the young fireballer hav­
ing left that morning for Webster 
City, Iowa, where he had been call­
ed for a Monday, morning pitching 
engagement. Forrest Misenheimer 
also made a trip there this spring 
*© it would seem that the Iowa city 
i s drawing on Bruce talent thru 
the recommendations of "Runt" 
Abbott, who formerly lived near 
there. 

Bill the Kinsel, like Bill the Dwy­
er, isn't at home anymore than is 
necessary and is planning this week 
to purchase a new Ford V-Eight for 
his sojourns. 

- S O S -
I t would not be exaggeration to 

state that the Bruce Sluggers in 
proportion to the village's popula­
tion play to larger crowds than any 
other nine in the state. 

Each Sunday both stands are 
nearly filled and new supporters 
are added with each passing week. 
Last Sunday we noticed a score of I 
Sullivan residents who were see­
ing their first semi-pro game in 
-several months or more. 

— S O S . -
I . Smith, Gebhart's little softball 

star who played centerfield and 
.pitched for the Junior Mechanics 
Sunday, is one of those players 
who fans can't seem to forbear 
-riding. His cockiness accentuated 
Iry a cherry red jersey he was none 
l i e less naive in his replies to the 
i ans. 

Like many other Decatur play­
ers Smith is under the impression 
that all spectators at a small town 
diamond are farmers and once 
tuned on the stands to advise his 
tormentors that their place was be­
hind a cow. Then after relieving 
Pitcher Paczak, he hastened a few 
more words to the gallery explain­
ing that this was his first attempt 
a t twirling. ' ' ';' 

•-•r-.-'S'O'S'1^ ••' '>•• 
A person/they •say, can be con­

spicuous by his absence- That then 
was the real news at Kinsel's Bowl 
Sunday, for Calvin Ritchie was 
among the absentees. 

— s o s _— 
The Bethany Merchants have re­

organized and will use strictly na­
tive material except at first base, 
where some gentleman from Deca­
t u r will hold forth. 

This Sunday they are tangling 
with the local Indees on their 
.home playground, one mile south 
-east of town on route 132. 

_^S 0 ;S r -
Ho hum, Dalton City, I hear, 

lost another game Sunday. 
— S O S — 

This is the way Bethany's re­
juvenated softball forces on Tues­
day night humiliated Sullivan's 
Seds before one of the largest 
crowds ever assembled on Bethany 
high school athletic field: 
Reds 001 300 066—16 
Bethany 534 808 OOx—28 

McPheeters, Dennis and Slover. 
Guthrie; Schlesinger, Marshall, 
Gibbons and Snow. 

_ S O S — 
Frankie Shack wasn't the draw­

ing card. It was a preliminary game 
in which the Bethany Bloomer girls 
became the first group of local la­

dies ever to go out of town for their 
athletic competition. They went up 
against the. Sullivan gals and went 

down again, 17 to 8. 
The novelty of the contest may 

have been the magnet for the 
throng or again it may have been 
the abbreviated costumes. 

— S O S — 
The Reds would have been vir­

tually annihilated but for a whimsi­
cal notion off the head of Lyman 
Manship. The Bethany manager 
thinks one Dale Marshall is a 
pitcher and with his boys out in 
front 28 to 4, Mr. Marshall was 
led out to display his wares. 

His offerings at once revived the 
Reds and they began picking up 
runs with great rapidity. And they 
might have overcome this huge 
lead had not George Gibbons res­
cued Mr. Marshall in the ninth. 

- S O S -
Grounders — The Chicago White 

Sox have released Catcher Dutch 
Fehring, all-around Purdue athlete 
to Dallas of the Texas league. . . 
West M. Rourke, Springfield's new 
postmaster, is the father of Bob 
Rourke, one of the best prospects 
on last fall's talented Illinois 
frosh eleven. . . It takes most 
batters longer, after hitting, to run 
the first 20 feet towards first than 
it does to cover the remaining 70 
feet. . . so many of our younger 
baseball fans persist in saying 
"ending" for "inning." . . . 

Eddie Unitis, hailed as one of 
the smartest quaterbacks ever to 
come out of Westfield, long an 
Eastern Illinois grid stronghold, is 
matriculating at Illinois this fall. . 
And Illinois college is to have 
Charles Lorch, the Springfield high 
luminary. . . Joe (Ducky Wucky) 
Medwick, who is doing more than 
his share in keeping the Cardinals 
in the National league pennant 
chase, is 23 years old, single and 
lives in Carteret, N. J. . . . 

Whitey Wistert, Michigan's 
great tackle, who is now with the 
Cincinnati Reds, has a younger 
brother, Alvin, who is scheduled 
to make his appearance on the 
Wolverine campus this fall. . . . 
Both boys weigh an even 212 lbs. 
and are said to be equally adept 
on the gridiron. . . Pirn Goff, 
State Normal's versatile athlete, 
has been sent to Clarksdale, Miss., 
for further seasoning. . . In his 
final contest with San Antonio of 
the Texas league, Pirn not only 
pitched a credible game, but aid­
ed along his own cause with a pair 
of safeties. . . 

Tex Carleton of the Cards was 
raised on a Texas ranch and ex­
pected to be a cowboy until he dis­
played a knack for hurling. . . . 
Bob Newman of Illinois Wesleyan, 
who has drawn more than a few 
votes as an end on the all-star col­
lege eleven, is under contract to 
the Chicago Cardinals and will 
half his autumn hours between this 
pro club and the University of 
Chicago, where he will be seeking 
his master's degree. . . 

Fritz Humbert, Illinois' crack 
fullback in '27, '28 and '29 is back 
in Urbana, performing with one 
of the city's kittenball teams. . . 
And Gil Berry, disillusioned in his 
quest for motion picture cash and 
fame, is also back in the Twin-
Cities and is hurling for a Cham­
paign softball club. . . Gil also 
serves as bouncer at the Robeson 
Roof Garden, and, when not oth­
erwise occupied, may be seen in 
light potation in one of the many 
beer taverns. . . 

Quite a letdown from the bright 
lights of Hollywood, but we think 
at that, Berry would rather live in 
Champaign—just so long as the 
lads don't start calling him Clark 
Gable. . . You know, of course, 
that Lawrence Blue derived his 
"Monte" sobriquet from the old 
screen star, Monte Blue, but did 
you know that Don Pearson did the 
christening? . . Pearson, a form­
er Sullivan high athlete, nicknam-. 
ed many persons hereabouts. . . . 

The Bill Bishop prominent in 
Decatur tennis circles is not the 
Bishop you and I are familiar with. 
Our Mr. Bishop, the Shelbyville 
coach, is now attending summer 
school at the University of Illinois. 
The other Mr. Bishop's thirst for 
alcoholic beverages has in times 
gone by, caused our Mr. Bishop 
many embarrasing moments. . . . 
One of our Mr. Bishop's athletes, 
Leo Stamper, is in Florida. . . . 

OLIVE EDEN MARTIN 
IN BOULDER HOSPITAL 

Miss Olive Eden Martin, former­
ly of this city, who has been at­
tending the U. of Colorado at 
Boulder this summer suffered a 
broken ankle in a fall in that city 
Friday. 

She was preparing for a return 
to Illinois and in coming down a 
stairs to take a taxi to the depot 
fell and suffered the injury. She 
will be laid up about six weeks, 
but may come to Illinois as soon as 
she can travel and enter a hospital 
here. She is an instructor in the 
LaSalle-Peru high schools. 

Jersey ville Bride 
For Martin Sheehan 
The marriage of Agnes Sanders 

and Martin Sheehan was performed 
at 6:30 Monday morning, July 23 
at the Cathedral of the Immacul­
ate Conception, Rev. J. J. Ma-
loney, officiating. 

Mrs. Sheehan is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. William Sanders of 
Jerseyville. She is the graduate of 
Jerseyville High school and Shurt-
leff College at Alton. 

Mr. Sheehan is the son of Mr 
and Mrs. T. F. Sheehan of Dalton 
City. He is the graduate of Dai-
ton City Community High School 
and Quincy college. 

The attendants were Miss Kath-
ryn Sheehan, sister of the groom 
and Mike Kinney. The bride was 
attired in black satin trimmed in 
white satin and carried white ros­
es. The bidesmaid wore brown 
Crepe and carried Talisman roses. 

The bride and groom are both 
employed in the Secretary of 
State's office, Corporation Depart­
ment. They have departed on a two 
weeks trip to Northern Wisconsin. 

Local News Items 

Local News 
—Mr. and Mrs. G. S. Thompson 

took their granddaughter, Lenore 
Eileen Magill to Springfield Sat­
urday after she had spent the 
week visiting at the Thompson 
home here. 

—The American Legion Auxili­
ary held a meeting Monday night 
at the home of Mrs. Ray Janes. 
Mrs. Ray Yeakel, Mrs. Mabel 
Nichols and Mrs. Janes were the 
hostesses. 

—Bob Martin and Miss Ruth Pi-
fer spent Sunday at the home of 
the latter's brother, Herschel 
White and family in Edwardsville. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Palmer 
visited with her brother V. L. Dial 
in Peoria Sunday. 

—Mr. and Mrs. J. N. Martin and 
family of Decatur are spending 
this week at the Walker club house 
near Allenville. 

—A number of members of the 
Legion Auxiliary went to Clinton 
Wednesday to attend a convention 
a t that place. 

-^-Mr. and Mrs. Henry Sona and 
Jack returned to their home Sun­
day after spending a week with 
relatives at Louisville. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Hal Sona spent 
a two weeks vacation at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Fred Sona in this 
city. They were accompanied by 

Mrs. Sona and daughter Helen, 
when they left Monday, and they 
will visit at Hammond for some­
time. 

—Mrs. Walter Bolin who was 
employed at Meeker Candy Kitchen 
is now at Waggoner cafe. 

—The Rebekah Sunshine club 
held its annual family picnic at 
Wyman park Friday evenin. A pic­
nic supper was served and this was 
followed by a social hour. 

—Mrs. Alice Boyce left Satur­
day for Lovington where she is 
staying at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. A. S. Bowers. 

—Mrs. Harry Shipman and Mrs. 
Harry Foster spent Tuesday in 
Mattoon. 

—Mrs. Elizabeth Hampton visit­
ed Tuesday with Rev. and Mrs. 
George Wilbur in Coles. 

—Mrs. B. C. Smith and son of 
Benton visited at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Pifer Monday. 

—Mary Lee Etna Pifer and 
Amanda Tichenor spent the week 
end in Shelbyville and Tuesday in 
Tuscola in connection with their 
4-H club work. 

—Mrs. Theodare Lovan and sis­
ter of Atlanta visited this week at 
the Henry Pifer home. 

—Mr. and Mrs. John Smith and 
son Glen of Benton visited his 
mother Mrs. Etna Smith at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Henry Pifer 
Monday. 

—Mrs. Lawrence Pierson and 
daughters Lois and Betty Rose vis­
ited several days last week with 
Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Elzy. 

—Mrs. Gladys Whitfield and son 
Jack left the early part of the 
week for Chicago. After spending 
a few days there they expected to 
go to Cleveland to visit Mr. and 
Mrs. John B. Miller. 

—Mr. and Mrs. A. H. Turner ac­
companied Mrs. Ralph R. Schuler 
and son of Chicago to Lincoln Fri­
day evening. Mrs. Schuleler is Mrs. 
Turner's sister. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Henry Van Ger-
pen and daughters Marion, Vir­
ginia, Jean and Dorothy of Harts-
burg spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. A. H. Turner. Marion and 
Virginia are spending the week in 
Sullivan. 

—Miss Coral Mclntire is home 
for a vacation from her work in 
Chicago. 

—Fred Booker is planning tc 
move a 5-room house to his lot 
north of 4iis home. He expects to 
put a basement under it and re­
model it to rent. 

—Glen Kilby visited Saturday 
and Sunday at the bedside of an 
uncle who is ill in Peoria hospital.' 

—Miss Lucile Mclntire, Miss 
Gertrude Pence and John Pence 
were Sunday afternoon visitors at 
the Charles Shuman home. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Reuben Bly-
stone and Grandma Blystone called 
on Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Cuffle and 
family of Coles Sunday afternoon. 

—Arkell Craig visited at the 
home of his brother at Hord and 
visited his grandparents Mr. and 
Mi's. Colclasure of Iola over the 
week end. 

—Miss Menrietta McClure of 
Arthur visited at the home of her 
sister, Mrs. Violet Blystone over 
the week end. 

—Mrs. Pearl Harsh and family 
returned to Chicago Sunday after 
visiting at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. S. M. Palmer. 

—Mr. and Mrs. B. F. Hopkins 
of Sentinel, Oklahoma arrived on 
Monday for a visit at the home of 
the former's step sister, Mrs. Ben 
Luke and family. 

—Miss Nellie Fleming who spent 
two years at the home of her twin 
sister, Mrs. O. L. Cooter in Minne­
apolis returned to this city Satur­
day. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Guy Graham 
spent Sunday at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Burks. 

—Mr. and Mrs. J. A. Prose re­
turned Monday after enjoying their 
vacation with friends at Sullivan, 
Ind. Miss Alice Paggley accompa­
nied them for a week's visit at tihs 
place. 

—John Tichenor returned Mon­
day from a three weeks visit to 
Chicago. 

—Mrs. J. J. Gauger left Monday 
for Kenton, Ohio where she will 
visit at the home of her mother 
for several weeks. 

—Bobbie Frederick returned to 
home in Indiana Sunday after a 
five week visit with his grandmoth­
er, Mrs. R. P. Blystone. 

—Mrs. Dena Harris who took a 
summer course at the Teacher's 
college at Charleston, returned to 
her home Saturday. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Clark Dennis are 
leaving August 1st for Evanston. 
where Mr. Dennis will take a spec­
ial two weeks course in coaching. 

—Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Martin 
and Mrs. Mary Martin visited with' 
relatives in Decatur Sunday. 

Lodk-Out 

By DOROTHY BARNES 

©. by McClure Newspaper Syndicate. 
WNU Service. 

IT REALLY wasn't Anne's fault. 
It was the wind's fault—or John's 

sister's fault—or the puppy's fault 
But not Anne's, , 

To begirt with, Anne and John 
had chosen Green Nook cottage be­
cause it was in such a secluded po­
sition. Anne wasn't afraid. There 
were no tramps. Besides, there was 
the friendly collie puppy. And 
Green Nook cottage was the pretti­
est place Anne bad ever dreamed 
of owning. It was on a little spur 
of cliff that reached out into the 
ocean. The winds were so tem­
pered that trees grew protectingly 
around the little house. And trees 
and ocean were combined to make 
a really beautiful outlook. 

John and Anne: settled for their 
first summer of marriage at Green 
Nook cottage. After they had been 
at the cottage for a few weeks. 
John's older sister. Prudence, wrote 
that she would like to visit them. 

"Never mind, Anne," John had 
said, "Pru, isn't so bad as she 
sounds. Of course she's rich. And 
she's had so much money for so 
long that she forgets it isn't conven­
ient for ojher people, perhaps, to 
drop everything and entertain her 
whenever she wants. But she's not 
80 bad." . . . 

So Prudence was.coming to visit. 
With her husband, and two sons of 
fourteen or fifteen. And Anne had 
spent a busy day getting ready for 
them. 

The two rooms for Pru and her 
family were all in order—excepting 
that the pillows needed pillow slips. 
The living room was in perfect or­
der—excepting that the dust mop 
and dust pan. leaned against the 
chimney, for,a last run-around after 
dust. The dining .room table was 
set—but ^nne's Italian lace and lin­
en napkins were even now piled on 
the ironing board in the kitchen, 
where the electric iron was heating, 
to be pressed into sparkling smooth­
ness. Dinner was under way. Float­
ing out the kitchen windows came 
tantalizing odors, even now, of this 
and that cooking on the stove and 
in the oven. 

And now Anne was locked out. 
To get through.the rest of the mat­
ter quickly, Anne had suddenly dis­
covered that the cream was not as 
fresh as it should be and had de­
cided to run down to the nearest 
village for more. She had given a 
quick mental look around and real­
ized that everything was good for 
twenty minutes. , Then she had 
rushed out the front door—and the 
door had slammed. A perverse gust 
of wind had; done the trick. 

The : windows were all screened, 
with screens that hooked in on the 
inside. Anne decided she would go 
for jthe cream and think of a way 
to get In on her trip. If she couldn't 
think of a way, she'd get help. But 
when she reached her car, she real­
ized that her keys were in her hand­
bag. And1 •• that's < where the dog 
came in. She had left her handbag 
on the porch, but the dog had 
dragged it Within doors. He liked 
to chew leather handbags. 

Anne walked around 'find around 
the house, peeking In the windows, 
taking stock of things. ' The collie 
pup cheWd' contentedly on her 
handbag \ in the living room, and 
each time 'she circled past the 
kitchen door the pots and pans 
steamed a little more tantalizingly 
the fact that soon one of them 
might go dry1. Everything seemed 
to mock at Arine. ' 

Minutes had passed—perhaps half 
an hour. 

Finally Arine started to walk for 
help. She ' didn't know just what 
sort of help she was going for. Per­
haps Just a strong knife to cut out 
a hole in one of the' screens. Per­
haps a locksmith with a master key 
—only of course there wouldn't be 
one within miles. But anyway 
Anne, still dressed in a pink ging­
ham house frock, started to walk 
for help. ' 

And then the wayward breeze, 
that had so nnobligingly closed her 
front door, played her a pleasant 
trick. Turning, it suddenly brought 
her the sound of an approaching 
automobile. And John's automobile, 
at that None but his could make 
such a chuckling, coughing sound 
and still progress; John's automo­
bile had «teen better days. But it 
went, and with Anne's for her use 
and their use together, it did quite 
well enough until the cottage was 
paid for. 

The breeze shifted again, and 
waited for several minutes before 
she had further news of John. Then 
she saw his car found a bend in the 
road not far.away. In a few more 
minutes, they were back at the cot­
tage door, Anne's troubles ex­
plained. '.' 

She bounded from the car the 
minute it stopped. "You dash back 
to the village for some cream, John. 
And.just give me fifteen minutes-
just fifteen minutes—and everything 
will be perfect. Hurry and open 
this door., I can smell something 
almost boiling dry!" 

Anne put her hand on the knob 
•f the front door in her impatience. 
It turned.. ',[\ .',.' 

She looked sheepishly at John 
hurrying after ;her with his key. 

"The latch' was. off," she said. 
"Well, Just give me1 twelve minutes, 
and I'll have this place ready!** 

{ 

BETTY ROSE PIERSON 
HAS BIRTHDAY PARTY 

July 19th was Betty Rose's 7th 
birthday and she entertained in 
the afternoon the following: Au­
drey Bathe, Francis West, Lois, 
Lelia and Ruth Sampson, Betty 
Lou Lindley, Jean West, Frank 
Elzy, Joan Murphy and Lois Pier-
son. They played outdoor games 
and the refreshments were ice tea 
and cookies and Marshmallows and 
were served by Mrs. Myrtie Bathe 
and Mrs. Feme Pierson. 

MARRIAGE LICENSES 

Richard Walker 22, Decatur. 
Geraldine Sherman 19, Dora 

township. 

Harrison Borders 22, Lovington 
Lucile Coslow, 16, Lovington. 

Pete Ray 23 Lovington. 
Irene Coy 20, lovington. 

DESPERATE REMEDY 
PROVES VERY EXPENSIVE 

A Windsor man related Friday 
the story of a farm youth near 
that place who was caring for a 
neighbor's farm while he was 
gone. He was troubled with cows 
from an adjoining pasture break­
ing into the corn field, and was ad­
vised that a few shots from a shot­
gun would give the cows reason to 
stay where they belonged. 

Thursday evening the youth fir­
ed on the animals from close range 
and according to the report, with 
the result that two of the cows 
were killed. It's reasonably sure 
that they will stay out of the corn. 
The other three animals were lib­
erally sprinkled. 

—-Shelbyville Democrat 

SULLIVAN MARKETS 

White corn 58c; yellow corn 56; 
wheat 89c; oats 37c. 

Hens 6 to 9c; springs 10c to 14c 
cox 4c; eggs l i e ; butterfat 21c. 

• THEY ATE TURTLE 
A turtle fry party was held on 

Monday night on the Okaw near 
the General Baptist church at Ful­
lers Point. Harry Jones and Rob­
ert Duncan caught the turtle and 
prepared it. Those who partook of 
the feast were Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Jones, Helen Phillips, Zada and 
Robert Duncan, Coral, Lucille and 
Mary Mclntire. 

Following the eats the whole 
party went swimming in the river. 

MRS. REEDER IN HOSPITAL 
Mrs. James Reeder, wife of the 

local C & E I agent, underwent a 
major operation in the Mattoon 
hospital Monday. She was taken 
there Friday. Reports says that she 
is getting along as well as can be 
expected and will be home after 
about ten days. 

COUNTRY CLUB PARTY 
A benefit card party was held at 

the Country club Thursday after­
noon. Mrs. J. J. Gauger, Mrs. E. 
A. McKenzie. Mrs. Carl Hill, Mrs. 
Don Campbell and Mrs Don But­
ler are members of the committee 

(serving during the month of July. 

39TH ANNIVERSARY 
Wednesday being the 39th an­

niversary of the wedding of Mr. 
and Mrs. E. A. McKenzie, they 
celebrated by going to Decatur for 
a dinner and show. In the evening 
they were entertained at the home 
of Mrs. Sarah Ash worth and 
daughter Miss Nina. 

LOVINGTON FLOWER SHOW 
Members of the Lovington Gar­

den club were in in this city Fri­
day getting information for a flow­
er show to be held in that city, 
Aug. 25th. They are urging resi­
dents of this city to enter their 
flowers, also to attend the show. 

HAVE A SON 
Born to Mr. and Mrs. Jack 

(John) Brackney, a son, July 20. 
The new arrival has been named 
James Willis. 

Strange Matrimonial Disaster of 
the $50,000,000 Heiress! An Illus­
trated Article of Marriage and Di­
vorce in High Society, in The 
American Weekly, the Magazine 
Distributed With Next SUNDAY'S 
CHICAGO HERALD AND EXAM­
INER. 

—Miss Eva Elder is enjoying a 
vacation and is spending the first 
of the week with Mr. and Mrs. 
Waverry Ashbrook at South. Beloit 
and then went to Chicago where 
she spent the remainder of the 
week at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Dave Pifer and family. 

—Mr. and Mrs. E. A. Crowder 
visited at the home of the latter's 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Will Sims at 
Waveland, Ind. Sunday. 

SMYSOR BAND CONCERT 
The Windsor Troubadours gave 

a band concert at the Illinois Ma­
sonic Home Tuesday night. This 
conceit was sponsored by John L. 
Smysor in memory of his father, 
the late Harry L. Smysor who gave 
such annual concerts several years 
before he died. 

TO MAYO HOSPITAL 
Miss Evelyn Finley came from 

Chicago Sunday and on Monday 
took her mother, Mrs. G. L. Todd 
to Rochester, Minnesota where she 
will enter Mayo Bros, clinic foi 
medical attention. 

CLASSIFIE 
ADVERTISING 

FOR RENT—House, 4 rooms and 
bath, furnace heat. L. T. Hager 
man & Company. 

ELECTRIC acetyline welding and 
general machine work. Walker 
Co. 30-tt. 

EMPLOYERS please notify Moul­
trie County Emergency Relief 
office of any able-bodied relief 
clients who refuse work. Phone 
148, Sullivan. I t 

FRIGIDAIRE 6 ft. repossessed, 
priced at less than deferred bal­
ance. L. T. Hagerman & Co. I t . 

Prudent ia l Farm Opportunities:— 
Improved and unimproved tracts 
40 acres and up. 10% in cash, 
balance financed 15 years. Write 
owner, 403 Myers Bldg., Spring­
field, 111. 30-2t. 

CAMP at Pifer's Park—Good fish­
ing, boating, bathing, and a cool 
place to sleep and rest. A cot­
tage for 12 at 50c per day for 
short time only to fill open date. 
Reserve your dates at once. Guy 
Pifer, Phone 861. 30-2t. 

BORDERS-COSLOW 
Samuel Borders and Miss Lucille 

Coslow of Lovington were untied 
in marriage Friday, July 20th at 
the Presbyterian manse by Rev. 
Garber. Katheryn Borders and 
Berry Simpson were witnesses. 

LEONARD MINOR ILL 
Mr. and Mrs. Will Hicks left 

Monday for Fowler, Colorado 
where they were called on account 
of the serious illness of Mrs. Hicks' 
father, Leonard Minor. 

HEDGE POSTS—On my farm in 
Lowe twp. I have for sale hedge 
posts—many good garner posts. 
Martha Russell, 1610 Pearce St., 
Sullivan. 30-3T 

FOR RENT: Nicely furnishetJ 
room for two girls or married 
couple; outside entrance. Strick-
lan Beauty Parlor, Phone 360 t l 

ROOMS FOR RENT. Furnished 
rooms for light housekeeping. 
Close to uptown. Private en­
trance. Hattie Houghlan, Phone 
115-w. 29-2t 

FOR SALE—1 6-oz. bottle vanilla 
25c or 1 6-oz. vanilla and 3 3-oz. 
bottles of 8 different flavors 50c 
also strained honey 23c. pt. or 
45c qt. Comb honey 10c or 3 for 
25c. choice comb 15c; call 64. 

29-3t* 

WE BUY your poultry, eggs a.m 
cream and pay highest market; 
prices. Moultrie County Hatch­
ery, Phone No. 6, Sullivan. 8-tf 

JACOB KEIM WILL FILED 
The will of the late Jacob Keim 

of Bethany was filed in the county 
court, Thursday morning. The will 
leaves everything to his wife. 
Hugh Scott is named executor in 
the will. 

WELL WORK — New Wells and 
sand pumping. See Win Glad-
ville, Terrace Block. 16-12t 

BATHE REUNION 
The annual Bathe family reunion 

will be held, in Wyman Park Sun­
day, August 5th. Everybody is 
welcome. 

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Dwain Atteberry, 19, Sullivan. 
Lena Myers 18, Windsor. 

—June Yarnell, Mary Emalyn 
Clark, Betty Winchester and Mar­
guerite Fulk left Thursday for 
Washington where they spent the 
week end visiting at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Orman Foster and 
Jane. They drove back to this city 
Sunday evening and Jane accom­
panied them for a visit with rela­
tives in this city and Bethany. 

—Elmer Dunscomb who is em­
ployed at Champaign spent Friday 
and Saturday at the home of his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. E. O. Duns­
comb. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Otto Frederick 
of Peoria visited over the week end 
at the home of her brother, Char­
ley Clark and family. 

—Mrs. E. J. Robinson spent, last 
week at the home of her daughter 
Mrs. Frank Shell. The Shells took 
her home Sunday and their daugh­
ter Joan remained at Newman to 
spend the week with her grand­
mother. 

DONT SLEEP ON LEFT • 
SIDE—AFFECTS HEART 

If stomach GAS prevents sleep­
ing on right side try Adlerika. 
One dose brings out poisons and 
relieves gas pressing on heart so 
you sleep soundly all night. 
Sam . Hall, Druggist. Adv. 

Does Your Car 
"Act Up" 

Things like that do not remedy 
themselves. They need expert 

mechanical adjustment. 

The best car economy is to keep 
it ALWAYS in best working 
order. Don't take a chance. 

Drive safe — in a safe car. 

Melvin Stricklan 
Expert Automobile Repair 

"The Poor Man's Mechanic'* 

PRINTED Letterheads 
and Envelopes • • • : 4 

• 
• 
T 
• 
T 
• 

Does|your stationery really im­
press the^firms|to^whom 

you write? 

Good Stationery is a 
Substantial Investment. 

The Progress Printshop 
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J o h n s t o n - P e t e r s o n 
: Word has been received here 

this week telling of the marriage 
of Miss Charlotte Lydia Peterson 
of Michigan to Paul D. Johnston 
also of Michigan, July 18th. 

Mrs. Johnston is the daughter of 
the late Dr. A. and Mrs. Lydia 
Peterson and formerly lived here. 
Her Lovington friends join in 
wishing her much happiness. 

Miss Grace Selby and Stanley 
-Bragg of Sullivan and Miss La-
vanda Ferris of Monmouth at­
tended the band concert here on 
Thursday evening. _ 

Mrs. Mary Humphrey and grand­
daughter Margaret Humphrey 
were visitors in St. Louis Thurs­
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Francis and 
family and Mrs. Riley Dixon spent 
Friday in Decatur the guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Francis and 
Mrs. Dora Prosser. 

Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Davis and 
son and Mrs. Elza Taylor of Find-
lay called on Mrs. Wm. Atchison 
and daughter Thursday. 

Mrs. Austin Wood of Toledo. 
Ohio who has been visiting Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Foster and family re­
turned to her home Thursday. 
Miss Letha Foster accompanied 
her as far as Indianapolis where 
she will be the guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Tyrie. 

Mrs. Emma Howell and grand­
daughter Grace How<*H, grandson, 

. Charles Howell spent Wednesday 
with Mrs. Homer Shepherd and 
iamily in Champaign. 

Sick List 
John Payne who has been un­

able to be at work at Strohm's 
hardware store on account of ill­
ness is much improved at this 
writing. 

Harold Schable who has been 
confined to his home with pneu­
monia is able to be out again. 

Lawrence Bolsen had his tonsils 
removed at the Decatur and Ma­
con county hospital Tuesday. 

Mrs. H. E. Cheever is confined 
to her home with illness. . 

,..;•- Mrs. Wash Gould is quite ill at 
her home south of town. 

Mrs. Floyd Townsend who re­
ceived a broken right leg recently 

. is getting along as well as can be 
expected. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Francis 
and family were dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Lorenson on 
Thusday. <• 

George Simpson Jr., of Detroit, 
Michigan visited here with friends 
last week.: 

Miss Pearl Pepperdine is visit* 
,Mg'"Einmett Greenwood and- fam­
i l y at Hammond. 

O n V a c a t i o n 
Rev. and Mrs. M. M. Blair left 

Tuesday for Edinburg- where ;they 
will visit for a week before going 

. . t o a summer resort at Ephraim, 
' Wis., to spend the next two weeks. 

,,jj;; tjtfifis,Margaret Shirey who is an 
agent for ^ a Cosmetic concern is 
here, the guest of her parents, Mr. 

.•.and Mrs. Willis Shirey. 
Mrs. Esther Foster entertained 

the garden club at her home, on 
Thursday afternoon. A large 
crowd was in attendance. 

; Dr. F. L. James of Sullivan was 
a business caller here Wednesday. 

O. C. Davis transacted business 
in Bloomington Friday. 

Lee, Dale* Rex and Don Bailey 
attended the circus in Decatur on 
Friday. . 

Rev. and Mrs. Linden Million of 
Hallsville called onrL. T. .Gregory 
and family Friday. 

Mrs. Charles Howard and chil­
dren went to Salem Wednesday to 
visit with the former's mother. 

L o v i n g t o n W a l l o p s H a m m o n d 
Lovington Indees played the 

Hog Fosts' soft ball team at Ham­
mond Wednesday evening. Loving­
ton nosed out Hammond with score 
of 35 to 13. 

Dorothy Wood of Sullivan called 
on friends here Thursday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Everett Jones and 
family have returned to their 
home in Bellville after visiting 
with Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Jones. 

Ebby Scheer and Edwin Ward 
of Sullivan motored to our city 
Thursday evening where they par­
took of the band concert. 

O. C. Worsham of the county 
seat was a Lovington caller Wed­
nesday. 

Norman Rogers was adjudged in­
sane recently and ordered sent 
to the state hospital at Jackson­
ville. 

Mrs. Frank Coward and Misses 
Mae and Mildred Mansfield attend­
ed the World's Fair Friday. 

Mrs. Sherman Fread and Mary 
visited Miss Maysel Fread in Deca­
tur. Friday. 

Mrs. Esther Foster entertained 
the American egion Auxiliary for 
the month of July. Mrs. Julian 
Dean was assistant hostess. The 
August meeting will be held at the 
home of Mrs. Josephine Neff and 
Mrs. Fern Noel will be assistant 
hostess. 

Francis Stevens well known Ar­
thur cornestst played in our band 
Thursday evening. 

Mrs. Elmer Atherton and Mrs. 
R. D. McMullin and Miss Faye 
Lux motored to Chicago Saturday. 

Mrs. W. F. Shields, Mrs. Mattie 
Bailey and Misses June Gould, 
Thelma Drum and Blossom Shields 
were La Place visitors Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Walton and 
Mr. and Mrs. H. K. Roberts and 
family all of Decatur visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Ralph Walton and chil­
dren Sunday. Miss Norma Jean 
Walton returned home with the 
Roberts family for a visit. 

Miss Gladys Payne and little 
niece Peggy Buckley of Louisville, 
Ky., are here the guests of the 
former's parents Mr. and Mrs. J. 
Payne. 

Mrs. Roy Baker of Lake City 
visited her sister Mrs. Mattie 
Bailey Tuesday. 

Misses Maurine and Loraine El­
lis spent Wednesday evening in 
Sullivan with Miss Dorothy Chee­
ver. 

The Methodist Ladies Aid held 
their July business and social on 
Wednesday afternoon at 3:30. Mrs. 
Carl Blackwell and Mrs. Clifford 
Whitaker were hostesses. 

John "D. Mallernee who has been 
in the U. S. army for 3 years ar­
rived home the latter part of last 
week for a short visit with his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. John Haller-
nee, Sr.* and family. 

Miss Katheryn Wright return­
ed home Friday evening from a 
week's stay at Normal. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gaylord Griffin 
went to Chicago Friday evening. 
Mr. Griffin will undergo treatments 
in a hospital in Chicago. 

C o s l o w - B o r d e r s 
Miss Lucille Coslow and Harri­

son Borders were united in marri­
age Friday evening, July. 20th. 
Mrs. Borders is daughter of, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Coslow and Mr. 
Borders is the son of M. and Mrs. 
Sam Borders. They will make their 
home in Lovington. 

Miss Lavanda Ferris of Mon­
mouth is here visiting with her 
cousin Miss Mildred Davis. 

Division three of the M. E. 
church held an ice cream social on 
Saturday evening at the band 
stand corner. The ladies were well 
pleased with the proceeds. 

CHURCH 
NOTES 

Allenville & Jonathan Creek 
CHRISTIAN CHURCHES 

W. B. Hopper, Pastor 

Bible school and Christian En­
deavor at Jonathan Creek at the 
usual hours. 

Bible school at Allenville at 10 
o'clock. 

Preaching both morning and 
evening at Allenville. The sermon 
subjects will be "Beautifying the 
Gospel", and "A Discouraged 
Preacher." 

Few Bargain 
Prices 

SWAGGER COATS, Reg. $5.50 
now $2.95 

White or Checked Flannels 

C o t t o n S W A G G E R S U I T S 
$ 5 . 5 0 n o w $ 2 . 9 5 

$ 9 . 9 5 C r e p e S u i t s n o w $ 4 . 9 5 
$ 6 . 9 5 L i n e n S w a g g e r S u i t s 

n o w $ 4 . 9 5 

M a n y r e d u c e d pr i ce s o n si lk a n d 
s u m m e r m a t e r i a l d r e s s e s 

B e s t t i m e t o b u y c o a t s n o w . 
$ 1 6 . 9 5 p o l o c o a t s n o w $ 6 . 9 5 

$ 1 9 . 9 5 al l w o o l c r e p e c o a t s 
n o w $ 8 . 9 5 

$ 2 9 . 9 5 n o w $ 1 2 . 9 5 

MRS. G. F. ALLISON 
1403 Camfield Street 

Phone 233-w 

West Hudson 
Nellie Marie. Snow 

Community meeting was well at­
tended Friday night. A business 
meeting was held and a short pro­
gram was given consisting of music 
and readings and a play. Refresh­
ments of ice cream and cake were 
served. 
. Mr. and Mrs. Lee Murphy took 

supper with Cal Murpry and fam­
ily Thursday evening. 

James Snow visited his sister, 
Mrs. Mary Alice Ferguson at West 
Union Friday. 

The C. P. Church held an all day 
picnic in the H. M. Smith grove on 
Thursday. A large crowd was in 
attendance to enjoy the basket din­
ner and games and a program in 
the afternoon. 

Harry Snow and sister Nellie 
Marie spent several days last week 
with their brother Carl Snow and 
family at Lovington. 

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Hampton 
are in the south part of the otate 
for a few days. 

Dorothy Smith of Bethany spent 
the week end with Virginia Mitch­
ell. 

Russell Crowder was a business 
caller in Bethany Monday. 

Andrew Gough spent Sunday af­
ternoon with Cal Murphy. 

Mr. and Mrs. Theron Waggoner 
spent Saturday evening in Beth­
any. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Brown were 
Bethany callers one day last week. 

George Swiney of Bethany 
gathered up a truck load of stock 
in this neighborhood Monday for 
Chicago market. 

Mrs. Belle Rhodes returned 
home from Missouri last week 
where she had been visiting rela­
tives. 

OATS SOWN WITH 
ALFALFA LESSEN 

EROSION DAMAGE 

Urbana, 111., July 24—Damage 
from dust storms, which proved so 
devastating to young alfalfa seedr 
ings in sections of Illinois this 
spring, can be practically eliminat­
ed if oats is sown as a nurse crop 
with the new alfalfa seedings this 
fall, says C. H. Farnham, assistant 
in soil experiment fields at the Col­
lege of Agriculture, University of 
Illinois. 

Largely as a result of the poor 
stands of forage caused by the 
drouth this spring and the provi­
sions of the AAA programs in 
which some 125,000 or more Illi­
nois farmers are cooperating, it is 
anticipated that an exceptionally 
large acreage of alfalfa will be 
seeded throughout the state during 
the next six weeks. An appreci­
able amount of these seedings will 
be on sandy or light wind-blown 
soils which are subject to wind ero­
sion capable of ruining seedings 
made during the latter part of the 
summer. 

Tests at the Oquawka soil exper­
imentafield, maintained in Hender­
son j county;: by the U. of I. college 
of Agriculture, show that this 
damage may be largely done away 
with by the use of oats as a com­
bination nurse and cover crop for 
fall-seeded alfalfa on sandy land, 
points out Farnham. Observations 
made at the Oquawka field this 
spring disclosed no damage to al­
falfa seeded last fall where sur­
rounded by good oats growth. How­
ever a few feet away where no oats 
had grown the alfalfa was either 
badly damaged or entirely killed 
by the wind-blown sand. In a larg­
er, unprotected area on the field, 
sand had drifted several inches 
deep, completely burying a strip of 
hluegrass. 

In addition to preventing the 
movement of the soil by high winds 
oats sown as a nurse crop with al­
falfa this fall s u l l i e s at least 
three other advantages. Grass hop­
pers prefer the oats to the young 
alfalfa plants and thus are not so 
likely to feed upon the legume, 
oats is less of a competitive com­
panion for the alfalfa than weeds 
would be and oats aids in protect­
ing the alfalfa against the winter 
cold. 

East CountyLine 
M r s . D o r o t h y W a t k i n s 

—Mr. and Mrs. Earl Smith call­
ed on friends in Mattoon Saturday. 

Miss Patricia Ritchey of Arthur 
spent the week with her cousin, 
Mildred Conlin. 

Mrs. Charles Epperson and Mrs. 
Mollie Rhodes were week end 
guests of .Mr. and Mrs. Leroy 
Foedisch and daughters of Lafay­
ette, Ind. 

Mrs. Ralph Seaman and children 
spent Monday with Mrs. John 
Heerdt. 

Mrs. Orville Powell called on 
Mrs. James Ryan Monday morn­
ing. 

Mrs. Lyman Maxwell of Loving­
ton visited Friday with her parents 
Mr. and Mrs. James Pound and 
children. . 

Many in the community attend­
ed the funeral of Mrs. Will Chaney 
Saturday morning in Areola. Bur­
ial was in Mattoon. The Chaneys 
formerly lived in this neighbor­
hood. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Watson 
and Delores spent Saturday even­
ing with Mr. and Mrs. L. W. Wat-
kins. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Harmon and 
Robert were Sunday dinner guests 
of Mrs. Melissa Potter of Allen­
ville. 

Mr. and .Mrs. Charles McGinn of 
Arthur called on Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Watson and daughters on 
Tuesday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Steck of 
Lovington visited Tuesday with 
Mr. and Mrs. John Heerdt. 

LOYAL DAUGHTERS TO 
MEET AT FLEMING HOME 

The Loyal Daughters will meet 
Monday night, July 30 instead 
of July 25th as previously stated, 
at the home of Mrs. G. R. Fleming. 
There will be a pot luck supper 
with a social hour. 

The committee is charge of ar­
rangements consists of Emma Da­
vis, Lillie Garrett, Katie Murphy, 
Nettie Dolan, Grace Foster, Myrtle 
Stain, Laura Dale, Lora Shasteen 
Alice Pifer, Martha Creech and 
Mamie Patterson. 

WAGGONER REUNION 
The annual Waggoner reunion 

will be held in Freeland Grove 
auditorium Sunday, July 29th. 
There will be a big basket dinner 
at the noon hour. Friends, rela­
tives and the public are invited. 
Bring a basket of eats and spend 
the day with us. A good program 
has been arranged for the after­
noon. —The Committee. 

THE SHIPMAN CASE 
Another chapter in the marital 

troubles of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Shipman was enacted in the circuit 
court Tuesday. Before Judge Mil­
ler, testimony was presented in 
Mr. Shipman's suit for divorce, 
charging desertion. The Judge took 
the case under advisement.-, 

—Miss Helen Chrisman .visited 
home folks at Shelbyville over the 
week end. 

Wanted—An 
Uncle 

By VIRGINIA GAY 

•©, by McCl»r,«'NewBpap« BytwUcate. 
••'•-' WKU Service;. i. 

S l'X-yEAR-OLD Peggy dug her 
bare browh toes into' the cool 

green dampness of the' grass where 
the dew was beginning to gather. 
"Auntie Jo, whyn't you get you a 
husband?" she asked of the woman 
who was reading oh theporch above 
her. "If you did I could have a 
really truly uncle like the rest of 
the girls and boys in our crowd. 
Didn't you ever know anybody that 
wanted to be your husband? Didn't 
you ever think about getting mar­
ried?" 

Josephine Lawlor came down to 
where her niece was playing in the 
grass, to stem the tide of eager 
questions. 

"Peggy, of course there are men 
I would like to marry. Don't you 
worry about getting ah uncle. May­
be some day I'll surprise you. And 
now there are some good cookies in 
the big stone jar in the kitchen," 
she saldi "don't you want some?" 
The handful of cookies succeeded 
in diverting the thoughts of Peggy 
with regard to her aunt's amorous 
adventures, and when she returned 
with the cookies, she curled up in 
the porch hammock and soon was 
off to sleep. But she had started 
the train of forbidden memories for 
her aunt. 

In the lot at one side of the house 
a baseball game was In progress; 
but as darkness fell it resolved into 
blindman's buff, crack the whip and 
a general melee Lights appeared 
in the windows of the other houses 
on the street and in the little church 
across from Miss Lawlor's home, the 
choir had met for practice for the 
Sunday services. 

Josephine could hear the voices 
singing a familiar hymn—"My Re­
deemer and My Lord." Through the 
open windows of the church came 
the familiar strains and She listened 
reverently as she took her small 
niece in her arms. Then the spell 
was broken by a voice from across 
the street. Peggy's mother called 
for her daughter! 

Josephine's voice was carefully 
pitched as she answered her sis­
ter's call—"Let her stay with me to­
night. She's asleep now." She held 
the warm little body close and gave 
herself up completely to the memo­
ries that sometimes would not be 
denied. Swiftly before her 'eyes, was 
unfolded that pageant of idng-gone 
dreams. Once sh* had fhohght 
about a husband and about marry­
ing. About holding her own child as 
she now held her niece. 

Np wonder Peggy "pad asked/, For 
Peggy had never known that gay 
lad whose gay eyes laughed ,into 
Aunt Jo's darker ones. Peggy had 
never heard that :deep and ; tender 
voice tharhad sounded as none oth­
er Into Josephine Lawler's ears.: 

Over and over again the choir 
sang the familiar lines of the an­
them. Vaguely Miss Lawlor noted 
the constant repetition, but she did 
not know that the song was, being 
repeated at the request of a strang­
er who had dropped , into the re­
hearsal with, the choir director and 
professed a special:pleasure in that 
particular, song. , ., 

Through yeat tu^; waiting in the 
inevitable shiftings of the ^ands of 
time, through change ,pf. scene and 
loss and. gain in friends and fam­
ily, Josephine Lawlor had stayed— 
waiting. Not she to forget, to find 
solace in a lesser love even if the 
best were gone forever. Though 
the long-ago. sweetheart, knew not 
where to find her. now, she still wait­
ed for him. And kept her light burn­
ing in the window. Even six-year-
old Peggy .knew the oddity of Aunt 
Jo's lamp that was always the first 
to flash, through the twilight of eve­
ning, j . 

The choir, voices, rose to a last 
crescendo—-" With my lamp well 
trimmed and : burning!" The organ 
rumbled. out the. final. chord. The 
lights flickered put as the choir 
members slipped through.the vestry 
and out to the porch and walk. 

The stranger strolled into the 
street and stood looking about. A 
gleam of orange light slanted from 
the house next door and struck 
across his face. "Who lives there?" 
he idly asked his host 

"Queer sort of dame," was the 
reply. "Sorta cracked, most every­
body thinks. Came here to live near 
her brother several years ago; just 
after the war, i guess. I don't r e 
member just when, as it's been some 
years back and I wasn't home at the 
time. She has a funny habit of 
lighting her lamp every uight sooner 
than anyone in the neighborhood. 
Harmless, she is at that. Maybe 
I shouldn't have called her that 
Jim Hargraves, her brother-in-law, 
would break every bone in my body 
if he heard me—" ,; 

"Hargraves !** — tn'e stranger 
leaped the hedge at a bound, and 
sped across the grass* now wet add 
sparkling in the modniight with the 
heavy dew, to where a woman sat 
In the radiance of the yellow lamp­
shade, a half-awake child sliding 
from her lap. 

*Mnmmie,"' Said Peggy, as she 
crept up the steps of her own porch 
a few minutes later, "I bet Aunt 
Jo's going to get a husband. There's 
a man. over to her house, an' he's 
got her Ih'his h&4 ah' she's laugh-
In'ah* crynV "'like eyerythin', all at 
once, fie'd he an uncle for me, 
wouldn't he?" 

4-H CLUB NEWS 
GIRLS. ABE CLEVER 

If a check were made of the 4-H 
girls who are wearing some very 
smart outfits when they go places 
it would surprise a lot of people 
to know these same outfits were 
made of very inexpensive ma-
terals. It might be a mild shock to 
some to learn these outfits were 
even made of materials which no 
one would have though of saving 
in our past periods of prosperity— 
materials such as old feed sacks, 
fertilizer bags and garments which 
had hung in the attic for a genera­
tion. 

In Kent county, Michigan, a 
young lady came to a clothing pro­
ject meeting with a piece of black 
broadcloth which had an interest­
ing history. This young lady's 
grandmother purchased the cloth 
back in 1893 to make a dress to 
wear to the world's fair in Chicago 
but the hard times which fell on 
the country made it impossible to 
go and the material was stored 
away. Now it is to be made into a 
coat for the owner to be worn to 
this year's world's fair in Chicago. 

In Pennsylvania the club folks 
have some interesting figures of 
what the girls have done with 
waste materials. Some 850 gar­
ments were made from flour sacks 
and burlap bags last year, reports 
Miss Harmony Stewart in charge 
of extension activities at State 
College for club members. Some 
of the garments were made with­
out any actual cash expenditures. 
Miss Clara Syphrit of Jefferson 
county spent as little as 20 cents 
for bright buttons and dye and 
when she completed her dress it 
was comparable to those selling in 
smart New York shops for ,,$27. 
her club leaders stated. 

In another eastern state the, case 
is reported of a girl making tow­
els out of materials which is woven 
by hand on a loom in the girl's 
town. 

It is not the purpose of the club 
projects to induce girls to use 
such materials if they can afford 
better, but by their use many girls 
have been able to make garments 
required in projects which they 
would not have been able to do if 
they had had to purchase new ma­
terials. 

OAWDY FUNERAL WAS 
HELD FRIDAY MORNINGi 

SCHABLE CASE HAS 
BEEN COMPROMISED 

When G. C. Schable of Lowe 
township died several years ago he 
left a wife and son; also two chil­
dren by his first wife. A fair sized 
estate also survived him. 

This estate has been in dispute 
and in litigation in the county and 
appealed in the circuit court since 
September of 1932. Court cases in­
volving possession of notes have 
been set for trial several times 
without reaching a final disposi­
tion. 

When called in court Monday, it 
was reported that a compromise 
settlement had been effected by 
the principals, relative to this part 
of the estate. 

The partition suit was also dis­
posed of. O. F. Cochran acted as 
guardian ad litum for Harold E. 
Schable. Under the terms of set­
tlement Mrs. Schable gets 80 acres 
of land, a lifetime ownership of a 
residence property in Lovington 
and $4,000. The land is free and 
clear of encumbrance. The balance 
of the estate goes to Oliver and 
Myrtle Schable the two older chil­
dren. 

Funeral services for Curti? 
Dawdy, who died at Shelbyville on 
Wednesday of last week, were 
held Friday morning at the family 
home northwest of Windsor. Rev. 
J. V. Brady was in charge. Burial 
was in Sand Creek cemetery. 

He was a son of the late John 
Dawdy and was born May 8. 
1873. He leaves his wife, nee Delia 
Warren and two children, Harry 
and Mrs. T. H. Carter, also five 
gandchildren. 

His stepmother Mrs. Sarah 
Dawdy lives in Champaign and his 
stepbrother Guy L. Kellar lives 
south of this city. 

He was a member of the Eiberty 
church congregation. He had spent 
his lifetime farming and rajsing 
stock in the same neighborhood 
where he was born. 

MRS. J. F. LEE HAD 
BIRTHDAY SURPRISE 

Sunday, July 22nd a number oi 
friends gathered at the home of 
Mrs. J. F. Lee in Allenville to ten­
der her a surprise party in honor 
of her bithday. It was also the 
birthday anniversary of Charles 
Siler of Mattoon. A potluck din­
ner was enjoyed by all. 

Those present were Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Siler of Mattoon; Mr. 
and Mrs. Clark Maby of Shelby­
ville; Mr. and Mrs. F. Moore, Mr', 
and Mrs. Will Black and daughter 
Miss Thelma; Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Shirey, daughters Freda and Wan­
da Mae and son Wayne, Mr. and 
Mrs. James Webb and son Jimmy, 
Misses Doris Ridgeway, Bernadine 
Bolin, Imogene Lee and Paul Mar­
tin, Lyle LeGrand, Rass Neaves 
Olaf French and Irwin Klepzig. 

— A guest. 

MRS. MILLS' BIRTHDAY 
PARTY AT PIFER'S PARK 

A birthday party in honor of 
Mrs. James I. Mills took place Fri­
day night at Pifer's park. 

Those present were: Mr. and 
Mrs. C. Babb, Cathryn and Bob­
bie, Mr. and Mrs. G. Pattison, Mr. 
and Mrs. R. Smith, Mr. and Mrs. 
A. Payne, Violet and Peggy, Mr. 
and Mrs. L. Lang, Joan and Patty, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. Dennis, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. Ryan, Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Janes and Nancy, Mr. and Mrs. P. 
Baumgartner and Bobbie^ Mr. and 
Mrs. R. Adair, W. Kohlhauff, H. 
Bixler, J. Konky, J. Cummins. 
Roger arid Ernest Ballard, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. I. Mills, Richard and Betty 
Lou. 

MRS. NAOMI POWELL 
DIED IN ARTHUR MONDAY 

Mrs. Naomi Powell, widow of the 
late F. M. Powell, died at Arthur 
Monday. Funeral services were 
conducted in the Christian church 
there Thursday afternoon with 
burial in Arthur cemetery. 

She was 79 years of age and was 
a native of Jonathan Ceek town­
ship. Her maiden name was Drew. 
Her husband died three years ago. 
She leaves two sons, Sylvan and 
Earl Powell of Denver. Mrs. Anna 
Ray of this city is her sister. 

DAVIS WILL FILED 

The will of the late Calvin M^ 
Davis of Bethany has been filed in 
the probate court. The document 
is sealed and its contents have not 
been made known. Scott State 
Bank of Bethany filed it. 

LOCALS 
—Mr. and Mi*s. Jim I. Mills and 

Betty and Richard visited with 
relatives at Chrisman and Charles­
ton over the week end. 

—Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Dedman 
of Jacksonville visited with rela­
tives in this city Friday. 

—Mrs. Winifred Sentel, Mrs. 
Mary Titus, Miss Dollie Dedman 
called on Mrs. Barbara Stankey at 
the Odd Fellows home in Mattoon. 
Monday. 

—Miss Fern Garrett of Spring­
field spent the first of the week at 
the home of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. S. F. Garrett. 

—Miss Evelyn Dunscomb whe 
is in nurses training at Peoria 
spent the week end at the home of 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. E. O. 
Dunscomb. 

—Mrs. Clifford Bence of Mat­
toon entertained at a one o'clock 
luncheon last week end the follow­
ing relatives: Her mother, Mrs. 
Alice Millizen, Misses Rose and 
Vene Millizen and Mrs. Leo Mur­
phy of Sullivan. 

—Miss Helen Norris returned to 
her home in Poria Sunday after 
spending three weeks at the home 
of Mrs. Alice Ziese; also with rela­
tives at Bethany. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Jesse McClure 
called on Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Blystone Sunday afternoon. 

—Corwin Querry, Jack Loher 
and William Morrisy of Chicago 
visited Sunday at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. M. B. Whitman. Mrs. 
Querry who had been here the 
past two Weeks returned to Chica­
go with them on Monday. 

—Miss Ruth Pifer and Mrs 
Frank Wolf entertained at bridge 
Saturday evening. 

Dunn Awakens And 
Becomes Popular 

Dunn Station is coming back-
In fact, Elam Love, says it is back. 
Its popularity is growing by leaps 
and bounds. The reason for this 
boom is the new beer garden and 
dance hall which is being operated 
there by M. M. Garrett. 

Bethany sells no beer. Dunn. 
does. As a consequence many Beth­
any thirsts are being quenched at: 
nearby Dunn while those who love 
to dance and dance to love are en­
joying themselves hugely. 

Mr. Love who has stuck to Dunn 
through thick and thin is elated at 
fine future prospects for his home­
land. He feels that even greater 
things may be in store. 

LAW FIRM HAS VERY 
SUCCESSFUL FIRST YEAR 

LOCALS 
—Miss Dorotha Summitt re­

turned Sunday from a visit with 
her sister and family in Robinson. 
She has been quite ill this week. 

—Mr. and Mrs. John Payne and 
family visited with relatives it. 
Humboldt, Sunday. 

—Mr. and Mrs. John Craig of| 
Hord are visiting at the home of 
Mr. Craig's mother, Mrs. Feral 
Smith this week and also calling 
on other relatives. 

—The Ladies Aid of the M. E. 
church will have a meeting at the 
home of Mrs. Will Birch Wednes­
day afternoon. Following the busi­
ness session the afternoon's social 
program will be in charge of Mrs. 
Hardy Myers' division. 

Mrs. Virgil Dowling went to 
Paris where she spent Thursday 
and Friday with friends. 

—Miss Drucilla Whitman and 
Ruth Finiey. left Friday for sight 
seeing at Niagara Falls. .... 

Eat More 
Sullivan Bakery 

Products ^ 
DURING THIS HOT 

WEATHER ! 

They are nutritious — they 
need no special preparation 

in a hot kitchen. 

FOR BREAKFAST 
FOR DINNER 
FOR SUPPER 

For Lunches and for Picnics 
You will find Sullivan bakery 
p roducts to fill every need. 

Sullivan 
Bakery 

S o u t h S i d e S q u a r e 

About a year ago F. J. Thomp­
son bought the law business of J~ 
L. McLaughlin. Robert White of 
Granite City moved here and the 
law firm of Thompson & White was. 
formed. 

Since then the firm has grown 
considerably. William Ingram came 
here from Danville to be associat­
ed with it and Mr. Thompson's son 
in law George Symons came from 
Champaign and is assisting Mr. 
Thompson in the loan and collec­
tions department. Besides this, 
two and sometimes three stenogra­
phers and clerks are kept exceed­
ingly busy. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Hugh Franklin 
returned Monday from Bowling 
Green, Ky., where they were call­
ed by the death of her sister. 

anas u ice* coffee 
Week at A**. 

ICED 
COFFEE 

rifhi, iced coffee ia 
eye ef m o u f i most popular 
Make. Make it with one of 

tkese famous blends. 

Mild and Mellow 

Eight O'clock 
COFFEE 

* ) BAG 3 3 Lb. 
18c 

Sieh and InU Bodied 

Red Orcle Coffee_Lb. 21c 
'*::.. Viceroys and Wiaey 

Bokar Coffee _ — _ L b . 25c 

California "VolencUT 

ORANGES 
Mfl lUMloiM "Pare Gold's". 
• b e 200-216. full of |ulc«. 29 

•Ices .Dos. 2 3 c 

nun*! 
EXTRACT 

™22c 2H^29< 

LIEBY'S 

fctS 

P««o 
F O R K «f 
• B A N S 

Sliced or 
•Halved 

MNfA 
FAMULT 
FLOUR 

24-1*. 
Sack 79< 

DEL 
MONTE 

SPINACH 

2^19c 

Special This Week 

SEMINOLE 
TOILET TISSUE 

4 25< 
Heinx Ketchup . 2 iffifc 3 5 c 
Avolon Apricots 3*jJP*9* 

T O M A T O E S , 1 4 oz . 2 f o r 
S i z e , S t a n d a r d B r a n d 1 5 c 

© Cr.. . . . . ci Corn «>To. 2*» e 

P« I.I Madison 
ICKleS Brand 

10j£z- lOc 
Whi t e House Milk 3 gg , 17c 
R a i s i n B r e a d orBran 2 i-oave* 1 5 c 

Week-end Specials 

EISQUICK 

£k29< 
CHASE & SANBORN, DEL 

MONTE. MAXWELL HOUSE, OR 

H&K Coffee LB 2 9 c 

A.? FOOD ST0R5S 
m 
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Bruce Sluggers 
Whale Junior 
Mechanics 10-1 

Bruce Keeps Up Win Streak As 
Misenheimer Yields Foe But 4 
Singles in 8 Innings. Dennis 
Leads Attack with 4 Singles. 

Bv Jim Scott 

Sunday — Decatur 
P. O.'s at Bruce 

Bruce — Even the Doubting-
Thomases are now ready to start 
tipping their chapeaux to Otto 
lOnsel and his amazing Bruce 
Sluggers. 

After running through the best 
opposition this locality could of-
:fer, the Sluggers last Sunday en­
gaged the Junior Mechanics, first 
half champions of Decatur's City 
league, here at Kinsel field, but the 
result was all the same our boys 
winning, 10 to 1. 

In keeping wit̂ h certain repor-
torial principles we must confess 
that the Mechanic's lust for vic­
tory was considerably assuaged by 
sweltering temperatures which had 
the mercury hovering somewhere 
above the 100 mark. A few of them 
including Joe Masters, chose to re­
main at home munching chipped 
ice, while several of those who 
made the trip tired badly in the 
early innings and were more than 
a little indisposed throughout the 
remainder of the contest. 

Paczak Indifferent 
And Pitcher Mike Paczak, the 

iormer Witt high basketball star 
•who was quite a hurler while with 
Staley's last summer, was the most 
lethargic of all. Dark-complexion­
ed and rather handsome, Michael 
was in charge for four innings, 
confining himself mostly to lobs. 

Paczak gave up two runs in the 
third and was then washed away 
T»y a six run rally in the fourth. 
Attired in a crimson jersey, I. 
Smith, Gebhart's softball ace, then 
appeared on the scene and, using 
a slow ball profusely, blanked the 
locals save for two runs in eighth. 

Misenheimer Features 
Unlike Paczak, Forrest Misen-

lieimer, the other half of Bruce's 
fame two men pitching staff, was­
n ' t afraid of perspiration, blank­
ing the Mechanics during his eight 
inning supervision. He yielded but 
four scattered singles and fanned 
eight. 

Bruce's chances for a shutout 
faded at the start of the ninth as 
Hfisey was replaced by Clark Den­
nis, who was raked for four sue 
cessive bingles. 

Dennis had previously operated 
as a first baseman in which capac­
ity he singled on the first four at­
tempts. Tanner Abbott also de­
serves a gold star for his flail work. 
He doubled in the first, tripled in 
the fourth and singled in eighth. 

Herb Wilson, Decatur high's 
'31-'32 cage captain who won num­
erals in both football and basket-
baU at Michigan university last 
winter, paced the visiting swatters 
with a triple and single. Herb look­
ed like a fine shortstop in the early 
innings only to fold up, permitting 
two ground balls to skip between 
his ankles. 

Blue Thwarts Rally 
Monte Blue, the impeccable left 

Welder, tuned up for a sensational 
second inning play when he sprint­
ed over to the foul line to pull in I. 
Smith's liner in the first. Cozad 
walked to start the second and 
-stopped at second on Wilson's 
single to left. Andrews was called 
out on strikes and Mister Monte 
came through with another spark­
ling catch of Baker's hard drive, 
then threw to second in time to 
double Wilson for the final out 

The Brucians went by a lovely 
scoring opportunity in the first 
when Tanner Abbott led off with a 
double down the third base line. 
But endeavoring to stretch his hit 
into a triple he was blotted out, 
Wilson to Baker. Dennis then 
singled sharply to center. 

Misenheimer stopped the Me­
chanics again in the third only af­
t e r they had come dangerously 
close to scoring. Conder shot a 
single over third base and contin­
ued to second when Blue fumbled 
the ball. Misey retired Paczak at 
first, but Cotton Payne's grounder 
got behind T. Abbott, Conder halt­
ing at third. Trago then speared B. 
Smith's bounder, and Conder was 
run down between third and home. 
The threat lifted as I. Smith fan­
ned. 

Bruce Opens Up 
Bruce bunched their scoring 

business in the third after one had 
been retired. Dennis opened with a 
single to center, but D. Abbott 
whiffed. Dennis moved to second on 
.a passed ball and took third on 
Trago's liner to left. Bill pilfered 
second and both runners then 
hopped in when Jimmy Evans 
whaled a single to center. 

After sizing up young Paczak 
in the third, the Sluggers batted 
around to score a half dozen tal­
lies at his expense in the fourth. 
Wilson failed to hold Stonecipher's 
roller and the latter scored when 
Monte Blue — yes Monte, of all 
people—propelled himself a triple 
to left. Misenheimer singled to 
Tight scoring Blue. Another triple 
by T. Abbott brough Misey across 
with run No. 3. of the inning. 

Dennis singled home T. Abbott 
and then advanced to second on D 
Abbott's safety. Trago skied to 
left and Evans forced Dennis at 
third. D. Abbott rushed home on 
Catcher Conder's wild throw to 
third. Evans took second on the 
play and sweeped in on Spaugh's 
single. Stonecipher, up for the sec­
ond time, waved at a third strike 

Enter I. Smith 
I. Smith made his pitching de-

nu t in the fifth and was saved by 

CHICAGO . . . Mrs. Samuel Insull 
(above), wife of the indicted utilities 
magnate, is here from Greece to stand 
by her husband when he faces trial 
on the various counts which have been 
pending so long in federal and state 
courts. 

Whitfield 
Mrs. Fern King 

Mildred Young spent Thursday 
with Mrs. Rsssell Young and 
daughter. 

Mrs. Anna Jeffers was called to 
Kirksville Wednesday owing to the 
death of her uncle, Bud Jeffers. 

Mrs. Blanche Carroll of Cen-
tralia visited over the week end 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. 
S. Delana. 

Oce Arthur spent Sunday with 
Jack and John Messmore. 

Mr. and Mrs. N. King and 
daughters spent Sunday with John 
King and family of Windsor. 

Mr. and Mrs. Emery Stainbrook 
of near Findlay, Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Atteberry of Sullivan spent Sun­
day afternoon with Charlie Wise­
ly and family. 

Frank Messmore went to Deca­
tur Friday afternoon and Saturday 
noon he accompanied his sister. 
Mrs. Z. Z. Wood and family to 
Vinton, Iowa to visit their brother 
James Messmore and family. 

Harlan Ames is visiting his sis­
ter Mrs. Carl Dolan this week. 

Mrs. Frank Doughty and Ruth, 
Mrs. Farley Young attended a 
county meeting of the Christtian 
church in Lovington Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul King and son 
were in Gays Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Edwards 
and son Jerry spent Monday af­
ternoon with Paul Edwards and 
family. 

Funeral services were held for 
Henry Ethridge of Decatur at 
Whitfield church Saturday after­
noon with Ellis Harpster in charge. 
The deceased was a former resi­
dent of this vicinity many years 
ago. 

Mr. and Mrs. N. King and daugh­
ters, Mrs. Frank Messmore and 
son were Sullivan callers Monday 

—Mrs. Marie Wood has employ­
ment in Bethany. 

a double play, Wilson to B. Smith 
to Andrews. He kept the Sluggers 
away from the plate in the sixth 
despite two singles, but his support 
went awry in the eighth, letting in 
two runs. 

T. Abbott led off with a single 
to deep short and, after Dennis had 
hoisted to Payen, to second on B. 
Smith's muff of Abbott's ground­
er. The runners advanced a notch 
on a passed ball and scored when 
Trago skipped a roller under Wil­
son's glove. Evans then lifted to 
Andrews and Spaugh struck out. 

Misenheimer went away in favor 
of Dennis at the start of the ninth 
and the Machinemen immediately 
punched out enough hits to avoid 
a shutout. With one gone Cozad 
drove a single to center and scored 
when Herb Wilson clouted a triple 
to deep left. The latter however 
was flagged at the plate by a fast 
relay. Andrews renewed the rally 
with a single, and Baker dropped a 
Texas leaguer to ceifter. The in­
ning then died as Trago grabbed 
Conder's bounder and forced An­
drews at third. 
Jr. Mechanics AB R H P A 
Payne, If 4 0 0 2 0 
B. Smith, 2b 4 0 0 1 1 
I. Smith, cf, p 4 0 0 1 1 
Cozad, rf 3 1 2 0 0 
Wilson, ss 4 0 2 2 2 
Andrews, lb 4 0 2 7 0 
Baker 3b, c 4 0 1 3 0 
Conder, c, 3b 4 0 1 7 1 
Paczak, p, cf 3 0 0 1 1 

34 1 8 24 5 
Bruce AB R H P A 
T. Abbott ss 5 2 3 1 1 
Dennis, lb , p 5 1 4 7 0 
D. Abbott, cf 5 2 1 4 0 
Trago, 3b 4 1 2 2 2 
Evans, c 5 1 1 9 1 
Spaugh, rf 5 0 2 0 0 
Stonecipher, 2 b _ _ 3 1 0 1 0 
C. Abbott, 2b ___0 0 0 0 0 
Blue, If 4 1 1 2 1 
Misenheimer p, l b 4 1 1 1 2 

40 10 15 27 7 
Jr. Mechanics 000 000 001— 1 
Bruce 002 600 02x—10 

Errors—Payne, B. Smith, Wil­
son (2) , Andrews, Conder, T. Ab­
bott, Blue. Two base hits—T. Ab­
bott. Triples—Wilson, T. Abbott. 
Blue. Double plays — Conder to 
Andrews; Blue to Stonecipher; 
Wilson to Smith to Andrews. 

Hits off Smith 3 in 4 innings; 
off Dennis 4 in 1 inning. Struck 
out—Misenheimer 8; Paczak 6; I. 
Smithl. Bases on balls—Misen­
heimer 1; Paczak 1; Smith 1. Los­
ing pitcher — Paczak. Winning 
pitcher — Misenheimer. Umpire, 
Walt Daum. 

Moultrie's 1933 Tax 
Collection Ranks Well 

A summary pf tax collections by 
counties has been received by 
county treasurer John O. New-
bould. It is for the year 1933 and 
covers the 1932 taxes. 

The report shows that Moultrie 
county collected 95 per cent of the 
taxes extended, which is a fair 
average as compared to other 
counties. Cook county reported 
39.5 per cent of its taxes delin­
quent. 

Macon county (Decatur) was 
12.5 per cent delinquent and Coles 
county was 7.5 per cent uncollect­
ed. 

Indication are that Mouftne's 
this year's collections will be as 
good as last year, or perhaps bet­
ter. 

All taxes not paid by August 1st 
will incur an additional penalty. 

Kirksvi l le 
Mrs. Lettie West 

Ray Bruce and family are stay­
ing with Mrs. Mollie Jeffers this 
week. 

Bille Kirkwood, Edwin and Joyce 
Kirkwood spent the last of the 
week with Mr. and Mrs. Harl Clark 

Mrs. Nora Ritchey is visiting ir 
Chicago with her children. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Younker: 
Mr. and Mrs. F. H. Younker, Mrs. 
Ella Brown of near Assumption 
visited Sunday with Charles 
Younker and family. Wayne who 
spent two weeks with Mr. and 
Mrs. R. L. Younker returned home 
Sunday. Mr. and Mrs. Jim West 
and sons spent Sunday afternoon 
at the Younker home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jay Gravens, Mr. 
and Mrs. Estol Fultz returned 
home Wednesday from a trip 
south. They visited relatives near 
Louisville, Ky., and Nashville. 
T e l i n - , J 1. 

Mrs. Gale Shasteen and daugh­
ter spent Monday with Mrs. Daisy 
Shasteen. -'•-£'••', 

Frank Buser and family of Mat-
toon, Mrs. H. Davis and children 
spent Sunday afternoon with Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Niemeyer. 

Mrs. Archie Dazey and daughter 
Helen spent Monday afternoon 
with Mrs. Edmond Green and 
children. 

Luther Marble and family at­
tended the funeral of Kirt Dawdy 
at the Dawdy home Friday. Burial 
was in Sand Creek cemetery. 

Otto Frederick and family of 
Peoria, Ed Harding and family of 
Isabell, Kansas, Mr. and Mrs. Wes 
Clark and Miss Lulu Clark spent 
Saturday evening at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Elvie Clark and en­
joyed ice cream and cake. 

George Bruce and family, Floyd 
Donnell spent Thursday evening 
with Mr. and Mrs. Lowell Donnell. 

Ralph Jeffers and family of 
Champaign, Homer Jeffers and 
family of Chicago were called here 
by the death of Bud Jeffers. They 
spent the rest of the week with 
their mother. 

Dean, son of Mr. and Mrs. Willie 
Hawbaker of Decatur returned to 
his home Sunday after several 
days visit with Mr. and Mrs. Mil­
lard Shasteen and family. 

Miss Madonna Frederick of Sul­
livan is spending this week with 
home folks. 

Herman Rauch and family, Tru­
man Marble and family, Ansil 
Howard and family spent Sunday 
with Ray Heiland and family. Or-
ville Gustin and family, Charles 
Tippett and family spent the af­
ternoon at the Heiland home. 

John Baker and family, Roscoe 
Ritchey of Rockville, Ind. spent 
Saturday night at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. John Floyd. They were 
called here on account of the death 
of Fred Buxton. Mr. and Mrs. 
Phillip Floyd of New Holand were 
also called here by the death of 
Mr. Buxton. They spent Sunday 
n:orning at the Floyd home. 

Dalton City 
Lois Cowger 

Miss Jennie Morrison accompa­
nied by Miss Gertrude Griffin of 
Springfield left Tuesday for an ex­
tended visit in the West. 

Miss Irene O'Brien spent sev­
eral days last week in Warrens-
burg with Mr. and Mrs. Leo De-
laney. 

Mr. and Mrs. Emmitt McGown 
and children and Thomas McGown 
of Decatur were callers here on 
Monday evening. 

Miss Anna Weiier of Olney vis­
ited friends here Tuesday and 
Wednesday. 

Mrs. Ella Delahunty was pleas­
antly surprised by a number of 
friends at her home Friday night. 
The occasion was her birthday. 

Miss Myrtle Trulock of near 
Casner spent the week end in this 
city with friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. George McColl and 
son Bert of Argenta spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Edmond Bres-
non and family. 

Edmond Cheeley and family have 
moved to a farm west of this city. 

Yuiel Coslow of Lovington spent 
the week end with friends. 

Miss Olive Pasley who has been 
spending a few weeks in Loving­
ton with relatives and friends re­
turned home Saturday. 

Miss Vera Herrin of Sullivan 
spent the week end with her sister 
Mrs. Alvin Burress. 

J. A. Stolleof Ohlman, Clarence 
Stolle of Decatur, Dean and Lyle 
Carleton of Decatur spent Tues­
day here with Albert Stolle and 
family. 

Jonathan Creek 
Mrs. Otis Biesecker 

Mr. arid Mrs. Chas. Hayes of 
Mattoon spent Sunday evening 
with Mr. and Mrs. Hershel Houc-
hin. 

J. E. Righter was a Decatur call­
er Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Guy Bolin and 
family were guests of her parents 
Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Pierce Sunday. 

Miss Marjorie Heerdt spent last 
week with her sister, Mrs. Everett 
Higgenson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Will Powell, Mr. 
and Mrs. Orville Powell and daugh­
ter Francis Marion, and Ralph 
Powell of Chicago were Sunday 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. D. Deck-
ard in Decatur. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Bolin and 
family visited last Saturday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Kercheval. 
Helen remained for a few days. 

Mrs. Nancy Bracken spent Fri­
day afternoon with her son J. R. 
Bracken and wife. 

Mr. and Mrs. V. R. Ashbrook 
and daughter Ruth called on Mr. 
and Mrs. Emery Righter Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Herschel Houchin 
and Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Houchin 
and children of Mattoon visited in 
Champaign Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Freese and 
Peggy Ellen attended a birthday 
dinner on Sunday at the home of 
Jesse McClure. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Bracken and 
Helen Shaw spent Wednesday in 
Decatur. 

The Ladies Aid picnic will be 
held next Tuesday, July 31. Every 
member and their family are urg­
ed to come and make this a happy 
occasion. It will be in Sam Purvis 
woods. 

Mrs. D. D. McColl and daughters 
of Atlanta are visiting her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. W. S. Elder Jr . 
for several weeks. 

Ms. Delia Garrett and Leona 
Stone of Sullivan, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
E. Righter and Hugh spent Sunday 
evening with Mr. and Mrs. Emery 
Righter. 

Mrs. Goldie Biesecker called on 
Mrs. Harry McClure Thursday af­
ternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Houchin 
and children of Mattoon were 
guests of his parents Herschel 
Houchin and family Monday and 
Tuesday. 

Miss Lucille Pound spent Satur­
day night with Helen Shaw and at­
tended the Christian church coun­
ty meeting at Lovington Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Reuben Johnson 
and girls and Mr. and Mrs. Otis 
Biesecker and family spent Fri­
day night with Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Pound. 

A large crowd attended the fun­
eral services on Sunday evening at 
four o'clock for Fred Buxton at 
Jonathan Creek church. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dave Sullivan, Mr. 
and Mrs. Arnold Nelson and 
daughter spent Thursday evening 
with Wm. Sullivan and family. 

The Jonathan Creek chicken fry 
will be held at home of W. S. El­
der Jr., on August 9th. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Deckard of 
Decatur, Ralph Powell of Chicago 
and Mr. and Mrs. Will Powell were 

Sunday dinner guests of Orville 
Powell and family. 

Miss Mavis Larimer of Cham­
paign Epent Tuesday night with 
her grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
Herschel Houchin. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Crane and 
family are visiting this week with 
his relatives in Pinkneyville and 
Tamaroa in southern Illinois. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Bracken and 
Helen spent Monday evening with 
W. G. Cochran and family. 

W. H. Sullivan and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wade Sullivan and Mar­
jorie Lou were Sunday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Steele in Sulli­
van. 

Mrs. O. W. Powell spent Friday 
afternoon with Mrs. Hattie Bolin 
and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Buxton of 
Monticello were called home Sat­
urday by the death of his father. 

Louise Cochran of Sullivan vis­
ited several days last week with 
her cousin Helen Shaw. 

Vernon Houchin will entertain 
the young people of the Christian 
Endeavor Friday night at his 
home. The girls are to bring cake 
and the boys ice cream. 

There were 65 in attendance at 
Sunday school on Sunday from the 
J. C. church which was held at the 
pavilion in Lovington park. There 
were 402 present from the. ten 
churches in Moultrie county. An 
enjoyable day was reported despite 
the excessive heat. 

Nathan Powell and family, O. 
W. Powell and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dewey Deckard of Decatur 
enjoyed a picnic supper Monday 
night at the home of Wm. Powell. 

Mrs. Guy Bolin and several cf 
the 4-H club girls spent Tuesday 
in Tuscola. 

SCHNEIDER FAMILY DOING 
WELL IN EVANSTON 

The editor and wife on their re­
turn from Wisconsin Friday stop­
ped off in Evanston for a visit with 
their former neighbors, Mr. and 
Mrs. L. W. Schneider and family. 

Mr. Schneider is engaged in the 
barber business in Evanston. They 
have a beautiful home and are 
prospering. The oldest daughter. 
Esther, is married and has a very 
nicely furnished apartment. Ver-
jean is a switchboard operator :n 
the Evanston hospital. Herbert is 
working for a grocery firm. Paul, 
who will be remembered by many 
on account of his insatiable thirst 
for knowledge, via the question 
line, is the same old Paul, with an 
everlasting flow of questions ever 
at his command. Rosaline is in a 
girl scout camp this week and Mil­
lie the curly-headed baby of the 
family has changed but little, 
though now she is a miss of ten. 

ANDREW RUSSELL GETS 
PENITENTIARY SENTENCE 

Ful lers Po int 
Mrs. Chester Carnine 

Al len vi l le 
Mrs. N. S. LeGrand 

Mr. and Mrs. Percy. Bundy of 
Chicago and Mr. and Mrs. Ray­
mond Bunday of Sullivan visited 
one day last week with Mr. and 
Mrs. J. W. Bundy. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hugh L. Martin 
and children spent the week end in 
Charleston with the latter's par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. F. Monical. 

Martin Glover and Arthur Duty 
of Mattoon and Mr. and Mrs. John 
LeGrand of Sullivan spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. N. S. LeGrand. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Watkins and 
family spent Sunday in Decatur. 

O. F. Mattox was a business 
caller in Indianapolis Monday. 

Walter Spaugh is visiting hie 
sister Mrs. Lula Hulsapple in Mil­
waukee, Wis. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Abell were 
business callers in Windsor Sun­
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harley Jenkins and 
family spent Monday with Mr. and 
Mrs. T. L. Ridgeway. 

The protracted meeting of the 
Church of God is progressing nice­
ly although the heat wave is ter­
rible. 

Each afternoon and evening the 
river at Nelson Bridge is full of 
bathers trying to cool off. This has 
become quite a bathing beach. No 
better place can be found around 
here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Harter and 
Mrs. Zella McCarter of Indianapo­
lis, Ind., and Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
Carnine visited Friday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Wm. Foley of Rardin. 

Rev. Dale Tennison filled his 
regular appointment at Mt. Zion 
Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Carnine 
entertained to dinner Sunday: Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Harter, Mrs. Zella 
McCarter, Charles Carnine of Ed-
gerton, Wis., Mrs. Lizzie Rightsell 
and Clifton and Evelyn Carnine. 

Stanley Kibler and sons Nolan, 
Arty Langston of Mattoon called 
on, Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Martin and 
family Sunday afternoon. 

Rev. A. G. Carnine of Blooming-
ton called on his mother Mrs. Ma-
linda Carnine Sunday. 

Mrs. John Furness and daughter 
Miss Mabel were callers in Mat­
toon Monday. 

The Missionary society of Cooks 
Mills met at the home of Mrs. Paul 
Wiley Thursday. 

Mrs. Lizzie Rightsell and Ches­
ter Carnine were callers in Sullivan 
Tuesday. 

Everett England spent several 
days last week visiting relatives in 
Louisville, Ky. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe England spent 
Sunday with Mrs. Fanny England 
and sons. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Harter and 
Mrs. Zella McCarter and Mrs. Liz­
zie Rightell, Ms. Chester Carnine 
and son Clifton visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Ott Carnine of Mattoon, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. I. Carnine of Gays 
Wednesday of last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles England 
and family spent Sunday with Ira 
Reed and family. 

Farewell for Lane Family 
A number of neighbors and 

friends gathered at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bert Lane and fam­
ily Thursday night of last week, 
and surprised them by, giving them 
a farewell party as they are mov-
ign to Sullivan in the near future. 

At Springfield this week, Feder­
al Judge Briggle, sentenced An­
drew Russell, 78 and Millard F. 
Dunlap 77, to 18 months impris­
onment in the Federal penitentiary 
at Leavenworth. They were also* 
fined $5,000 each. 

These sentences are the outcome 
of the two men's banking activities 
that resulted in wrecking the Ay-
ers National bank in Jacksonville. 

Andrew Russell is known to Sul­
livan people. He was serving as 
state auditor at the time of t h j ^ 
first M. & F. bank failure a n j ^ 
came here to assist in its re-open­
ing. He also served as state treas­
urer and was very prominent in his 
party's affairs. Dunlap was presi­
dent of the Ayers bank when it 
closed. 

—Miss Bernice Taylor returned 
home Monday morning after visit-
ing for the past week with her sis- vfl 
ter Miss Alta Taylor in Chicago. 

Ice cream and cake were furnished 
by the guests. Those present be­
side the Lane family were Dave 
Spaugh and daughters Marjorie 
June and Wilma, Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Wiley and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Geo. Spaugh and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Perry Leeds, Mr. and + 
Mrs. Robert Pierce, Mr. and Mrs. 
Reuben Johnson and daughters, 
Mr. and Mrs. Clem Goddard and 
family, Homer Hoskins, Mary, 
Evaline and Opal Reed. 

Dr. F. L. James 
NATUROPATH 

Mineral Vapor Baths for 
Rheumatism, Neuritis, etc. 

PHONE 106 

Sullivan Bethany 

CARL DICK 
INSURANCE 

Sullivan Phone 48 
Bethany Phone 60 

DONALD M. BUTLER 
DENTIST 

Closed Thursday Afternoon 
Phone 129 Sullivan, 111. 

Dr. O.F.FOSTER 
DENTIST 

Moderate Prices 
Office at Residence, 

1201 E. Jackson Street. 
Phone 119 

Night work by appointment. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Glen Kilby and 
son Billy are home from a three-
weeks visit with her mother and 
brother in Virginia, 111. 

Come see why 

Our Best Salesmen are the Users 

of the NE 
Yes sir—people who got the 1 
new G-3 All-Weather before "i 
it was advertised and have 
driven this marvelous tire 
many thousands of miles, are 
singing its praises louder than 
our advertising does! Par­
ticularly do they insist tha t 
the new G-3 gives better than 
the * *43% more non-skid mile­
age" we advertise! AH we ask 
is, before you buy tires give 
us a chance to show you why 
G - 3 u s e r s b o o s t i t e v e n 
stronger than we do! I^SSE*?* 
ASTONISHING 

NEW G3 
[Over 22,000 miles-still 
i plenty of traction. r —Iowa 

G O O D Y E A R 
ALL-WEATHER 

Look!—at No Extra Cost. . . Al% 
More Miles of real non-skid safety 

Flatter Wider Tread . . . More 
Center Traction (16% more non-
skid blocks) . . . Heavier Tougher 
Tread (average of 2 lbs. more 
rubber) . . Supertwist Cord Body 
(supports heavier tread safely)! 

Approximate ly 32,000 
miles—still some traction 

- W . Va. 
1 left 

\ Usually wear out tires in 
115,000 miles. No appreci-
I able wear on front G-3's, 
little on rear, after 12,879 
miles. —Georgia 

Big Value—Low Price! 
GOODYEAR 
SPEEDWAY 
Built with Super-
twist Cord . . . Cen­
ter traction; tough 
thick tread; full 
oversize. 

30 x 3H 4.40-21 

\*#* 20°nia8t!*tt««tt 

# 

I * 
o 

i 

$4.40 $4.95 
Other sizes in pro 
por t ion expert ly 
mounted on wheels 

Prices subject 10 change without notice. 
State salfs tax, if any, additional. 

Tire & Battery Station 
L. A. ATCHISON, Prop. 

Hours: 6:30 a. m. to 10 p. m. 
Saturdays & Sundays 6:30 a. m. to 12. 

PHONE 467 SULLIVAN, ILLINOIS 

ONE STOP HERE 
NONE ON THE 

ROAD 

Complete Super-
Service at our sta­
tion on tires, bat­
tery, oil lubrication, 
gas, spark plugs, 
and motoring acces­
sories. 
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TRAIL'S END 
By Agnes Louise Provost 

Life was not real. It was a cas­
tle of lovely brittle glass, and it 
was cracking and splintering all 
around her. 

The girl in the cream-colored 
roadster tried to realize it in all 
its ugly implications, tried to see 

J ie r way through the bristling 
^ » e c k a g e which had closed in on 

Things didn't happen like that; 
they simply didn't. To some, per­
haps, to the reckless and hardboil-
ed who did things that invited dis­
aster; lived on excitement and wild 
parties. Not to girls who led nor­
mal, healthy lives and did the usu­
al pleasant agreeable things and 
were thrilled to pieces over their 

^ w o r k and the glorious chance of 
' J success in it. It could not happen 

But it had. What was she going 
to do about it? 

The, girl kept haunted young 
eyes on the road ahead, mechan 
ically efficient while her thoughts 
darted and turned, hunting fran­
tically for a way out. The speed 
ometer needle trembled at sixty, 
and slid back to forty-five. She 

^ m u s t not drive too fast, and risk 
Wbeing stopped for speeding. Of all 

times, not now. 
What was she going to do? 
For the first time the firm little 

hands on the wheel slackened and 
shook, but she steadied them again 
resolutely. The roadster hummed 
softly on. The wind that rushed by 
her face was sharp with the night 
chill and damp with the smell of the 

•^Pacific. Long fingers of light reach-
k ed out for her and were dimmed; 

a nondescript car rattled past, its 
driver sending a curious glance at 
the smart roadster with the pretty 
girl at the wheel, alone. 

The air on her cheek was notice­
ably wet, bringing its own message 
—A thin fog was creeping in from 
the sea. Presently it would be 
thicker, a fleecy white blanket. She 

dl saw its wooly whiteness closing sil-
ently around a dark beach bunga­
low, miles back of her, shrouding 
it, hiding it, smothering sight and 
sound. 

There were no lights in that 
bungalow, to beat through in a 
golden haze. She saw it as she had 
last seen it, blank-windowed, lark 
and furtive on its strip of shelter­

e d beach. A silhouette against the 
•jpale rectangle of a door. A man's 

silhouette. 
Memories came like black wings, 

swooping down on her. Other 
things that were said. She didn't 
want to think of them. 

The road curved again. She saw 
a single light ahead, and her own 
headlights picked up a motorcycle 

^drawji to one side of the highway, 
^Bhd a man in uniform bending 
^ o v e r i t . A motorcycle policeman. 

He looked up, with a professional 
eye on the oncoming car. 

She wanted to step on the gas 
and go roaring past him, but she 
didn't. Somehow she stopped. 
Somehow she kept her voice cool 
and natural. 

"Any trouble, officer? Can I 
call up a garage for you—or any­

t h i n g ?" 
"Why no, lady. Much obliged." 
The man in uniform was disillu­

sioned and hardboiled, but he 
grinned appreciateively at the 
small creature competetly offering 
l e l p . Drivers of speedy cars didn't 
usually waste much grief over a 
motor cop stalled by the roadside. 
And this was a pretty girl, pretty 
even for this favored strip of the 

£ coast, where pretty girls flocked 
• from all over the country. A little 

thing, with big soft eyes and a red 
beret pulled at a gallant angle over 
a small, dark head. Looked like a 
nice kid, for all she was tearing 
around" the country alone at this 
hour of night. A swell car; it must 
have cost a hatful of money. Later 
he was to remember that car, and 
the girl who had driven it. 

^ He swung a sturdy leg over his 
^saddle. "Better detour inland if 

you're going far. The fog's getting 
thick back there. Driving's going 
t o be bad before long." 

"Thanks, I'll remember." 
She smiled, and the cream-col­

ored roadster slid past him. Fog, 
and dangerous driving along the 

coast road. It was so very simple. 
She had been up and down this 

road a score of times since the new 
roadster had been hers. She knew 
its curves, its grades, its ragged 
coast line. She knew, now, where 
she was going. The speedometer 
needle crept a little higher. 

A road appeared, branching 
obliquely from the main highway 
Tall trees marched along each 
side of it and a denser planting 
showed ahead. In the darkness be­
neath the trees she brought the 
roadster to a standstill and let her 
hands drop from the wheel. 

It was lucky that she had re­
membered this place. So accessible 
and yet so secluded, with no curi­
ous eyes to see the queer prepara­
tions that she had to make. . . . 
Funny how wobbly she felt, now 
that she could just drop back and 
let go. . It wouldn't do. She must 
get herself in hand, keep her head 
clear and her nerve steady. 

It was not so easy. She seemed 
to be two jjeople, and one of them 
was a sly, persistent imp which 
hovered close to her ear, fleering 
and wheedling. 

"You're running away! Running 
away! You've never been a quitter 
before." 

"But I've never," she found her­
self arguing, "been in such a 
ghastly jam before." 

"If you go now, you can't come 
back. You'll be giving up every­
thing. All this that you've worked 
for. You can't ever go back to 
that." 

I know. That's all finished. . . . 
She shook herself impatiently and 
swung the door open with a vig­
orous jab. 

The pocket of her light sports-
coat bumped clumsily against her 
as she stepped down. She stood 
very still for a moment, with an 
odd, arrested look on her face. 
Then she thrust her hand into the 
overloaded pocket and drew out 
the thing which had weighed it 
down. 

Starlight had all but vanished 
before the stealing mist, but even 
in that obscurity it was a bright 
and lovely trifle, a woman's jewel­
ed bag, extraordinarily full. The 
strained catch must haye been too 
hastily snapped shut, for it yawn 
ed open at a touch, and the bulging 
contents oozed into view. Bills. 
The bag was fairly stuffed with 
them, high denomination bills, 
tightly crammed in. 

The girl in the red beret stared 
at it soberly. It seemed to give her 
no pleasure, not even any particu­
lar sense of the risk she ran in 
carrying such a sum with her, 
through lonely roads and at all 
hours of the night. She just let the 
bag lie there on her hand looking 
at it. 

There was a faint aversion in 
that look. The palm tilted slowly 
as though she mean deliberately to 
let that opulent roll slide to the 
dust at her feet. Then with a brief 
grimace- of distaste she righed her 
hand again, thrust the bag deep in­
to the coat pocket, and turned, a 
little blindly, back to the car. 

The girl looked very small be­
side the big car, very young and 
troubled, yet somehow determined 
and every move now was brisk and 
efficient. A vigorous tug and a 
smart traveling case came out of 
the c ar—was hidden behind a 
mass of shrubbery. 

"Lucky," she reflected, "that 1 
was all set to stay. . . If there is 
any luck in such a miserable snarl 
as this." 

She slipped quickly into her seat 
again, and the engine's heavy purr 
cut abruptly into the stillness 
The roadster swung smoothly out 
of the s hadowed drive and down 
toward the highway. The fog had 
thickened perceptibly and the road 
was dark, but she drove without 
lights. Time enough to switch those 
on. There must be no one who 
could remember, later, a distant 
glimpse of flaring lights. 

On the last turn she had a good 
view of the m ain road in both di­
rection. No dazzle of oncoming 
lights showed either way, blurring 
through the fog. She swept out in­

to the highway, and her own came 
on. 

There was no placid strips of 
beach here; only rough ground and 
dark rocky headland, now fairly 
close, now farther away, dropping 
sheer. About an eighth of a mile 
beyond there should be a place 
where it jutted boldly into the sea. 
There it was. A queer little tongle 
when skipping over her as she 
caught sight of it, vaguely out­
lined. H ow much distance would 
she need? Ten—no, twenty feet 
before. striking the incline. It 
would be too dangerous beyond 
that. She brought the car slowly 
to a standstill. Shut off t he en­
gine. 

For a moment she sat listening, 
every nerve alert. There was not 
a sound, except for the heavy 
murmer of the seat below. Even 
though fog might muffle distan' 
sounds, it wasn't dense enough yet 
to matter. She started the engine 
again. 

Her heart was beating fast as 
she stepped down. The roadster 
was pointing at a strange angle. It 
looked so sleek and beautiful, and 
she let a hand rest on it softly. 
This was a shabby trick to play on 
a good friend, but it had to bs 
done. She would miss it, t oo. 

There was no time to be wasted. 
She stepped up and leaned in, and 
her hands moved s wiftly and com­
petently. She gave a last tug and a 
hasty glance toward the naked 
ledge beyond. 

The car lurched and started, and 

Few, if any, radio stars can ever 
again be the beloved household 
heroes and heroines, after they 
make stage appearances. We have 
seen a number of these attempts 
and they have all seemed like in­
glorious' flops. We have seen no 
performance put on by radio stars 
and alleged artists, that we did not 
think the broadcasting station, back 
of the thing, ought to pay the 
theatre manager for the privilege 
of putting on the show. There may 
eventually be a hybrid breed ot 
radio-stage performers, but we 
doubt whether the present genera­
tion will live to see it. And before 
leaving this subject, may we refer 
it to the committee on morals and 
manners, now engaged in protect­
ing the theatre-going public. 

» » * 

Friday night — Oh, what a show 
—Two shows in fact. Comedians 
and alleged comedians in Holly­
wood Party will entertain you— 
look at the cast in order of their 
importance—Mickey Mouse, Eddie 

is rather enticing and promises a 
great show. 

* * * 
Broken Dreams 

Tuesday night's show is some­
thing entirely different from the 
Laurel-Hardy and Wheeler-Wool-
sey nonsense. It has the pathos of 
"The Champ" and the drama of 
"Sorrell & Son." It is one of those 
pictures which will cause you to 
remark, one your way homeward, 
"That's what I call a good show. 
Also—see the screen's biggest lit­
tle actress, Shirley Temple in 
"Pardon my Pups" and other short 
stuff. 

* * r-

Another Big Feature 
Irene Dunne and Richard Dix 

made screen history in 'Cimarron' 
and are now teamed together in 
"Stingaree" a picture with an Aus­
tralian setting. Dix in the role of a 
debonair, engaging outlaw is at his 
best. Others in the cast are Mary 
Boland, Conway Tearle, Andy De-
vine, Henry Stephenson and Una 
O'Connor. In connection with this 
picture, 1934 Century of Progress 
pictures will be shown as well as 
some short features. 

East Hudson 
Mrs. Chris Monroe 

left the smooth road with a pro-, Q u i U a n P o l l y M o r a n Charles But 
testing heave. It was gathering ^ J 

* * * A domfortiua 
Service 

The greatest service of the modern 
funeral director is that of lifting the 
load of responsibility from the 
shoulders of the bereaved. From the 
moment that he is called, he assumes 
charge of the many details which re­
quire attention. In our organization 
we give special attention to this 
comforting service. 

£. H. Jflriittilttt 3tourral 
ifrnnr 

Phone So Sullivan, Hi. 
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speed, bumping over the uneven 
ground. She jumped, staggered for 
a few steps and fell. 

Huddled there on hands and 
knees, panting but unhurt, she saw 
the big car strike the slope and go 
hurtling down. Lurching, with 
lights flaring toward the empty 
sea. On the brink it seemed almost 
to rear back, hung for a split sec­
ond and flashed down. She saw it 
turning, and pressed her hands to 
her ears against the grinding crash 
of its fall. 

The silence that followed was 
blank and empty. She pulled her 
hands down shamefacedly and 
found the palms moist. 

"That's done!" she muttered 
shakily, and got to her feet. Her 
face was a white patch against the 
darkness. 

She knew that she must hurry 
away, before some belated motor­
ist came by and saw her. A girl in 
a red beret had ceased to exist, 
and her flitting ghost must not be 
seen. How queer it seemed. . . . 
there wasn't any such girl any 
more. 

A dusty train jolted steadily 
through empty country. It was a 
short t rain, only three coaches 
and a baggage car, and the coaches 
had left their first youth far be­
hind. But this was a branch line, 
crawling long miles out of the 
beaten track of the big transcon-
tinentals, and Number Twelve's 
patrons did not expect the pamp­
ered ease of Pullman and dining 
car. 

About midway of the last car a 
girl sat looking out of the window. 
The outlook was not particularly 
interesting, that she should be so 
absorbed in it. Sand and low bush­
es, endlessly slipping by. A distant 
peak. A smear of blue which 
might be still more distant moun­
tains. Sand, bushes, sjind. The girl 
hadn't seen a house fftr miles. 

The scattered half dozen of her 
fellow passengers looked at her 
with undeniable frequency, partly 
because she was the pleasantest 
thing there was to look at in their 
whole journey, and partly from a 
healthy curiosity. Strangers, and 
particularly strangers as pretty as 
that, did not often travel on Num­
ber Twelve. 

The girl felt that friendly scru­
tiny. She had been restless under 
any interested glance for days, and 
it was not merely interest in the 
marsh waste beyond the window 
which kept her face so steadily 
turned that way. She wondered, 
with a prickle of uneasiness, what 
newspaper people saw out here. 

Newspapers! She turned a little 
further toward „the window, re­
membering a terrifying, heart-
squeezing day when she had heard 
them cried on the streets of a big 
city. 

What a morning that had been! 
The cheerful Saturday crowd 
thronging the downtown streets, 
jamming good-naturedly at the 
crossings; newsboys shouting their 
wares; people buying them, talk­
ing about something that had just 
happened. Herself among them, 
feeling curiously unreal as she 
handed over her pennies, and rath­
er small and quaking as she look­
ed at a front page splashed with 
headlines and pictures. Her pic­
ture. Feeling all chilly and gone 
inside, even though the face on 
the front page w as so different" 
from that of the girl on the street, 
with her hair pulled forward in 
loose, dark waves under a low 
brimmed hat. Putting nervous 
finger tips up to the framing hair, 
to make sure that it completely 
hid the uncomfortable strips of 
adhesive which gave her eyes and 
eyebrows that long, unfamiliar 
tilt. Wondering if the tiny pads 
under her lip were still properly 
in place, and if they really did 
change her mouth as much as she 
had tought—and then passing a 
long mirror and seeing a queer 
looking stranger there. Thanking 
her stars—her one remaining star 
—that she had learned how to do 
such things. Hurrying at last to a 
railroad station, to get far away as 
she could before another day came 

In the nearly empty station, with 
an hour's wait for her train, she 
read the paper from the first page 
to the last. 

It had been rather ghastly. All 
those pictures of a girl who was 
supposed to be dead and mustn't 
ever come back to life again; in­
sets of other people whose lives 
had touched hers; a snapshot tak-

terworth, Lupe Velez, Laurel & 
Hardy, Richard Carle, George Gi-
vot, Frances Williams, Ted Healy 
and his Stooges and a fellow nam­
ed Durante who noses in on the 
show somewhere. If your laughing 
muscles have grown tight to your 
ribs, seeing this show will shake 
them loose. 

»•. • » 

A Little Lovin" 
The second show Friday night is 

"Kiss and Make-up" in which Cary 
Grant carries the leading role, and 
Genevieve Tobin, Helen Mack, Ed­
ward Everett Hotron and the Wain-
pas Baby Stars of 1934 ably as­
sist. This is a beauty shoppe play, 
with lots of loving situations. 

The press sheet says that Ed­
ward Everett Horton is Holly­
wood's favorite actor — everybody 
likes him. Besides these two good 
shows Friday night there will also 
be one of the Medbury Travels. 

* * • 
Chinese Stuff Saturday 

If you like the late Earl Duerr 
Biggers' Charlie Chan detective 
stories, you have a treat coming 
Saturday when Warner Oland ap­
pears in "Charlie Chan's Courage" 
a thrilling mystery romance. 

Oland is not Chinese but when 
occasion requires he can appear as 
one. He is the screen's best Chi­
nese impersonator. He owns an isl­
and off the west coast of Mexico 
where he expects to retire and 
make his home some day, when 
Hollywood no longer wants him. 

Manager Hays promises other 
good features for Saturday. 

* * * 

Sunday-Monday 
Short comedy, News and car­

toon are the side-dishes, while the 
heavy course is Wheeler and Wool-
sey's "Cockeyed Cavaliers." Thel-
ma Todd and Dorothy Lee have the 
feminine leads. 

The setting is comic — two wise 
cracking modern day cavaliers 
roaming the country of many, 
many years ago. This show is not 
designed to teach you anything — 
but to entertain you. The Pre-Vue 

I Mi-, and Mrs. Roy Tole of In­
dianapolis and Mr. and Mrs. Troy 
Tole of Champaign visited Elmer 
Burks and family Tuesday. 

Mrs. Chris Monroe and Mr*. W. 
H. Fisher spent Thursday after­
noon in Mattoon. 

Mrs. Ray Woodruff and Lorene, 
Mrs. Kenneth Wood, Mrs. Will 
Wood and Mrs. Henry Daum, Mrs. 
Ezra Selby and Mrs. Jim Hopkins 
helped Mrs. Earl Horn cook for 
threshers Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chris Monroe vis­
ited Friday evening with Mr. and 
Mrs. Millard Shasteen and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hurl Elzy, Mr. and 
Mrs. Guy Graham spent Sunday 
evening with Elmer Burks and 
family. 

Mrs. Earl Horn, Mrs. Ray Wood­
ruff and Lorene visited Friday af­
ternoon with Mrs. Orr Hilliard. 

Miss Vida Freese visited in De­
catur Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Burks visit­
ed Thursday in Decatur. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Watkins 
spent Sunday evening with Lee El­
der and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Zola, Wright, Mr. 
and Mrs. Truman Phillips and Lois 
Jean of Boonsville, Ind., visited on 
Friday till Sunday with Scott Cha-
ney and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Scott Chaney and 
family visted Sunday with Harmon 
Chaney and family in Mattoon. 

Tells Who Is Most 
Liable To Catch T. B. 

Coles 
Mrs. Richard Bouck 

en from a boat, showing curling 
waves against cliff's dark back­
ground, black ragged rocks thrust­
ing out of the water, and sprawled 
helplessly on one of them the 
twisted, shattered wreckage of a 
car. 

It was news. There had been sev­
eral columns about it. Reports, 
conjectiures, interviews. A motor­
cycle policeman had testified to 
meeting a young lady in that same 
roadster and warning her about the 
thickening fog. No, there had been 
nothing in the young lady's man­
ner to indicate suicidal intent. 

One thing had puzzled her bad­
ly. There had been all this about 
one roadster found wrecked at the 
base of a cliff, but not one line in 
the whole story about the thing 
she had feared most. How could 
that be suppressed? 

The man across the aisle was 
saying something to another man 
several seats back. Everybody here 
seemed to know everybody else. 
Perhaps it would have been bet­
ter after all, to have buried her­
self in a big city. One can be lost 
so quickly in the shifting crowds. 
But there would be always the 
tingling expectancy of seeing some 
one she knew some day, or some­
one who knew her. In shop or of­
fice, in restaurant, or on a crowd­
ed street. 

She wasn't going to be actually 
in any town. It was some miles out 
of this town of Marston, whatever 
that was like, at the end of a long 
private road, the agent had admit­
ted. She had named it already,— 
Trail's End. She liked the sound 
of that. Remoteness. Safety. Home 
and work, of course. 

Marston Station baked in the af­
ternoon sunshine. Northeast and 
southwest the long line of rails 
winked and flashed to a disappear­
ing glimmer. Southward, beyond 
the limits of the little town, dun-
colored desert sand stretched on 
and on, simmering with heat and 
dotted sparsely with, the low, grey­
ed brush of the waterless lands. To 
the north and northwest lay a simi­
lar stertch, cut off obliquely by an 
abrupt line of hills. 

CONTINUED NEXT WEEK 

Mrs. Anna Armantrout and 
children spent Friday afternoon 
with Mi's. Laura Fugate and chil­
dren. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Townley 
and family spent Wednesday and 
Thursday with Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Gearheart and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Fleshner and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Howard Hunt 
and family spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Ryan and family of Ar­
thur. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Davis and Mr. 
and Mrs. Alva Edwards and Rose­
mary Edwards spent Sunday , in 
Lovington. 

Ruth. Armantrout is working in 
Mattoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Waverly Mathias 
and family spent Sunday in Shel-
byville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Gearheart and 
family spent Sunday in Taylorville 
with Mr. and Mrs. Joe Gearheart. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clay Davis and 
family spent Saturday evening 
with Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Dolan and 
family. 

Jean Newman who has been vis­
iting in Chicago for the past month 
has returned home. 

Lawyers, judges and justices have 
a lower tuberculosis death rate 
than persons in any other occupa­
tion, while porters in domestic and 
personal service have the highest, 
according to a study of social and 
economic influences in tuberculo­
sis prepared by the National Tu­
berculosis Association and releas­
ed in this state by the Illinois Tu-
beculosis Association. 

The study covers ten states in all 
sections of the country, selected 
as being typical of their district 
and because of the availability of 
data. Illinois is included in the sur­
vey. 

Occupations are divided into 
seven general classes. Professional 
men have the least tuberculosis, it 
is shown, with proprietors, manag­
ers and officials next. Then come 
agricultural workers and fore­
men; then semi-skilled workers, 
while unskilled workers were found 
to have the highest tuberculosis 
death rates. 

Paradoxically, physicians and 
surgeons have a higher rate than 
members of the law profession, 
real estate agents, or bankers, 
brokers and money lenders. 

The survey points out that high 
rates in many instances are the re­
sult of working and health condi­
tions in certain industries such as 
minings, stone cutting, and other 
dusty trades. On the other hand, 
there is a definite relation between 
social-economic conditions and tu­
berculosis, as the lowest rates are 
found in the highest social-econom­
ic classes, and vice versa. 

A problem in tuberculosis com-
trol is revealed by the study which 
shows that domestic servants 
cooks, and waiters have an excep­
tionally high tuberculosis death 
rate, being outranked by only one 
other class. This shows a source of 
infection exceptionally dangerous 
because of the close contact of ser­
vants with members of the family, 
and because of the possibility ot 
infected food handled by the cooks 
and waiters. 

Although tuberculosis ranks 7th 
as a cause of death among the gen­
eral population of the United 
States, it was the second leading 
cause of death among employed in 
the ten states studied. 

Lake City 
Maude Winings 

Will Baker attended a mail car­
riers convention at Belleville last 
week. 

Lake City beat Hammond in a 
soft ball game 33 to 13 Wednes­
day night. 

Miss Katheryn Adams was a 
caller in Sullivan Wednesday. 

S. R. Ward who is in St. Mary's 
hospital with a broken leg is get­
ting along nicely and will be able 
to come home in about a week. 

Mrs. Maude Beckham is on the 
sick list. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Lindsay 
of Decatur visited relatives here 
Sunday afternoon. 

L. S. Burcham was taken to St. 
Mary's hospital last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Burcham vis­
ited Sunday with Mrs. Tillie Bro-
hard. 

Miss Blossom Shields, Gloria 
Galbreath, June, Norma and Jackie 
Gould of Lovington visited Sunday 
afternoon at the T. F. Winings: 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shirey and 
T. T. Springer of near Macon vis­
ited relatives here Sunday even­
ing. 

Dr. Will Davidson of Decatur 
and Dr. Stevens of Dalton were 
professional callers here Sunday. 

Dick Sheek and Gerald Brohard 
of Cincinnati, visited recently with 
Mrs. Tillie Brohard. They were on 
their way for a vacation in the 
Ozark mountains. 

Jack Kirkwood visited with Will 
Auten and family near Pierson 
last week. 

UNION HALL DISTRICT 

—Thomas Pickle visited 
week with Dean Pickle near 
thur. 

last 
Ar-

John and Frank Vollmer and 
Ben Stocks attended the dance at 
Mahannahs Grove Saturday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Stocks and 
family visited with B. F. Fletcher 
and family Sunday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Denson and 
family were Decatur visitors Sun­
day. 

Mrs. Roy Denson was a Decatur 
caller Tuesday. 

Mrs. Mabel Weidner has purch­
ased a new Plymouth. 

Mr. and Mrs. Everett King and 
Mr. and Mrs. Sherman Kite spent 
Sunday in Decatur. 

Mrs. Beulah Denson and daugh­
ter Joyce are spending the week int 
Decatur with friends and rela­
tives. 

Many from this vicinity attend­
ed the fish fry at Dalton City on 
Friday night. 

Fred Denson and Arch Stocks 
were Decatur callers Thursday. 

Mrs. Beulah Denson and sister 
Luetta and A. E. Stocks were busi­
ness callers in Decatur Monday. 

-Is your subscription Paid? 

—Miss Norma Robertson ot 
Chicago, Illinois is here for an ex­
tended visit with Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Aldridge and other rela­
tives. 

Bryant Offers-
Free Touring Information 

If you are planning on a trip be sure to come in and see us, so 
that we can help you map out your route. We will be glad to 
do this and usually we can offer suggestions that will help you 

save money. 

Remember, that wherever you go—or wherever you stop that 
you will find a Chevrolet Dealer ready and anxious to serve you. 
We are part of this gigantic Service Organization that now ex­

tends from coast to coast. 

All Work Guaranteed 
We take pride in our Service Department. Nothing is left to 
guesswork or slip shod methods. Consequently, we are more 
than anxious to always have you pleased and satisfied when you 
have your work done at our place. If for any reason at all you 
are not always completely satisfied in every way, we want you 
to tell us about it. We are here to see that everything is right. 

Capitol Chevrolet Sales 
Where your service dollar buys the most. 

PHONE 107 SULLIVAN, ILLINOIS 

YOUR TAXES 
The 1 per cent penalty will be added to seeond installment after Aug. 1st 

After that date the penalty on the first unpaid installment will be Z%. 

After August 1st there will also be a 3% penalty on all unpaid Personal 
Property taxes. 

Bills for unpaid Personal Property Taxes will soon be put into hands of 
special collectors and this will mean an added expense. 

JOHN O. NEWBOULD 
County Collector 

r TREASURER'S OFFICE, SULLIVAN 
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BETHANY NEWS 
(By Jim Scott) 

Ben Standerfer of Strasburg is 
here visiting friends. 

Joe Williamson, who has been 
working in his father's office in the 
state fair department at Springfield 
is home for a short vacation. 

Miss Mary Patterson of Sullivan 
was a week end guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmer Mcllwain and Billy. 

Miss Anna Jane Scott and Fran­
cis Hogg visited friends in Cham­
paign last Thursday and Friday. 

Misses Faye Mallinson and 
Louise and Isabelle Purnell of Ma­
homet passed the week with the 
former's parents, Rev. and Mrs. B. 
D. Mallinson and family. Miss 
Mallinson is in Urbana attending 
summer school at the University 
of Illinois. 

Miss Mary Balch of Stewardson 
who teaches in a country school 
near here, is working in the Black 
and White cafe. 

Mrs. Margaret Sampley passed 
the week end in Decatur with her 
daughter, Mrs. R. F. Burke and 
family. 

Alec Mitchell In jured 
After recovering from a sprain 

ed ankle received in a softball 
game, Alec Mitchell, 20, was again 
painfully injured last Thursday 
while swimming with Jim Wilkin­
son in the Okaw river on his fath­
er's farm. Just as young Mitchell 
was about to complete a dive, Wil­
kinson's large German Police dog 
that had joined in the swim, leap­
ed up sinking his teeth in the div­
er's body. With Dr. Coffey out of 
town, Mitchell was rushed to Dr. 
Kilton of Sullivan. Seven stitches 
closed the wound, and Mitchell is 
now on the way to recovery. 

Mrs. Dicy Hendricks of Findlay, 
Miss Delia Hull and Dr. and Mrs. 
A. M. Cunningham were Friday 
guests of Mi\ and Mrs. Sam Book­
er of Lovington in their cabin at 
Woodland resort. ; 

S. B. Mott and Mr. and Mrs. 
Wm. Mott and son Billy of Chica­
go passed the wek end with Mr. and 
Mrs. T. A, Scott. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bert Lewis visited 
Saturday morning with Mr. and 
Mrs. Al Tailor and family of De­
catur and Saturday evening with 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lewis and fam­
ily of Villa Grove. Miss Katherine 
Trallor of 'Decatur accompanied 
them home for a short visit. 

Beer Draws Near 
Sleepy Dunn Station blinked its 

baggy eyelids last Saturday night 
and harked to one of the most riot­
ous celebrations since the village's 
conception. The occasion was the 
opening of a tiny beer tavern which 
is under the management of M. M. 
Garrett of Sullivan, a former Beth­
any section boss. Both the build­
ing and dance floor to the rear 
were not constructed until the day 
of the opening. Incidentally .the 
merrymakers were not slow in con­
suming a truckload of beer. 

PLAYGROUND PROJECTS; 
CCC BOYS ON THEIR WAY 

Scarlet Fever Death 
Valeria Ellen Sporleder, 16 

year old daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Omer Spoleder, died of scarlet fe­
ver in her home six miles noth of 
here Sunday morning. Graveside 
services were held in Bethany 
cemetery Tuesday with Rev. D. E 
Williams in charge. 

Her younger sister, Helen, is 
now critically ill with the disease 

The Mattoon pool offered refuge 
to Misses Mary Balch and Opal 
Dick -Monday night. 

No prostrations have been re­
corded in this sun-baked village, 
but the fiery temperatures did 
bring the death of a horse, owned 
and operated by Harry Patient. 

Mr. and Mrs. Smith Scott, Mrs. 
Hugh Scott, Betty Williamson and 
Marjorie Scott Sunday evening 
called on Dr. Augusta Scott, who 
is convelescing in the Decatur and 
Macon County hospital. 

The Junior Woman's club held a 
lawn party Tuesday afternoon at 
the home of Gwendolyn Daum. 

Pioneer—Sat . & Sun .—Pur i ty 
brick ice cream, 25c a qua r t . 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Niles of 
Shelbyville were Sunday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. George Swiney and 
family. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Schlesing-
er passed the week end in Belle­
ville with the former's parents. 

Mrs. Burr McMullin, son Wil-
lard and Junior Munch of Loving-
ton were Sunday guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmer Mcllwain. 

Marr iage Scoop 
Miss Lena Myers, 18, of Bruce 

and Dwain Atteberry, 19, of Dunn 
were married this Thursday after­
noon in Lovington by Rev. Floyd 
Bandy. They were accompanied by 
the groom?s mother^ Mrs. Birdie 
Atteberry of this place and Mrs. 
Bandy. Dinner was served in the 
Bandy home following the wed­
ding. The young couple will make 
their home in Dunn. 

Charles Roney was in Decatur 
Tuesday night attending a cream 
testers' meeting. 

These sultry days find Austin 
Wheeler of the Wheeler & Camp­
bell Co., one down on the Red 
Shirts and Black Shirts in that he 
wears none at all. However this 
doesn't surprise me nearly so much 
as Rev. O. E. Foster's brand new 
overgrown mustache. 

Mrs. George Reuss received a 
badly sprained wrist Tuesday when 
she fell trying to evade her hus­
band's car. Mr. Reuss had his auto­
mobile in reverse and was unaware 
of his wife's presence. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Cunning­
ham were callers here Tuesday. 

Mrs. W. E. Crowder and son 
William and family of Glendale. 
Calif., passed the week end in 
Springfield with Mr. and Mrs. Gwin 
Coffin and Mr. and Mrs. James De-
Bruler. 

Mary Taylor is home from De? 
troit where she has been visiting 

(Continued from page 1) 

vegetables are now ready for can­
ning. 

Drought Relief Checks 
Warrants for those who made 

applications for drought relief 
loans have been received at the re­
lief office, and letters have been 
sent to the seventeen farmers mak­
ing such applications, telling them 
that they may receive the warrants 
upon making definite arrangements 
to secure the necessary feed and 
seed. The warrants were received 
in th relief office on Tuesday, July 
24th. 

Cracking Down on Shirkers 
It has come to the attention of 

the relief committee that some em 
ployers in Moultrie county are \xnf-
der the impression that the com 
mittee and the relief office are in 
sisting that anyone who is on re 
lief be paid a high wage if hired 
for any type of work. This is not 
true. On the contrary, the present 
closing of cases was planned sc 
that those who have been refusing 
work would be forced to seek work 
and support their families in that 
way, at least until after harvest. 

Families that really are in need 
may reapply at the relief office, 
and have their cases reinvestigat­
ed. They do not need to go to su­
pervisors or other officials. They 
have been told this over and over, 
but the general public may not un­
derstand this. 

As a project of the C W A su­
pervised play will be held at Wy-
man park. Children of all ages will 
be welcomed. 

There will be ball games and 
soccor for both boys and girls over 
ten. years of age. For children 
younger than ten years there will 
be playground and supervised 
games. 

The supervisor is desirous for 
those over ten wishing to engage 
in these activities to register at the 
park either Friday afternoon or 
Satuday morning. The purpose of 
this is to get an estimate of the 
number of children wishing to play. 
Even though not registered, a child 
can play at any time. 

Next week a schedule of the su­
pervised activities for the different 
ages will be posted. 

Misses Dorothy Moore, Grace 
Morrison and Francis Hogg and (Mr. "and Mrs. Frank Bailey 
Jacob Harding were Mattoon] Fred Seibert has entered 
swimmers Sunday. 

Miss Jane Foster of Washington 
'is visiting Mr. and Mrs. Alva Arm­
strong and Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Freeland and family. 

Bill Davison of Monte Vista, 
Colo., returned Monday to the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Bus-
hert after a week in Sullivan as 
guest of Ebby Scheer. 

The congregation of St. Isa-
dore's church, three miles north of 
here, will hold its 27th annual 
chicken. fry on the church lawn 
this Sunday. Serving will begin at 
11:30 a. m. and again at 4:30 p. 
m. Music will be furnished by a 
legion orchestra from Decatur. 

The following lads are camping 
along the Okaw river near Find-
lay: Joe Ekiss, Harold Jones, Har­
old Younger and Seth Low. 

Calvin Davis Dies 
Funeral services for Calvin Mari­

a n Davis, 81, who died in his home 
south of here Saturday, were con­
ducted by Rev. W. B. Hopper in 
the Christian church here Monday 
afternoon. He had been seriously 
ill for the past eight weeks with 
uremic poisoning. Burial was in 
the local cemetery. 

Pallbearers—Marvin Davis, Wil-
mer Marshall, Delmar Marshall; 
Howard Marshall, Earl Brown, 
Melvin Nedden (Sullivan). 

Flower Girls—Dolores Homer, 
Vera Davis, Lulu Davis, Helen 
Marshall, Diamond Brown, Hazel 
Clark, Mary Taylor and Mrs. Mary 
Mashall. 

Singers—Mrs| C. O. Tohill, Mrs. 
Coy Brown, J. M. Hogg and W. A. 
DeBruler 

Pianist—Miss Opal Younger. 
Born in Boons county, Ind., Mr. 

Davis has passed most of his life 
here. He leaves his widow, Anna; 
12 children: Irvin and Walter Da­
vis of Garden Grove, Iowa, Mrs. 
Carrie Arnold of Tampa, Fla., Mrs. 
Delia Clark of Springfield, Mrs. 
Freda Vandeveer, Filson, Mrs. Cleo 
Homer, Chicago, Calvin Davis, Jr., 
Sullivan and Mrs. Rosa Marshall, 
Mrs. Flossie Sanner, OUis Davis, 
Virgil Davis and Miss Zera Davis, 
all of Bethany; a sister, Mrs. Jose­
phine McReynolds, Kansas, one 
step-daughter, 31 grandchildren 
and five great grandchildren. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Martin and 
pretty daughter, whose name we 
failed to ascertain, of Sullivan 
were business callers here Tues­
day. Mr. Martin, the new grade 
school principal, rented the Mulli-

: nix property from Miss Delia Hull 
and the family will move here the 
middle of August. 

Walter Scott, Mrs. Helen Sharp 
and their party from Birmingham, 
Ala., en route home from World's 
Fair were here for a while Monday 
morning. Kent Williamson Jr., ac­
companied them home for a visit 
with the former. 

$10 is just 1 of 10 prizes award­
ed at St. Isadore's church Sun. 

the 

Merritt 
Mrs. Ross Thomas 

new Veterans hospital for disabled 
soldiers located near Ft. Leaven­
worth, Kansas. 

Mrs. Mildred Armstrong of Blue 
Mound and Mrs. C. S. Huffman and 
John Smith of Macon were visit­
ors here Sunday. 

Misses Julia Scott and Ida Sha­
piro, summer school students at the 
University of Illinois, and Kath­
leen Smith of Abingdon, visited the 
former's relatives Saturday night. 

Mrs. Maudell Floski is in Chica­
go attending the World's Fair. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bliss Schwartz 
and family were Sunday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Art Ashbrook and 
family of near Sullivan. 

Black and Whi te cafe—Roszell 's 
Ice Cream Given Away Each Sat­
u rday ni te a t 9 :30 . 

Bill Pruett and Leroy Ward 
thumbed up to Harristown Monday 
for a visit with their former prin­
cipal, J. E. Hursh. 

Bob Swiney was a week end vis­
itor in Shelbyville. 

Jacob Keim Dies 
Jacob Keim, 80, well to do re­

tired monument dealer, died in his 
home here Monday morning of 
general debility relative to old age. 
Rev. Raymond McCallister of Ar­
eola was in charge of the funeral 
services held Wednesday morning 
in the Christian church. Interment 
was in the Bethany cemetery. 

He leaves his widow, Alice and 
a brother Nick Keim of Findlay. 

Pupils of Miss Helen Wilkin­
son's Monticello dancing class are 
presenting a recital at that place 
this Thursday evening. 

Mrs. George L. Weinback of 
San Diego, Calif., will arrive to­
day, Thursday, for a visit with her 
sister, Mrs. O. E. Foster and fam­
ily and her mother, Mrs. Sarah 
Burrucker who is visiting in the 
Foster home. 

Atten t ion Teachers ! 
Just between you and me there 

may be an opening for some peda­
gogue at the American school this 
fall or again the district may send 
its 16 students back to the Bethany 
Grade school. Several of the farm­
ers are bitterly opposed to the lat­
ter move, and a school board elec­
tion will be held in a few days to 
decide the issue. The new mem­
bers will be elected to fill the va­
cancies caused when George Bone 
resigned and H. S. Reedy moved 
to Sullivan. 

Mr. and Mrs. I. A. Snyder and 
Mr. and Mrs. Harry D. Shelton of 
Decatur were Sunday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Snyder. 

Bethany's revamped softball 
ten jolted Moweaqua, 6 to 3 here 
last Friday night. 

George and Bob Swiney and Joe 
Roney and their respective famil­
ies were Wednesday evening pic­
nickers in Shelbyville. 

Hollis Dick, Ralph Nuttall and 
Troy Scott lolled Sunday after­
noon in the waters oft;*he Mattoon 
bathing establishment. 

Landers reunion will be held on 
Sunday, July 29th in Wyman park 
in Sullivan. All relatives and 
friends are invited. 

Mrs. Ross Thomas entertained 
the Social Helpers class of Chris­
tian Church of Arthur at her home 
west of Cadwell Wednesday to a 
pot luck dinner. There were fifty-
one present. 

Mrs. Lyman Maxwell spent Fri­
day afternoon with Mrs. James 
Pound. 

Mrs. Clifford Davis, daughter 
and son and Mrs. Ross Thomas and 
son, Alice Ilene Landers, Wilda 
Vee Landers, Maxine Yaw spent 
Thursday afternoon and evening 
in Lytle park J n Mattoon. 

Mrs. Phoebe Hill of Peoria who 
spent two weeks with Mrs. Henry 
Pickle returned to her home Sun­
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Reuben Bilbrey 
spent Friday evening with Mr. and 
Mrs. John Daum. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Jenne spent 
Friday evening with Mr. and Mr3. 
Edd Durr. 

Mrs. Victor Landers and sons 
Mrs. Raymond Shasteen and sons 
Mrs. Carrie Landers and Ms. Anna 
Shasteen spent Thursday after­
noon in Mattoon. 

Mrs. Reuben Bilbrey spent Sat­
urday afternoon with Mrs. Ross 
Thomas. 

Mrs. James Vandeyeer is spend­
ing the week with her daughter 
Mrs. James Landers. 

Mrs. Grace McGuire and son of 
Iowa, Mr. and Mrs. Harold Barr 
of Mattoon spent the week end 
with Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Milam. 

Mr. aand Mrs. Omie Baker spent 
Sunday evening with Mr. and Mrs. 
Archie Daugherty. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Pickle and 
son visited relatives in Bloomington 
Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Davis and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. James Land­
ers and family, Mrs. Stella Harris, 
Mrs. James Vandeveer called on 
Mr. and Mrs. Ross Thomas Sunday 
evening. 

Waggoner 
Mrs. George King 

Edward and Argel Allen return 
ed to their home in Pekin after 
several weeks visit with relatives 
here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Francis Bragg and 
son spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. George King and daughter, 

Albert King and children of 
Sullivan are spending the week 
with Mr. and Mrs. Joseph King. 

Mrs. Martha Harvey went to 
Kentucky Saturday to visit with 
relatives. 

Claude Lane and family spent 
Friday evening with Mr. and Mrs. 
John Allen. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. J. King of 
Quigley and Oil Rawlings of Tow 
er Hill spent Saturday with Joseph 
King and family. 

Frances and Bill. Critser spent 
Thursday afternoon with Grace 
King. 

Mrs. MonnaKing and • Anita 
Joyce attended a birthday party 
for Dean Tull Friday afternoon 

—Miss Cora Gauger returned on 
Monday from Chicago. 

A Silent Movie by A. B. Chapin 

lights of NewYork 
Mt I. L STEVENSON 

s Gone Byrnes was telling of the 
golf professional at a mountain 
summer resort who charged $10 an 
hour for. lessons.. His rule was 
that at the first lesson, the pupil 
bring his clubs along so that he 
might. inspect, them. He'd begin 
with the driver, look at it long and 
earnestly and .finally announce that 
it was fit only for the junk heap. 
"But I'll sell yon a good one," he'd 
add., Then he'd pick up the brassy 
and "'; after. ; due deliberation an­
nounce that it was worth nothing 
a ta l£ but that he'd see that his pu-
pi\ would ge^ one with which shots 
could be mad^ So he would go 
through the entire bag, giving each 
club.the most, careful examination 
and condemning them all. "In other 
words/' continued Byrnes, "he'd 
take an hour and ten minutes to 
sell, the pupil a, new set of clubs. 
But; he never made any charge for 
thej extra ten, minutes." ,.,-.•, 

Then Grantland Rice came for­
ward with the story of the profes­
sional down South. That particular 
pro's system was to Inform his pu­
pils that the way to learn to play 
golf was to observe an expert make 
shots and then,try to imitate him. 
Putting his,pupil in a comfortable 
chair, he would start by making 
drives. He'd; allow the pupil a 
shot or two^but would get in a 
good hour's practice for which he 
was well paid. That continued for 
two seasons. Then the squawks 
became so numerous that the pro 
finally lost his job. . 

* . ' • • ' * 

Some way or other, I can't* seem 
to put out of my mind this ad from 
the "Public Notices" column of the 
Herald-Tribune: "Man for sale, 
$950 cash; full two-year servitude; 
cultured. Christian, unincumbered, 
forty-seven; drive, nurse, garden­
er, housework, anything, anywhere." 

* • * 
In the Belvedere Towers meteoro­

logical observatory in Central park 
is a thermometer with the mercury 
tube painted black, while the ther­
mometer itself Is suspended In a 
vacuum tube. It is used for de­
termining the full burning effect of 
the sun, the; black paint absorbing 
the rays and the vacuum minimiz­
ing the cooling effect of breezes. 
Fortunately for all of us, human 
beings, so I was told, never get the 
full effect of the sun, the body be­
ing cooled by breezes and by the 
evaporation of perspiration. But 
the last time I looked at that black 
bulb thermometer, it showed 142 
degrees and though perspiring free­
ly, I felt even hotter than that 

* * * 
Writes F. B. . S. from Chicago: 

"While Fifth avenue may be the 
showcase ofv the world, Broadway 
is the show-off of the world." 

*. * * 
A well-known short-story writer 

—nameless here at his own request 
—is still puzzling over a happening 
of a week ago With the dead line 
for a story only a week ahead, he 
found himself as' barren as a clay 
pit, and the more he searched for a 
suitable plot, the more hopeless his 
plight seemed to become. Wornout, 
he went to bed sometime after mid­
night only to be awakened an hour 
or so later by a dream so vivid that 
he sprang out of bed and stumbled 
Into his study*" Fearing details 
would escape him, he began to type 
notes hurriedly., .. 

•... • . • 
Just as he had .finished, hi* wife, 

aroused by the typewriter, came in 
to see why .he was working at such 

an hour. He had dreamed a plot, 
he told her, exactly fitting his 
needs, even the characters being 
clear and distinct. With a thrill 
of excitement, he outlined it to her. 
When he had concluded, she looked 
at him strangely. Then she asked 
him if he had read a magazine that 
had come in the mail the day be­
fore. He replied that he had been 
too busy, to even look at it. "That's 
queer," said his wife. "You've out­
lined to me the story I read in 
that magazine before I dropped off 
to sleep." 

• * * 
Subway conversational bit: "He 

ain't nothin' but a big cheap skate. 
I offered to pick up the check last 
night and he let me." 

©, 1I1S. Bell Syndicate.—WNU Servtca. 

Dead Horse for Live One 
Courtland.Kan.—Funny things hap­

pen "way out West in Kansas." A 
farmer traded a live horse for a 
dead one. One had lost three horses 
and was unable to purchase more. 
A neighbor Insisted on giving him a 
live one and then took his team to 
haul the carcass of the dead horse 
away. 

Girl Kept Chained 
, Eight Years in Tank 

Rosario, Argentina.—Police re­
ported Aurelia Boniporte, twen­
ty-two, who had been discovered 
chained inside an iron tank. She 
was in an emaciated, speechless 
condition. 

Juan Guyoma was arrested. 
He was quoted by the police as 
saying he was a rejected suitor 
of the girl and that he had kid­
naped her eight years ago, keep­
ing her a chained prisoner in the 
tank all that time. 

BETHANY 
Rev. and Mrs. Floyd Bandy of 

Lovington were Sunday guests of 
Mrs. Birdie Atteberry and family. 

Attorneys John R. Fitzgerald 
and Emanuel Rosenberg of Deca­
tur were visitors here Tuesday. 

—Mrs. Jasper Dyer and chil­
dren of near Lovington spent Mon­
day visiting at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Wade Robertson. Mrs. 
Dyer was formerly Hattibel Bil­
brey of this city. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Boone 
of Woodstock, Texas, Aline and 
H. D. Jones of Woodstock visited 
over the week end with Misses 
Myrtle and Lucy Dunscomb. 

—The offices of Dr. J. F. Law-
son are being redecorated. 

Forest Hill 
Mrs. L. C. Porter 

Mr. and Mrs. J. N. Foster spent 
Friday in Decatur. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Evans and 
son Raymond of Decatur and Mr. 
and Mrs. Glenn Evans spent Sun­
day evening with Mr. and Mrs. Jas. 
Leach and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Francis and 
family were Decatur visitors Fri­
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Luther Watson of 
Jonathan Creek called on Mr. and 
Mrs. Lowell Porter and family on 
Sunday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Brobks 
spent Saturday in Springfield. 

The farmers are threshing oats 
and putting up hay in this neigh­
borhood. 

Ivan Porter is getting along 
fairly well with mumps and ma­
laria fever. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Francis and 
family spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Jones and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Porter and 
Robert Leach called on Mr. and 
Ms. James Leach and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Lowell Porter and 
family Friday. 

Several from here attended the 
funeral of Albert Newlan Wednes­
day. 

Bruce 
Mrs. Fred Sampson 

Miss Ruth Kinsel was on the sick 
list the fir3t of the week. 

Joe Basham and daughter Merle 
were Sullivan callers Saturday. 

C. W. Darst and son Oil and An­
drew McDaniel moved their saw­
mill outfit Monday to Mr. Darst's 
farm. 

David Kirkendoll and John and 
Dick DeHart were among those to 
attend a ball game in Decatur on 
Monday night. 

John Sharp spent Tuesday at 
Sullivan with his daughter Mrs. 
Fred Sampson and family. 

Several from here attended the 
funeral of J. Curtis Dawdy. 

Mrs. Bart Tull spent Sunday af­
ternoon with Mrs. Essie Darst. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Bragg and 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Bragg spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Bragg. 

Mrs. Fred Sampson and daugh­
ters attended a birthday party for 
Dean Tull of Allenville Friday af­
ternoon. 

John Reed and Chester Ledbet-
ter were Sullivan callers Tuesday. 

William Kinsel was called to 
Webster City, Iowa to pitch ball. 
He left Saturday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Abbott called 
on Mr. and Mrs. A. D. Sharp Sun­
day afternoon. 

Cushman 
Ruth Martin 

Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Myers and 
family and Mrs. Ray Taylor and 
family spent Wednesday in Deca­
tur. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Queen 
and Billie spent Tuesday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Harve Sharp at Bethany. 

Mrs. Paul Smith and daughters 
were Decatur callers Thursday. 

Marjorie Hamblin. visited with 
Olive Jane Gaddis this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. C. Reynolds 
and Clema, Mr. and Mrs. Ed Hamb­
lin and Donald and Ruth Martin 
called on Mr. and Mrs. Emmerson 
Hall and family Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Martin and 
family spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. H. M. Myers. 

Vern Switzer spent the week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Myers 
and family. 

—Mr. and Mrs. Tom Howe and 
daughter of Shelbyville visited the 
first of the week with Grandma 
Blystone. Mr. Howe was formerly 
a school teacher near Sullivan 
many years ago. 

G e o r g e A . R o n e y 
OPTOMETRIST 
Eyes Examined 
Glasses Fitted 

Offices — Upstairs above 
shoe store. 

Phone 57 Sullivan, III. 

M o n e y to dean Up 
Old Bills 

Will a cash 
loan help 
refinance 

your debts? 

Then consider the Household 
Loan Plan. Loans of $30 to $300 
are available to families keeping 
house, who have sufficient income 
to make regular monthly repay-
ments over 20 months. Only sig­
natures required are those of hus-

bandandwife. Quick, courteous, businesslikeservice. 
Reasonable cost. Visit, write, or 'phone the offices of 

Household Finance Corporation 
4th Floor, Citiaens Building, 250 North 

Water Street, Decatur. Phones 5177. 

Lomn* mod* in turrounding town* 
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GRAND 
—- SULLIVAN — 

Bargains in Amusement 
Where Everybody Goes 

FRIDAY, JULY 27TH 

Double Show Nite 
Two Big Features 

One Admission Price 
Show Starts 7:00. Come by 

8:30 to see both features 
HIT NO 1 

Stars! Girls! Music! 
With 

HOLLYWOOD 
PARTY 

Laurel ft Hardy, Jack Pearl, 
Lupe Velez, a host of others. 

HIT NO 2 
CARY GRANT, GENE­

VIEVE TOBIN i n \ 

KISS AND 
MAKEUP 

Beauty Shop Romance 
Also Travelaugh 

Prices 10c ft 2&xL:,_J. . 

• — - ->v ;.'. ? 

SATURDAY, JULY 28TH / 
WARNER OLAND in 

Charlie 
Chan's 

Courage 
Most Exciting "Chan" Story 

Also 
Musical Comedy, Cartoon 

Serial 
Matinee 2:30 — Nite con­

tinuous from 7:00. 
Prices 10c & 15c 

Matinee Kiddies 5c 

SUN., MON., JULY 29-30 
Con. Sunday from 3:00 
Wagon Loads of Fun! 

WHEELER & WOOSEY 
with Thelma Todd, Dorothy 

Lee in 

COCKEYED 
CAVALIERS 

Gay Music, Merry Maidens, 
Laughs Galore. 

I Also 
I Good Comedy, Cartoon, News 
I Adults 25c; Children 10c 

• TUESDAY, JULY 31 ST 
| "DIME NITE" 
1 Continuous from 5:30 
I RANDOLPH SCOTT, 
| BUSTER PHELPS in 

I Broken 
I Dreams 
I Gripping Romance, Heart 

Stirring 
Also 

Shirley Temple Comedy 
Travelogue 

ANY SEAT 10c 

WED., THURS., AUG. 1-2 
IRENE DUNNE, RICHARD 

DIX in 

STINGAREE 
Two Great Stars in Rash 

Romance. 
Also 

Century of Progress 
Exclusive Scenes of T h i s 

World Event 
Betty Boop, News 
Prices 10c ft 25c 


